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Addendum #1 Yes or No YES YES YES
Addendum #2  Yes or No YES YES YES
Addnedum #3  Yes or No YES YES YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
LOT 1
1. Hesco, Unipak-20 Yard Trash 
Compactor as specified with keyed 
operation, gauges, switches, etc.                 
Or Better                                                                               
Alt Mfg_____                                                                          
Model #_____                                                          
Total Price $_____

No Bid
GALBREATH                

#0SC-2            
$13254.50

SANITECH       
#ST10400/30     OR 
#SC1040/30    SEE 

ATTACHED

2. Hesco, Unipak-30 Yard Trash 
Compactor as specified with keyed 
operation, gauges, switches, etc.                 
Or Better                                                                               
Alt Mfg_____                                                                          
Model #_____                                                          
Total Price $_____

No Bid
GALBREATH                

#0SC-2            
$13508.00

SANITECH       
#ST10400/30     OR 
#SC1040/30    SEE 

ATTACHED

3. Electric Spray Deodorizer System "Mist-
Stick" kit Or Equal, attach specifications, 
Ozone Unit Not Acceptable                                                 
Alternate Mfg:_______                                                                        
Total Price $_____

No Bid EXCEPTION  *
AUTOKOM           #MK111                

$1,189.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

4. Odor Digester Chemical for "Mist-Stick" 
(3-5 gallon containers) Or Equal attach 
MSDS sheets                                  
Alternate Mfg._______                                                    
Qty 3_____Gallon Pails                                     
Total Price $_____

No Bid EXCEPTION  *
 $306.50  ECOLOO     

AIRSOLUTION/ODOR 
BLAST  $306.50  $919.50        

5. Provide Product information on the 
following: No Bid EXCEPTION  *

A.  Hydraulic Motor _____HP (Minimum 
10 HP) No Bid 15 HP N/A

B. Pump _____GPM@_____RPM 
(Minimum 9 GPM) No Bid 13 GPM @ 1800 ROM N/A

C. Reservoir Capacity _____Gal No Bid 22 GALLON N/A

D. Guides (min 9" Foot) _____Ft 
No Bid 12 FOOT 9 FOOT,           15 FOOT

E. Electrical _____ Amp. 
_____Voltage_____Phase No Bid

50 AMP 208/230/460 
VOLT 3 PHASE

VARIES   208\480                          
3 PHASE

F. Container Floor & Wall Construction 
_____Gauge No Bid 7 GAUGE 7 GAUGE

G. Container Top Construction 
_____Gauge No Bid 10 GAUGE 7 GAUGE

H. Container Colors Available (attach 
sample paint colors available) No Bid SEE ATTCHED

I. Container Warranty _____Years
No Bid 3 YEARS 3 YEARS

Page 2 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

J. Electrical /Hydraulic Warranty 
_____Years No Bid 1 YEAR ELECTRICAL 2 YEAR

6. Delivery to Location or 3rd Party to off 
load and deliver to location                                          
Total Price $_____ No Bid INCLUDED

$1,690.00 TO $2,760.00 
DEPENDS ON UNIT 

ORDERED

7. Options Available: No Bid

A. Remote Control On/Off Switch                                             
Total Price $_____ No Bid STANDARD

$424.00   PENDANT 
REMOTE WITH FULL 

CONTROLS

B. Photo-eye Cycle Control                                              
Total Price $_____ No Bid $662.25 $930.00

C. 2-Yard rolling Container with Integral 
Dumper and Hopper                                                                            
Total Price $_____

No Bid $612.00 $11,445.00

D. 90 Gallon Cart w/wheels with Grab-Arm 
Dumping mechanism on Compactor          
Total Price$_____

No Bid $5,408.00 $6,789.00

E. Option__________                                                
Total Price $_____ SIDE LOADING ARM  

SAME
TWO YARD CART WITH 

TON PACKAGE    $1,055.00

F. Option__________                                                
Total Price $_____ FRONT LOADING ARM            

SAME
TWO YARD LEACH BAR 

CART DUMPER   $8,667.00

G. Option__________                                                
Total Price $_____

END FED HOPPER FOR 2 
YARD DUMPER     

$1,723.00

Page 3 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

H. Option__________                                                
Total Price $_____ SIDE FED HOPPER FOR 2 

YARD DUMPER     $974.00

8. Hopper Configurations: (attach photos 
along with any additional information 
needed)
A. Closed Hopper with 1 side door                               
Total Price $_____ $494.00 $1,128.00

B. Closed Hopper with 2 side doors                          
Total Price $_____ $552.00 $1,628.00

C. Closed Hopper with 1 side door & chute 
opening                                                              
Total Price $_____

$622.00 $2,206.00

D. Hopper for container dumper with 1 
side door                                                                       
Total Price $_____

$700.00 $1,343.00

E. Hopper for cart dumper with 1 side 
door                                                                             
Total Price $_____

$650.00
SIDE FED               
$1,474.00

 __________  Total Price $_____
HOPPER FOR CART 

DUMPER WITH 1 SIDE 
DOOR END FED    

$2,223.00

__________  Total Price $_____

9. List Various Door Options Available: 

A. Side Door swings out                                              
Total Price $_____ STANDARD (HAS GATE) NO CHARGE

Page 4 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

B. Door slides back along a track                              
Total Price $_____ $250.00

WE USE BI-FOLD DOOR 
STANDARD   N/A

__________  Total Price $_____

__________  Total Price $_____

__________  Total Price $_____

10. Delivery after Receipt of Purchase 
Order                                                                              
_____ Days

30 DAYS 30-45 DAYS

11. Balance of Product Line Discount 
Available (circle one)                                           
Yes/No

YES, 20% O

12. Supply Catalog or list of Options with 
Prices YES YES

MANUFACTURER                               
Collusion or Fraud form signed? YES YES

LOT 2-INSTALLATION
(Installation requirements, see section 
4.06 on pages 23 & 24) No Bid

13. Turnkey Installation using "In-House" 
employees                                                           
Unit Price $_____

14. Turnkey Installation using your Sub-
Contractor                                                                   
Unit Price  $_____

$750.00 $1,400.00

Page 5 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

Sub-contractor's Information:                         
Name _________________                                                            
Address _______________                                                          
City, State, Zip __________                                               
Phone _________________                                                            
Fax ___________________                                                                   
Years in Business _________

SEE BID SEE BID

15. Turnkey Installation using a 3rd party 
Contractor                                                        
Unit Price $_____

N/A

Contractor's Information:                         
Name _________________                                                            
Address _______________                                                          
City, State, Zip __________                                               
Phone _________________                                                            
Fax ___________________                                                                   
Years in Business _________

INSTALLATION CONTRACTOR                               
Collusion or Fraud form signed? YES YES

LOT 3-MAINTENANCE & SERVICE

16. Once per year-Maintenance/Service, 
include all labor and materials to complete 
the following:                                                
Total Price $_____

$192.00 $422.00 $330.00

A.  Change Oil N/A

B. Clean tank and suction liner filter N/A

C. Change oil filer (if present) N/A

Page 6 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

D. Grease all fittings on compactor and 
power unit

E. Lubricate latch and hopper door hinges

F. Lubricate ram and change box N/A

G. Lubricate ram wiper N/A

H. Training for Staff as needed

Annual Maintenance/Service to be 
performed in October 2004

17. Twice per year-Inspection to identify 
unsafe conditions, worn components or 
poor operational performance, Training for 
staff as needed.                                                    
Total Price $______       

$105.00 $175.00 $660.00    ($330.00 EACH)  

Inspections to be performed in January 
2005 and June 2005

18. Emergency Service Calls "Trip 
Charge" (Equipment Not Under Warranty)                                                                             
Total Price $_____ $52.50 $170.00 SEE LINE         20 & 21

19. Discount %  Off Parts                                                 
_____% 0.00 0.00

20. Hourly rate for Labor (Mon-Fri, 8:00-
5:00)                                                                      
Total Price $_____/Hr

$52.50 $62.00
$60.00 HOUR TRAVEL    

$50.00 AN HOUR LABOR

21. Hourly Rate for Labor (After Hours, 
Weekends & Holidays)                                                  
Total Price $_____/Hr

$52.50 $93.00
$90.00 HOUR TRAVEL  

$75.00 LABOR

Page 7 of 8
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-010 LK                    
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  08/31/04@2:00 PM                                             
PURCH & INST SELF-CONT TRASH 
COMPACTORS
READ BY:   Linda Ciraldo               
RECORDED BY:   Cheryl Jessee        

22. Are you able to Re-Build or Re-
Furbish compactors                                                      
Yes/No

YES YES YES

23. Service Provider Information:                         
Name _________________                                                            
Address _______________                                                          
City, State, Zip __________                                               
Phone _________________                                                            
Fax ___________________                                                                   
Cell Phone ______________

SEE BID SEE BID SEE BID

24. 5 Gallon pail of Odor Digester Or 
Equal        _____Gallon Pail                                                
Total Price $_____

$25.00 25 LITER PAIL $306.50

MAINTENANCE/SERVICE PROVIDER                                                                   
Collusion or Fraud form signed? YES YES YES
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