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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES
Questionnaire  Yes or No YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
LOT 1-PARTS
1. Silent Knight Board #5495BO                                       
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                         
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $220.00                 
$220.00

$251.86                
$251.86

2. Silent Knight Alarm #SK5495                                                                         
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                             
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

ESTBPS-6             
$312.86

$283.00         
$283.00

$323.71               
$323.71

3. Pull Station Simplex #4099-9001 "ONLY"                                                                              
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                       
Qty-6                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$100.00           
$600.00

$150.00                  
$900.00

4. Zams Monitor Simplex #4090-9101 
"ONLY"                                                                                               
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                
Qty-11                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $168.30                 
$1851.30

$250.40               
$2754.40

5. I.A. Module Simplex #4090-9001 "ONLY"                                                                                                    
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                          
Qty-11                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $96.30               
$1,059.30

$143.25             
$1,575.75

6. Base for Detector #4098-9792                                                       
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                       
Qty-12                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $89.00          
$1,068.00

$132.55            
$1590.60

Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee
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Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

7. Heat Detector Simplex #4098-9733                                                  
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                            
Qty-9                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$37.80             

$340.20
$61.30               

$551.70

8. 4009 NAC Board Simplex #565-569                                                                                                                                               
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                     
Qty-6                                                                                                           
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$161.00            
$966.00

$241.00           
$1446.00

9. Duct Detector Board w/o Relay #565-653                                                                                             
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                       
Qty-2                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$65.00              

$130.00
$88.00               

$176.00

10. Panel 4009 Add. Board #8742-346                                                     
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                    
Qty-3                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $546.30               
$1638.90

$843.50              
$2530.50

11. Power Supply Simplex #8636-341 
"ONLY"                                                                                                              
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                 
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$985.50              
$985.50

$1396.60               
$1396.60

12. Battery 8 amp. Hours 12 Volt                                                                        
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                           
Qty-120                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

Intersate    
$10.28 ea.       
$1,233.60

#2081-9274                  
$15.50                 

$1,860.00

ELK 12V8AH              
$15.00              

$1800.00

13. Duct Detector Base w/o Relay #677-201                                                                                                  
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                    
Qty-2                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $57.60                  
$115.20

$81.80               
$163.60
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Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

14. Map Net Transceiver #565-241                                                   
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                             
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $866.70                
$866.70

$1228.30                  
$1228.30

15. Power Interface Board #565-265                                              
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $135.00              
$135.00

$199.35              
$199.35

16. Smoke Detector Heads                                                                     
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                             
Qty-16                                                                                    
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
#4098-9714               

$69.00                       
$1104.00

HOCHIKI                    
#SLR-24                   
$36.72               
$587.52

17. Power Supply 4010 Board #565-792                                                                                                
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                       
Qty-3                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $136.80                
$410.40

$212.20                
$636.60

18. Duct Detector Board w/Relay #565-654                                                                                                          
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                                          
Qty-11                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $94.50                   
$1,039.50

$134.50              
$1479.50

19. Standard Slave Board w/Relay #565-368                                                                                             
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                                           
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$680.00               
$680.00

$1051.50                
$1051.50

20. Surge Protector #TSP-8601                                                             
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-18                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$24.00                

$432.00

DITEK  
DTK4lVPLV            

$54.00           
$972.00
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Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

21. Duct Detector Base w/Relay #677-202                                                                                                    
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-8                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____                                                                                   

NO BID $67.00                    
$536.00

$102.85                  
$822.80

22. 4009 NAC Power Supply #565-593                                                                                                         
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-3                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$385.20             

$1155.60
$565.05              

$1695.15

23. Smoke Detectors #4098-9601                                                    
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-19                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $74.70                  
$1419.30

$121.15                
$2301.85

24. Smoke Detector Base #4098-9788                                        
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-23                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $12.00              
$276.00

$18.45            
$424.35

25. 4010 CPU Board #8742-267                                                                 
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-5                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$1,071.00                     
$5,355.00

$1626.90                
$8134.50

26. Battery 12 Volt 33 Amp. Hour                                                                   
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-4                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

$55.35                 
$221.40

#2081-9276                     
$192.00                
$768.00

ELK 12V33AH-
L    $113.80                

$455.20

27. Q-Photo Addressable #10-4098-9757                                                                                                                    
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-4                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $104.40                    
$417.60

$171.40                  
$685.60
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Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

28. W/L Horn Strobe #NS-241575W-FR                                                                                                      
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-94                                                                                    
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

EST GIR-
HDUM        
$40.89                       

$3,843.80

$31.00                 
$2914.00

$49.39                
$4642.66

29. Edwards Heat Detector #281B-PL                                                                 
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-53                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

$8.76                  
$464.28

$12.70                  
$673.10

$11.50                   
$609.50

30. Baffle for Duct Detector Simplex #631-
114 "ONLY"                                                                                             
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-12                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $3.60                            
$43.20

$5.00              
$60.00

31. Remote Test Simplex #2098-9806 
"ONLY"                                                                                               
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-2                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID $49.50                  
$99.00

$80.35                 
$160.70

32. Remote Strobe #RSS-24MCW-FR                                                 
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-29                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

EST GIR-UM                   
$31.14                   

$903.06

$25.70                   
$745.30

$38.16                   
$1106.64

33. Simplex Box #2975-9009 "ONLY"                                              
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID N/A Discontinued 
No Replacement

No Longer 
Available No 
Replacement

34. Edwards Fire Alarm #270-SPO                                                                     
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-22                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

$17.52                         
$385.44

$26.30                     
$578.60

$24.84             
$546.48



**
 L

ot
 #

2 
as

 a
n 

A
lte

rn
at

e 
V

en
do

r 
   

 
C

om
m

er
ci

al
 S

ys
te

m
s 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

17
5 

S
em

or
an

 C
om

m
er

ce
 P

l  
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
A

po
pk

a,
 F

L 
32

70
3

**
 L

ot
 #

1 
"A

ll 
or

 N
on

e"
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

&
 L

ot
 #

2 
as

 a
n 

A
lte

rn
at

e 
V

en
do

r 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

S
im

pl
ex

 G
rin

ne
ll 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

37
01

 N
 J

oh
n 

Y
ou

ng
 P

kw
y 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
O

rla
nd

o 
FL

 3
28

04

**
 L

ot
 #

2 
as

 th
e 

P
rim

ar
y 

V
en

do
r 

   
  

S
ite

 S
ec

ur
e 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

62
7 

P
ro

gr
es

s 
W

ay
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
S

an
fo

rd
 F

L 
32

77
1

Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

35. Simplex Plate #4905-9903 "ONLY"                                       
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$5.00                     
$5.00

$8.05                  
$8.50

36. Simplex Horn #4901-9822 "ONLY"                                      
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$40.50                 
$40.50

$65.60               
$65.60

37. Simplex Smoke Base #2098-9211 
"ONLY"                                                                                                
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$12.00                      
$12.00

No Longer 
Available No 
Replacement

38. Simplex Duct House #2098-9649 "ONLY"                                                                                                  
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-3                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID

New Part Number 
#4098-9686             

$234.00               
$702.00

No Longer 
Available No 
Replacement

39. Simplex 49 Tube "ONLY"                                                         
Mfg._____ Model _____                                                                                                        
Qty-1                                                                                     
Cost Per Each $_____                                                                 
Extended Cost $_____

NO BID
$20.00               
$20.00

$33.50                
$33.50

40. TOTAL EXTENDED COST                                      
$_____ $7,051.58 $31,545.20 $43,368.52
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Lot #1 - Award as"All or None" 
to Simplex Grinnell                          

Lot #2 Award to Primary & 
Alternate Vendors                                                                                                                                                                                                 

Primary Vendor - Site Secure &  
Alternate Vendors are 

Commercial Systems & Simplex 
Grinnell

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-052 CJ                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  01/18/05@2:00 PM                                           
FIRE ALARM PARTS & INST.
READ BY:Anjel Ausherman
RECORDED BY:Cheryl Jessee

41. Minimum Order Dollar Amount                                              
$_____ $50.00 None 0.01

42. Balance of Product Line Discount of List.   
_____% 35% None 15%

LOT 2 INSTALLATION & SERVICE 

43. Total Turn-key Price for Fire Alarm 
Equipment Installed in a "Wet" Portable           
$_____

$2,500.00 $2,540.00 $1,200.00

44. Total turn-key Price for Fire alarm 
Equipment Installed in a "Dry" Portable                                               
$_____

$2,500.00 $2,540.00 $1,200.00

45. Hourly rate during SDOC regular 
business hours (7:30 AM-4:30 PM)                                                     
$_____/hr

$40.00 $50.00 $82.50

46. Hourly rate during over time hours                                      
(4:30 PM-7:30 AM)                                                                                   
$_____/hr

$60.00 $75.00 $123.75

47. Hourly rate for Weekends and Holidays 
(Sat, from 7:30 AM-Monday 7:30 AM & 
Holidays)                                                                  
$_____/hr

$60.00 $75.00 $165.00

48. Balance of Product Line Discount of List                                                                                                         
_____% 35% None 15%


