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RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE NON-
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE NON 

RESPONSIVE
NON 

RESPONSIVE
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO  NO  

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
SAMPLE LIST NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO

SUPPLIES
1. Owl Pellet Kit                                                     
Fisher AJS19366A or Approved Equivalent            
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NOT PROVIDED NO BID

PAGE 344        
52.85            
5%              

50.21

PAGE 87         
35.95            

SEE ATTACHED 
LETTER   

PAGE 70         
64.95            
10%             
58.46

PAGE 156         
63.00             
24%              
47.88

NOT INCLUDED NO BID

2. Soil Organism Study Kit                                   
Fisher AJS19363 or Approved Equivalent              
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 554        
49.95            
5%              

47.45

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 161         
57.50             
24%              
47.70

NO BID

3. Co-Flex Cohesive Flexible Bandage               
4n. x 5yd. Roll (stretched) wt 0.25;bs.                     
Nasco C13818(x)N  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Hay Feeder                                                         
Made of 1/4 wire with smooth, powder-coat finish  
Nasco 25279N or Approved Equivalent                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5.Shoulder Length Gloves Dispenser Pk            
1 1/4 mil gloves with watertight seams. Pkg. of 
100                                                                            
Nasco C06271N  Or Approved Equivalent             
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6. Safety Goggle                                                    
Frey Scientific 15577918 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

PAGE 35       
3.10           
5%            
2.95

PAGE 861        
4.75             
5%              
4.51

NO BID

PAGE 160        
3.95             
10%             
3.56

PAGE 772         
2.95              
24%              
2.24

NO BID

7. Aquaport Competitive Stager                          
Pitsco D23820-067 or Approved Equivalent           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                
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RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE NON-
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE NON 

RESPONSIVE
NON 

RESPONSIVE
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO  NO  

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
SAMPLE LIST NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO

SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

FURNITURE
1. Mobile Lab Table & Mirror                         
48"Wx38"Dx36"H, Stainless steel sink, 11/4" 
ChemArmor top. Hand water pump, 2-water 
bottles. 25'grounded extension cord & mirror, 
Connecting hoses, crossbar & clams.                     
Frey Scientific 15568154 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE  953       
1,355.00         

5%              
1,287.25

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 804         
1,478.65          

24%              
1,123.77

NO BID

2. Science Table Chemical Resistant                  
Black top 24"x54" apron foot .                                 
Page # _____                                                          
List Price $ _____                                                   
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 945        
315.00           

5%              
299.25

NO BID

PAGE 162        
379.95           
10%             

341.96

PAGE 798         
499.80            
24%              

379.85

312.00           
35%             

202.80

EQUIPMENT
1. Goggle Sanitizers                                              
Frey Scientific 15565303  or Approved Equivalent 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 867        
499.00           

5%              
474.05

NO BID

PAGE 160        
545.00           
10%             

490.50

PAGE  776        
455.00            
24%              

345.80

NO BID

2. Rock, Mineral & Fossils of the U.S.                 
50 specimens 1"x1" & number coded, With 
compartment Container. Science Kit 47045-00      
or Approved Equivalent                                           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 583        
39.95            
5%              

37.95

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 397         
36.50             
24%              
27.74

NO BID

3. Tuning Fork Set                                                 
8 Tuning Forks w/mallet, Tuning forks #256, 288, 
320, 341.3, 384, 426.6, 480, & 512                         
Science Kit 47731-00 or Approved Equivalent       
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 719        
57.95            
5%              

55.05

PAGE 134        
29.95            

SEE BID
NO BID

PAGE 568         
22.25             
24%              
16.91

NO BID
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RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE NON-
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE NON 

RESPONSIVE
NON 

RESPONSIVE
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO  NO  

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
SAMPLE LIST NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO

SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Ohaus Primer Balance                                      
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

PAGE 39     
CATALOG DISC 

18.00          
5%            

17.10

PAGE 880        
19.95            
5%              

18.95

NO BID

PAGE 40         
32.95            
10%             
29.66

20.00             
24%              
15.20

NO BID

5. Fetal Pig,                                                            
Single, 11-13" each Formaldehyde Free                
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 347        
14.40            
5%              

13.68

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 87          
17.20             
24%              
13.07

NO BID

6. Hobble             Heavy 1 1/2" cushioned leather 
pad, adjustable w/copper rivets, chain connector 
with swivel center.       Nasco C0137N or 
Approved Equivalent                                               
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7. Form Wing Glider Pak-                                     
Pitsco D54603-127  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BOTTLE CHEMICALS
1. Aluminum Chloride 500g                                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 664        
21.00            
5%              

19.95

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 365         
15.70             
24%              
11.93

NO BID

2. Crystal Violet                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 670        
9.60             
5%              
9.12

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 372         
17.55             
24%              
13.34

NO BID

3. Gram Stain Kit Set                                       
Consisting of 4 botl. of 30mL ea. (w/dropper 
capes)                                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price

NO BID

PAGE 687        
19.95            
5%              

18.95

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 32          
16.95             
24%              
12.88

NO BID
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RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE NON-
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE NON 

RESPONSIVE
NON 

RESPONSIVE
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO  NO  

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
SAMPLE LIST NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO

SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Potassium Chlorate 100g                                 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

NO BID

PAGE 681        
11.50            
5%              

10.92

NO BID NO BID
10.40             
24%              
7.90

NO BID
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RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE NON-
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE NON 

RESPONSIVE
NON 

RESPONSIVE
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO  NO  

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form NO YES YES YES YES YES YES NO NO
SAMPLE LIST NO YES YES YES YES YES NO NO NO

SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

PRICE SHEET
1. DISCOUNT OFF SUPPLIES/CONSUMABLES  
_____% 5%  OFF 

CATALOG 
PRICE

5% SEE ATTACHED 
LETTER 10%

GRADES 7-12    
24%              

GRADES K-6     
15%

7% NO BID

2. DISCOUNT OFF FURNITURE                           
_____% N/A 5% SEE ATTACHED 

LETTER 10%

GRADES 7-12    
24%              

GRADES K-6     
15%

0% NO BID

3. DISCOUNT OFF MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT    
_____% 5%  OFF 

CATALOG 
PRICE

5% SEE ATTACHED 
LETTER 10%

GRADES 7-12    
24%              

GRADES K-6     
15%

7% NO BID

4. DISCOUNT OFF PRESERVED MATERIALS    
_____% N/A 5% SEE ATTACHED 

LETTER 10%

GRADES 7-12    
24%              

GRADES K-6     
15%

7% NO BID

5. DISCOUNT OFF BOTTLED CHEMICALS         
_____% N/A 5% SEE ATTACHED 

LETTER 10%

GRADES 7-12    
24%              

GRADES K-6     
15%

7% NO BID

6. MINIMUM ORDER AMOUNT                             
(if applicable)                                                           
$_____

N/A SEE BID N/A NONE N/A NONE 608.40

7. Quote or Contract Number   (if applicable)         
_____ N/A P105673 2005CD OSPS #SDOC05-

096-RB SS23164CG2005F NONE

8. Best time for delivery after receipt of purchase 
order .   _____ 15-25 DAYS 7-35 DAYS 15-30 DAYS 7-10 DAYS 10-45 DAYS 7-10 DAYS

9. Exclusions if any and how to identify them in the
catalog:                                                                   
______________________                                    
______________________                                    
______________________

NONE SEE BID SEE ATTACHED 
LETTER SEE BID SEE BID SEE BID

10. AREA REPRESENTATIVE                              
NAME______________________                          
ADDRESS___________________                         
PHONE NO. ______FAX No. _____               

YES NO N/A YES YES NO  

Are other entities allowed to piggyback from this 
bid?                                                                         
_____Yes  _____No

YES NO YES YES NO  NO



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

1. Owl Pellet Kit                                                     
Fisher AJS19366A or Approved Equivalent            
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Soil Organism Study Kit                                   
Fisher AJS19363 or Approved Equivalent              
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____
3. Co-Flex Cohesive Flexible Bandage               
4n. x 5yd. Roll (stretched) wt 0.25;bs.                     
Nasco C13818(x)N  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

4. Hay Feeder                                                         
Made of 1/4 wire with smooth, powder-coat finish  
Nasco 25279N or Approved Equivalent                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

5.Shoulder Length Gloves Dispenser Pk            
1 1/4 mil gloves with watertight seams. Pkg. of 
100                                                                            
Nasco C06271N  Or Approved Equivalent             
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price6. Safety Goggle                                                    
Frey Scientific 15577918 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

7. Aquaport Competitive Stager                          
Pitsco D23820-067 or Approved Equivalent           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                
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42

RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

PAGE 15         
21.40            
10/PK           
17%             
17.80

PAGE 34         
49.95    NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 140        
28.40            
25%             
21.30

PAGE 265        
35.00            
28%             
25.20

NO BID PAGE 109        
55.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 354        
55.95            
25%             
41.97

NO BID

PAGE 110        
1.60             
10%             
1.44

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 170        
10.40            
10%             
9.36

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 382        
10.45            
10%             
9.41

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID PAGE 30         
5.95

PAGE 78         
1.60             
15%             
1.36

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1119       
2.90             
25%             
2.18

PAGE 516        
3.00             
28%             
2.16

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 63         
65.00            
0%              

65.00

NO BID NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

FURNITURE
1. Mobile Lab Table & Mirror                         
48"Wx38"Dx36"H, Stainless steel sink, 11/4" 
ChemArmor top. Hand water pump, 2-water 
bottles. 25'grounded extension cord & mirror, 
Connecting hoses, crossbar & clams.                     
Frey Scientific 15568154 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Science Table Chemical Resistant                  
Black top 24"x54" apron foot .                                 
Page # _____                                                          
List Price $ _____                                                   
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

EQUIPMENT
1. Goggle Sanitizers                                              
Frey Scientific 15565303  or Approved Equivalent 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Rock, Mineral & Fossils of the U.S.                 
50 specimens 1"x1" & number coded, With 
compartment Container. Science Kit 47045-00      
or Approved Equivalent                                           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

3. Tuning Fork Set                                                 
8 Tuning Forks w/mallet, Tuning forks #256, 288, 
320, 341.3, 384, 426.6, 480, & 512                         
Science Kit 47731-00 or Approved Equivalent       
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____
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42

RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

PAGE 329        
1,373.60         

5%              
1,304.92

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 872        
1,309.00         

25%             
981.75

PAGE 820        
1,465.00         

12%             
1,289.20   *

PAGE 334        
420.35           

5%              
399.33

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1          
291.54           
25%             

218.65

NO BID

PAGE 866        
542.00           
25%             

406.50

PAGE 810        
450.00           
12%             

396.00

PAGE 132        
436.95           

5%              
415.10

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1121       
496.25           
25%             

372.19

PAGE 770        
468.20           
12%             

412.02  *

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 369        
41.85            
25%             
31.39

PAGE 83         
41.50            
28%             
29.88

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 708        
24.55            
25%             
18.42

PAGE 604        
40.00            
28%             
28.80



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Ohaus Primer Balance                                      
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

5. Fetal Pig,                                                            
Single, 11-13" each Formaldehyde Free                
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

6. Hobble             Heavy 1 1/2" cushioned leather 
pad, adjustable w/copper rivets, chain connector 
with swivel center.       Nasco C0137N or 
Approved Equivalent                                               
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

7. Form Wing Glider Pak-                                     
Pitsco D54603-127  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

BOTTLE CHEMICALS
1. Aluminum Chloride 500g                                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Crystal Violet                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

3. Gram Stain Kit Set                                       
Consisting of 4 botl. of 30mL ea. (w/dropper 
capes)                                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price

N
as

co
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

90
1 

Ja
ne

sv
ill

e 
Av

e 
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

Ft
 A

tk
in

so
n,

 W
I 5

35
38

N
eb

ra
sk

a 
Sc

ie
nt

ifi
c 

   
   

   
   

   
D

iv
. o

f C
yr

gu
s 

C
o.

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
38

23
 L

ea
ve

nw
or

th
 S

t  
   

   
   

   
  

O
m

ah
a,

 N
E 

68
10

5-
11

80

Pa
rc

o 
Sc

ie
nt

ifi
c 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

31
6 

Yo
un

gs
to

w
n-

Ki
ng

sv
ill

e 
R

d 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  V
ie

nn
a,

 
O

H
 4

44
73

Pe
pc

o 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

19
29

 C
ou

nt
y 

R
d 

15
10

   
   

   
   

   
M

ob
er

ly
, M

O
 6

52
70

Pi
ts

co
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

10
02

 E
 A

da
m

s 
   

   
   

   
   

 
Pi

tts
bu

rg
, K

S 
66

76
2

Sa
rg

en
t-W

el
ch

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

91
1 

C
om

m
er

ce
 C

t  
   

   
   

   
   

   
Bu

ffa
lo

 G
ro

ve
, I

L 
60

08
9

Sc
ho

ol
 S

pe
ci

al
ty

/F
re

y 
Sc

ie
nt

ifi
c 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
W

63
16

 D
es

ig
n 

D
r  

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
G

re
en

vi
lle

, W
I 5

49
42

RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

PAGE 197        
25.85            
17%             
21.46

NO BID

PAGE 7  SEE 
COPY           
20.00            
15%             
17.00

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1028       
20.00            
25%             
15.00

PAGE 691        
21.95            
28%             
15.81

PAGE 7          
15.95            
17%             
13.24

PAGE 17         
20.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 142        
21.25            
25%             
15.94

PAGE 289        
26.60            
28%             
19.16

PAGE 187        
28.20            
10%             
25.38

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 114        
75.00            
0%              

75.00

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 534        
17.20            
25%             
12.90

PAGE 482        
11.20            
0%              

11.20

PAGE 119        
10.40            
17%             
8.63

16 OZ           
PAGE 63         

17.25
NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE  549       
9.10             
25%             
6.83

NO BID

PAGE 34         
32.00            
17%             
26.50

PAGE 63         
12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 554        
17.50            
25%             
13.13

NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Potassium Chlorate 100g                                 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____
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RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

PAGE 125        
11.50            
17%             
9.55

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 568        
11.50            
25%             
8.63

PAGE 498        
13.40            
0%              

13.40



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

PRICE SHEET
1. DISCOUNT OFF SUPPLIES/CONSUMABLES  
_____%

2. DISCOUNT OFF FURNITURE                           
_____%

3. DISCOUNT OFF MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT    
_____%

4. DISCOUNT OFF PRESERVED MATERIALS    
_____%

5. DISCOUNT OFF BOTTLED CHEMICALS         
_____%

6. MINIMUM ORDER AMOUNT                             
(if applicable)                                                           
$_____

7. Quote or Contract Number   (if applicable)         
_____

8. Best time for delivery after receipt of purchase 
order .   _____

9. Exclusions if any and how to identify them in the
catalog:                                                                   
______________________                                    
______________________                                    
______________________
10. AREA REPRESENTATIVE                              
NAME______________________                          
ADDRESS___________________                         
PHONE NO. ______FAX No. _____               

Are other entities allowed to piggyback from this 
bid?                                                                         
_____Yes  _____No
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RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

SCIENCE 
CATALOG  17%   
AGRICULTURE 
CATALOG  10%

10% 15% NO BID 0% 25% 28%

SCIENCE 
CATALOG  5%    
AGRICULTURE 
CATALOG  5%

10% NO BID 25% 0% 25% 12%

SCIENCE 
CATALOG  5%    
AGRICULTURE 
CATALOG  5%

10% 15% NO BID 0% 25% 28%

SCIENCE 
CATALOG  17% 10% NO BID NO BID 0% 25% 28%

SCIENCE 
CATALOG  17% 10% NO BID NO BID 0% 25% 28%

50.00 100.00 NONE 3000.00

25.00    FREE 
FREIGHT ON 

ORDERS OVER 
100.00

N/A NONE

05-76953 NB050405 FL05-6446 FL-05-21 PIT-05-06-0002 204726-CT C/928444/F

15-30 DAYS 7-10 DAYS 15-21 DAYS 4 WEEKS 15 DAYS  7-10 DAYS

SEE ATTACHED SEE BID

PREPARED 
SLIDES PAGES 59

65              
5% DISCOUNT 

ONLY

SEE BID SEE BID SEE BID

*  SEE BID  
SHIPPING & 
HANDLING 

EXTRA

NO YES NONE YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

1. Owl Pellet Kit                                                     
Fisher AJS19366A or Approved Equivalent            
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Soil Organism Study Kit                                   
Fisher AJS19363 or Approved Equivalent              
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____
3. Co-Flex Cohesive Flexible Bandage               
4n. x 5yd. Roll (stretched) wt 0.25;bs.                     
Nasco C13818(x)N  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

4. Hay Feeder                                                         
Made of 1/4 wire with smooth, powder-coat finish  
Nasco 25279N or Approved Equivalent                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

5.Shoulder Length Gloves Dispenser Pk            
1 1/4 mil gloves with watertight seams. Pkg. of 
100                                                                            
Nasco C06271N  Or Approved Equivalent             
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price6. Safety Goggle                                                    
Frey Scientific 15577918 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

7. Aquaport Competitive Stager                          
Pitsco D23820-067 or Approved Equivalent           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                
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NON 
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES YES

PAGE 406        
39.95            
(-5.95)           
33.96

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 742        
49.95            
10%             
44.96

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 843        
5.15             

(-0.77)           
4.38

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

FURNITURE
1. Mobile Lab Table & Mirror                         
48"Wx38"Dx36"H, Stainless steel sink, 11/4" 
ChemArmor top. Hand water pump, 2-water 
bottles. 25'grounded extension cord & mirror, 
Connecting hoses, crossbar & clams.                     
Frey Scientific 15568154 or Approved Equivalent  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Science Table Chemical Resistant                  
Black top 24"x54" apron foot .                                 
Page # _____                                                          
List Price $ _____                                                   
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

EQUIPMENT
1. Goggle Sanitizers                                              
Frey Scientific 15565303  or Approved Equivalent 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Rock, Mineral & Fossils of the U.S.                 
50 specimens 1"x1" & number coded, With 
compartment Container. Science Kit 47045-00      
or Approved Equivalent                                           
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

3. Tuning Fork Set                                                 
8 Tuning Forks w/mallet, Tuning forks #256, 288, 
320, 341.3, 384, 426.6, 480, & 512                         
Science Kit 47731-00 or Approved Equivalent       
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

Sc
ho

ol
 T

ec
h 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
74

5 
St

at
e 

C
irc

le
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
An

n 
Ar

bo
r, 

M
I 4

81
06

Sc
ie

nc
e 

K
it 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

PO
 B

ox
 5

00
3 

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
To

na
w

an
da

, N
Y 

14
15

1

Sp
lit

 R
oc

k 
Su

pp
ly

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
10

14
 B

er
w

yn
 R

d 
   

   
   

   
   

 
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

80
6

Su
n 

C
, I

nc
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

11
63

1 
C

ol
um

bi
a 

Pk
 D

r  
   

   
   

  
Ja

ck
so

nv
ill

e,
 F

L 
32

25
8

W
ar

d'
s 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
51

00
 W

 H
en

rie
tta

 R
d 

   
   

   
   

   
R

oc
he

st
er

, N
Y 

14
69

2

NON 
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES YES

PAGE 924        
1,435.00         
(-212.25)         
1,222.75

NO BID
2,750.00         

50%             
1,375.00

SPECIAL ORDER  
1,431.00

PAGE 921        
330.00           
(-49.50)          
280.50

483.00           
33.5%           
321.20

PAGE 2          
582.04           
50%             

291.02

PAGE 1048       
305.00           
10%             

274.50

PAGE 846        
569.00           
(-85.35)          
483.65

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1165       
599.00           
10%             

539.10

PAGE 500        
42.00            
(-6.30)           
35.70

NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 691        
27.95            
(-4.19)           
23.76

NO BID NO BID NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Ohaus Primer Balance                                      
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

5. Fetal Pig,                                                            
Single, 11-13" each Formaldehyde Free                
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

6. Hobble             Heavy 1 1/2" cushioned leather 
pad, adjustable w/copper rivets, chain connector 
with swivel center.       Nasco C0137N or 
Approved Equivalent                                               
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

7. Form Wing Glider Pak-                                     
Pitsco D54603-127  or Approved Equivalent          
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

BOTTLE CHEMICALS
1. Aluminum Chloride 500g                                  
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

2. Crystal Violet                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____

3. Gram Stain Kit Set                                       
Consisting of 4 botl. of 30mL ea. (w/dropper 
capes)                                                                     
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price
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NON 
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES YES

PAGE 842        
31.00            
(-4.65)           
26.35

NO BID NO BID

PAGE 1085       
20.00            
10%             
18.00

PAGE 314        
17.50            

(-NONE)          
17.50

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 535        
14.70            
(-2.21)           
12.49

NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 541        
9.10             

(-1.37)           
7.73

NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAGE 544        
17.50            
(-2.63)           
14.87

NO BID NO BID NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

4. Potassium Chlorate 100g                                 
Page #_____                                                           
List Price $_____                                                    
Discount _____                                                       
Discount Price _____
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NON 
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES YES

PAGE 550        
7.20             

(-1.08)           
6.12

NO BID NO BID NO BID



RESPONSIVE - NON RESPONSIVE

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

SAMPLE LIST
SUPPLIES

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-05-096 RB                                      
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  06/01/05@2:00 PM                     
SCIENCE CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:   Rose Burgos                  
RECORDED BY:   Lisa Kesecker                

PRICE SHEET
1. DISCOUNT OFF SUPPLIES/CONSUMABLES  
_____%

2. DISCOUNT OFF FURNITURE                           
_____%

3. DISCOUNT OFF MACHINERY/EQUIPMENT    
_____%

4. DISCOUNT OFF PRESERVED MATERIALS    
_____%

5. DISCOUNT OFF BOTTLED CHEMICALS         
_____%

6. MINIMUM ORDER AMOUNT                             
(if applicable)                                                           
$_____

7. Quote or Contract Number   (if applicable)         
_____

8. Best time for delivery after receipt of purchase 
order .   _____

9. Exclusions if any and how to identify them in the
catalog:                                                                   
______________________                                    
______________________                                    
______________________
10. AREA REPRESENTATIVE                              
NAME______________________                          
ADDRESS___________________                         
PHONE NO. ______FAX No. _____               

Are other entities allowed to piggyback from this 
bid?                                                                         
_____Yes  _____No

Sc
ho

ol
 T

ec
h 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
74

5 
St

at
e 

C
irc

le
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
An

n 
Ar

bo
r, 

M
I 4

81
06

Sc
ie

nc
e 

K
it 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

PO
 B

ox
 5

00
3 

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
To

na
w

an
da

, N
Y 

14
15

1

Sp
lit

 R
oc

k 
Su

pp
ly

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
10

14
 B

er
w

yn
 R

d 
   

   
   

   
   

 
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

80
6

Su
n 

C
, I

nc
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

11
63

1 
C

ol
um

bi
a 

Pk
 D

r  
   

   
   

  
Ja

ck
so

nv
ill

e,
 F

L 
32

25
8

W
ar

d'
s 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
51

00
 W

 H
en

rie
tta

 R
d 

   
   

   
   

   
R

oc
he

st
er

, N
Y 

14
69

2

NON 
RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE RESPONSIVE

YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES YES YES
NO YES YES YES YES

0% 15% NO BID NO BID 10%

N/A 15% 33.5% 50% 10%

N/A 15% NO BID NO BID 10%

0% 0% NO BID NO BID 10%

0% 15% NO BID NO BID 10%

20.00 N/A NONE 100.00 NONE

SE51149 C-505502-434

7-10 DAYS 30-40 DAYS 30-60 DAYS 7-30 DAYS

SEE BID NONE SEE BID

YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES


