

| | | | | | | | | |
|--|--|--|--|---|--|---|---|---|
| TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-05-099 FPC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 05/27/05@11:00 AM PURCH & INST ALUMINUM COVERED WALKWAYS READ BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> BOARD APPROVED 6/21/05 | | AM&I 5407 Boggy Creek Rd Orlando, FL 32824 Phone 407-240-0408 Fax 407-240-0257 | All Bright Alum of Osc 4107 S Orange Blossom Trail Kissimmee, FL 34746 Phone 407-846-6776 Fax 407-846-2120 | Custom Screens & Arch Prod 4881 Distribution Ct Orlando, FL 32822 | MD Building Systems of FI PO Box 1921 Auburndale, FL 33823 Phone 863-559-2606 Fax 863-666-8857 | MVB & Associates 6250 Hazeltine Natl Dr Orlando, FL 32822 | Perfection Architectural 2310 Mercator Dr Orlando, FL 32807 | Tillman McDonald Alum 1606 Florida Ave St Cloud, FL 34769 |
| Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES |
| Drug Free Workplace Certification Form | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | YES |
| Addendum 1 | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | NO |
| Addendum 2 | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | NO |
| Addendum 3 | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | NO |
| Questionnaire | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | YES |
| Bonding Capacity | YES | YES | NO | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO |
| Contractors License | YES | YES | NO | YES | YES | YES | NO | NO |
| Certificate of Insurance | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | YES | NO | NO |
| PRICE SHEET | ALTERNATE AWARDED LOTS 1, 2, 3, 4 | PRIMARY AWARDED LOTS 2 & 4 | | PRIMARY AWARDED LOTS 1, 3 & 5 | | | | |
| LOT 1-PROVIDE AND INSTALL LAMINATED WALKWAY COVERS | | | NON RESPONSIVE | | | | NON RESPONSIVE | NON RESPONSIVE |
| 1.1 Up to 500 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 14.50 15.00 | 15.34 15.34 | | 11.70 13.45 | 18.00 17.00 | | | |
| 1.2 From 500 to 5,000 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 14.50 15.00 | 15.34 15.34 | | 9.75 11.21 | 17.50 16.50 | | | |
| 1.3 Over 5,000 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 14.50 15.00 | 15.34 15.34 | | 9.75 11.21 | 17.00 16.25 | | | |
| LOT 2-PROVIDE AND INSTALL EXTRUDED WALKWAY COVERS | | | ALTERNATE - Not Approved | | | | | |
| 2.1 Up to 500 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 30.00 31.00 | 24.25 24.25 | | NO BID | NO BID | | | |

| | | | | | | | |
|---|--|--|---|--|---|---|--|
| <p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-05-099 FPC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>05/27/05@11:00 AM</u> <u>PURCH & INST ALUMINUM</u> <u>COVERED WALKWAYS</u> READ BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> BOARD APPROVED 6/21/05</p> | AM&I 5407 Boggy Creek Rd Orlando, FL 32824 Phone 407-240-0408 Fax 407-240-0257 | All Bright Alum of Osc 4107 S Orange Blossom Trail Kissimmee, FL 34746 Phone 407-846-6776 Fax 407-846-2120 | Custom Screens & Arch Prod 4881 Distribution Ct Orlando, FL 32822 | MD Building Systems of FI PO Box 1921 Auburndale, FL 33823 Phone 863-559-2606 Fax 863-666-8857 | MVB & Associates 6250 Hazeltine Natl Dr Orlando, FL 32822 | Perfection Architectural 2310 Mercator Dr Orlando, FL 32807 | Tillman McDonald Alumn 1606 Florida Ave St Cloud, FL 34769 |
| 2.2 From 500 to 5,000 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 30.00 31.00 | 24.25 24.25 | | NO BID | NO BID | | |
| 2.3 Over 5,000 square feet Single Column-\$_____/sq ft Double Column-\$_____/sq ft | 30.00 31.00 | 24.25 24.25 | | NO BID | NO BID | | |
| LOT 3-MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR AND/OR RELOCATION WORK FOR LAMINATED WALKWAY COVERS | | | | | | | |
| 3.1 Materials-percentage of markup from cost %____ | 20% | 5% | | 25% | 30% | | |
| 3.2 Labor-Flat Hourly Rate ____/Hour | 55.00 | 37.50 | | 70.00 | 58.50 | | |
| LOT 4-MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR AND/OR RELOCATION WORK FOR EXTRUDED WALKWAY COVERS | | | | | | | |
| 4.1 Materials-percentage of markup from cost %____ | 20% | 5% | | NO BID | NO BID | | |
| 4.2 Labor-Flat Hourly Rate ____/Hour | 55.00 | 37.50 | | NO BID | NO BID | | |
| LOT 5-SPECIAL PROJECT FOR NEPTUNE MIDDLE SCHOOL | | | | | | | |
| 5.1 Total Turnkey Price Per attached drawings \$____ | \$116,066.00 | \$98,807.84 | | \$68,336.16 | \$99,860.00 | | |

| | | | | | | | |
|---|---|---|--|---|--|--|---|
| <p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-05-099 FPC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>05/27/05@11:00 AM</u> <u>PURCH & INST ALUMINUM</u> <u>COVERED WALKWAYS</u> READ BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> BOARD APPROVED 6/21/05</p> | <p>AM&I 5407 Boggy Creek Rd Orlando, FL 32824 Phone 407-240-0408 Fax 407-240-0257</p> | <p>All Bright Alum of Osc 4107 S Orange Blossom Trail Kissimmee, FL 34746 Phone 407-846-6776 Fax 407-846-2120</p> | <p>Custom Screens & Arch Prod 4881 Distribution Ct Orlando, FL 32822</p> | <p>MD Building Systems of FI PO Box 1921 Auburndale, FL 33823 Phone 863-559-2606 Fax 863-666-8857</p> | <p>MVB & Associates 6250 Hazeltine Natl Dr Orlando, FL 32822</p> | <p>Perfection Architectural 2310 Mercator Dr Orlando, FL 32807</p> | <p>Tillman McDonald Alumn 1606 Florida Ave St Cloud, FL 34769</p> |
| <p>5.2 Guaranteed Completion Date After Receipt of Purchase Order and /or Notice To Proceed _____ Calendar Days</p> | <p>45 DAYS</p> | <p>** PRICE INCLUDES CORE DRILLING 120 DAYS</p> | | <p>65 DAYS</p> | <p>49 DAYS</p> | | |
| | | | | | | | |