

<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-017 CJ PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 09/08/05@2:00 PM <u>PLUMBING SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT</u> READ BY: <u>Laura Elam</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Cheryl Jessee</u></p>	Ferguson Ent 3490 Recker Hwy Winter Haven, FL 33880	JA Sexauer 531 Central Park Ave Scarsdale, NY 10583	<p align="center">Sexauer did not provide the copies of the actual invoices as requested in the bid. Therefore considered non-responsive</p>				
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form	Yes	Yes					
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form	Yes	Yes					
PRICE SHEET							
List of Required Manufacturers? ___ Yes ___ No	Yes	Yes, but incomplete					
List of Preferred Manufacturers? ___ Yes ___ No	Yes	Yes, but incomplete					
Delivery Days/Times? ___ Yes ___ No	No	No					
SAMPLE PRICE LIST							
PLEASE LIST YOUR COST PLUS MULTIPLIER FOR THE DISTRICT	x1.555	None Provided					
1. Genuine Elkay Filter #51295C School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$58.385 Quote	No Bid					
2. Genuine Central Brass 1137-A Faucet School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$36.72 Quote	\$32.73					
3. Genuine Kohler K-7520 School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$130.20 Yes	\$155.90					
4. Genuine Chicago 349-CP School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$72.019 Yes	\$73.58					
5. 3/4" Cast Brass Spud School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$2.079 Yes	\$2.27					
6. 3/8" x 20" CP Copper Lav Supply Tube School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ___ Yes ___ No	\$1.282 Yes	\$1.22					

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-017 CJ**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **09/08/05@2:00 PM**
**PLUMBING SUPPLIES &
 EQUIPMENT**
 READ BY: Laura Elam
 RECORDED BY: Cheryl Jessee

Ferguson Ent
 3490 Recker Hwy
 Winter Haven, FL 33880

JA Sexauer
 531 Central Park Ave
 Scarsdale, NY 10583

**Sexauer did not provide the
 copies of the actual invoices as
 requested in the bid. Therefore
 considered non-responsive**

16. Nipple Close 1/2" (Galvanized)
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.383
 Yes

\$0.14

17. Nipple Galvanized 3/4" x 2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.512
 Yes

\$0.18

18. Reducer 3/4" x 1/2" Galvanized Bushing
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.629
 Yes

\$0.37

19. 1/4" Galvanized Street 90's
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$1.443
 Quote

No Bid

20. Red & White RW504434 Threaded Ball
 Valve 3/4" "ONLY"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

NQ

21. Nipple Black 3/4" x 2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.435
 Yes

\$0.17

22. Nipple Black 1-1/4" x 4"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$1.06
 Yes

\$0.78

23. Black Coupling 2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$3.14
 Yes

\$0.78

24. Pipe Galvanized 21' 3/4"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.6977 per ft.
 Yes

No Bid

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-017 CJ**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **09/08/05@2:00 PM**
**PLUMBING SUPPLIES &
 EQUIPMENT**
 READ BY: Laura Elam
 RECORDED BY: Cheryl Jessee

Ferguson Ent
 3490 Recker Hwy
 Winter Haven, FL 33880

JA Sexauer
 531 Central Park Ave
 Scarsdale, NY 10583

**Sexauer did not provide the
 copies of the actual invoices as
 requested in the bid. Therefore
 considered non-responsive**

25. Adaptor Fernco 3" Waste School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$2.426 Yes	\$1.90				
26. Tee PVC 3/4" School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$.143 Yes	\$0.11				
27. Cap PVC 1-1/4" School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$.397 Yes	\$0.17				
28. Slip by Slip Reducer Bushing 3/4" x 1/2" PVC School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$.106 Yes	\$0.08				
29. Cap Test PVC 3" School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$.198 Yes	No Bio				
30. ELL PVC 45 3" Pressure School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$2.719 Yes	\$1.80				
31. Cap PVC 3" (Hard Cap) School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$1.083 Yes	>78				
32. Pipe PVC Schedule 40, 20' 3/4" Bell End School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$.1571 per ft. Yes	No Bid				
33. PVC Bend 1/8 Street 4DWV School District Unit Price _____ Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No	\$2.46 Yes	\$2.09				

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-017 CJ**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **09/08/05@2:00 PM**
**PLUMBING SUPPLIES &
 EQUIPMENT**
 READ BY: Laura Elam
 RECORDED BY: Cheryl Jessee

Ferguson Ent
 3490 Recker Hwy
 Winter Haven, FL 33880

JA Sexauer
 531 Central Park Ave
 Scarsdale, NY 10583

**Sexauer did not provide the
 copies of the actual invoices as
 requested in the bid. Therefore
 considered non-responsive**

34. DWV 2" 1/8 Bend PVC
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.61
 Yes

\$0.52

35. DWV 2" Coupling PVC
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.258
 Yes

\$0.23

36. Red & White RW5049114 Sweat Ball
 Valve 1-1/4" "ONLY"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

NQ

\$10.97

37. Tee Copper 1/4"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$1.44
 Yes

\$1.45

38. ELL Copper 45, 1/2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.367
 Yes

\$0.38

39. Cap Copper 1"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.629
 Yes

\$0.67

40. Tee Copper 1-1/2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$5.839
 Yes

\$5.87

41. Coupling Thread PVC 1/2" (Threaded
 both ends)
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$.164
 Quote

\$0.19

42. Hardee 2" Ultra Flow Solenoid
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

NQ

No Bid

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-017 CJ**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **09/08/05@2:00 PM**
PLUMBING SUPPLIES & EQUIPMENT
 READ BY: Laura Elam
 RECORDED BY: Cheryl Jessee

Ferguson Ent
 3490 Recker Hwy
 Winter Haven, FL 33880

JA Sexauer
 531 Central Park Ave
 Scarsdale, NY 10583

Sexauer did not provide the copies of the actual invoices as requested in the bid. Therefore considered non-responsive

43. Hunter PGP Adj
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

NQ

No Bid

44. Coupler Fix Slip 2-1/2"
 School District Unit Price _____
 Inv. Incl. ____ Yes ____ No

\$8.582
 Quote

No Bid