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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES
Square D Distributor? Yes / no YES YES YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET ALTERNATE PRIMARY
1. 1 1/4" PVC Pipe Schedule 40 (price 
per 10' section)-Qty 2000'                         
$____________Unit Price             

4.08 4.19 NO BID

$____________Extended Price            8.16 838.00 NO BID

2. 1 1/4" PVC Pipe Schedule 80 (price 
per 10' section)-Qty 1000'                         
$____________Unit Price             

7.43 7.42 NO BID

$____________Extended Price             743.00 742.00 NO BID

3. 2" PVC Pipe Schedule 40 (price per 
10' section)-Qty 1000'                         
$____________Unit Price             

6.04 6.21 NO BID

$____________Extended Price             604.00 621.00 NO BID

4. 2" PVC Pipe Schedule 80 (price per 
10' section)-Qty 500'                         
$____________Unit Price             

10.34 10.33 NO BID

$____________Extended Price             517.00 516.50 NO BID

5. 4" PVC Pipe Schedule 40 (price per 
10' section)-Qty 400'                         
$____________Unit Price             16.48 16.93 NO BID

$____________Extended Price             659.20 677.20 NO BID

6. 4" PVC Pipe Schedule 80 (price per 
10' section)-Qty 100'                         
$____________Unit Price             

29.95 31.18 NO BID

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-06-088-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 5/25/06@2:00PM                
SIXTY (60) DAY FIRM FIXED 
PRICES FOR PORTABLE 
CLASSROOM ELECTRICAL 
HARDWARE COMPONENTS 
READ BY: Lisa Kesecker              
RECORDED BY: Laura Elam         
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-06-088-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 5/25/06@2:00PM                
SIXTY (60) DAY FIRM FIXED 
PRICES FOR PORTABLE 
CLASSROOM ELECTRICAL 
HARDWARE COMPONENTS 
READ BY: Lisa Kesecker              
RECORDED BY: Laura Elam         

$____________Extended Price             299.50 311.80 NO BID

7. PVC Materials- Balance of Product 
Line Available?                        Yes / No    
_______% Discount off List Price

YES               
OVERHEAD 

MARKUP 15%

YES DISCOUNT OFF 
LIST 60% NO BID

Copper Wire prices for Tuesday 5/23/06.
SDOC will call as needed. 

8. #4 Copper Wire (List your selling 
price for Tuesday, 5/23/06)         Qty- 
500'                                                     
____________/FT

1.05 .611/FT NO BID

____________/500' 525.00 305.50 NO BID

9. #2 THHN Wire (List your selling price 
for Tuesday, 5/23/06)         Qty- 5000'       
____________/FT 1.65 .930/FT NO BID

____________/5000'
8250.00 4650.00 NO BID

10. #6 Green Wire (List your selling 
price for Tuesday, 5/23/06)         Qty- 
5000'                                                     
____________/FT

.67/FT .472/FT NO BID

____________/5000'
3350.00 2360.00 NO BID

11. #10 THHN Wire (List your selling 
price for Tuesday, 5/23/06)         Qty- 
2000'                                                     
____________/FT

.26/FT .125/FT

page 2 of 4
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-06-088-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 5/25/06@2:00PM                
SIXTY (60) DAY FIRM FIXED 
PRICES FOR PORTABLE 
CLASSROOM ELECTRICAL 
HARDWARE COMPONENTS 
READ BY: Lisa Kesecker              
RECORDED BY: Laura Elam         

____________/2000'

520.00 250.00 483.04

12. Copper Wire- Balance of Product 
Line- Prices Available    Yes / No             
SDOC's Maintenance Department will 
call for pricing then issue a PO- Quoted 
prices valid for ____Hours

YES WILL HOLD 
FOR 24 HR

YES WILL HOLD FOR 
48 HR NO  

Square D Items- Exact Quantities are 
unknown at this time, please provide a 
cost per each **Square D Items shall be 
priced using Square D's "Immediate 
Delivery" Pricing**

13. Square D I-Line Panel Board 800A 
#HCM36918MP ONLY- Qty-1                    
$____________Unit Price

5137.95 4283.10 9040.00

14. Square D Breaker 2P-240V 
#FA22100AC ONLY- Qty-1                    
$____________Unit Price

222.20 245.00 388.23

15. Square D Breaker 2P-240V 
#FA22100AB ONLY- Qty-1                    
$____________Unit Price

222.20 245.00 388.23

16. Square D Breaker 2P-240V 
#FA22100BC ONLY- Qty-1                    
$____________Unit Price 222.20 245.00 388.23

17. Square D Breaker 2P-480V 
#FY14020A ONLY- Qty-1                    
$____________Unit Price

53.52 59.00 93.52
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-06-088-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 5/25/06@2:00PM                
SIXTY (60) DAY FIRM FIXED 
PRICES FOR PORTABLE 
CLASSROOM ELECTRICAL 
HARDWARE COMPONENTS 
READ BY: Lisa Kesecker              
RECORDED BY: Laura Elam         

18. Square D Panel Board Box 
#HCM23734M ONLY- Qty-1                   
$____________Unit Price

2575.78 2826.00 4500.41

19. Square D Panel Board Box 
#HC3291WP ONLY- Qty-1                   
$____________Unit Price

1805.24 1650.00 3154.12

20. Square D Neutral Assembly #HC8SN
ONLY- Qty-1                   
$____________Unit Price

261.41 295.24 456.73

21. Square D Ground Bar Kit 
#PK32DGTA ONLY- Qty-1                   
$____________Unit Price

37.74 41.00 65.94

22. Square D Products- Balance of 
Product Line Available Yes / No       
Overhead Markup _________% (If 
Square D Charges you $225 for a 2P-
240V Breaker what overhead/markup 
percentage will you add and charge to 
the school district?) i.e. Description- 
Breaker, Your Cost- 225.00, 
Overhead/Markup- 10%, (Add) 22.50, 
SDOC Final Cost- $247.50

YES OVERHEAD 
MARKUP 15%

YES OVERHEAED 
MARKUP 14%

10 % DISCOUNT FROM 
RESALE PRICE

23. All or none Extended Prices

26,014.10 21,161.34
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