

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form
Debarment?
QUESTIONNAIRE? YES OR NO?
Addenda?

YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES

PRICE SHEET

1. 20oz bottle durable polycarbonate material w/easy carry screw top, Translucent Royal Blue w/Matching color Lid and rubber grip w/1-color yellow gold logo.
 Mfg _____
 Item # _____
 Est. Qty-48
 Price \$ _____

	HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #5837 3.39	HIT PROMOTION PRODUCTS #5837 3.39	NO BID	ADBA-LITE ASI #32145 #PB20 N/A	HIT WEAR #5837 3.45	HIT WEAR #5837 3.66	Premium #DW3222 N/A
--	---	---	--------	---	---------------------------	---------------------------	---------------------------

2. SAME AS ABOVE
 Est. Qty-144
 Price \$ _____

	HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #5837 3.39	HIT PROMOTION PRODUCTS #5837 3.39	NO BID	3.44	HIT WEAR #5837 3.15	HIT WEAR #5837 3.05	2.09
--	---	---	--------	------	---------------------------	---------------------------	------

3. Large Microfiber Portfolio with Embossed PVC Trim Size 10 3/8" W X 13 1/2" H Outside Zipper 8 card holders, elastic pen loop, 3 interior pockets one with a zipper and one mesh ID holder Royal Blue w/one color gold logo.
 Mfg _____
 Item # _____
 Est. Qty-20
 Price \$ _____

	HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #6630 6.29	HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #6630 6.29	NO BID	HIT PROMOTIONAL ASI #61125 ITEM #6630 8.54	HIT WEAR #6630 5.99	HIT WEAR #6630 8.19	Premium EX1979 Minimum 50 \$17.19
--	---	---	--------	---	---------------------------	---------------------------	--

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773	Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828	Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721	All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314	Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741	American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811	Barker Specialty 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222	Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741
4. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-100 Price \$ _____		6.29	6.29	NO BID	6.50	5.89	6.73	16.49
5. 11oz Colored Stoneware Mug with C-Handle. Almond Color with 1-color logo Hunter Green. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-144 Price \$ _____		HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #7215-6 1.25	HIT PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS #7215-6 1.25	NO BID	ODYSSEY ASI#39830 #115-6 1.67	HIT WEAR #7125 1.20	HIT WEAR #7125 1.39	Premium MG5000 2.59
6. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-576 Price \$ _____		1.25	1.25	NO BID	1.41	1.15	1.29	2.39
7. Do you charge for art charges Yes No		NO	NO	NO BID	NO	NO	NO	NO
8. If yes what is the charge \$ _____				NO BID		0.00		
9. Are setup charges extra Yes No		YES	YES	NO BID	NO	YES-NEW ORDERS	NO	NO
10. If yes what is the charge \$ _____		40.00	40.00	NO BID		35.00		

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

11. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

GIVEN ON ALL ORDERS

ALREADY GIVEN ON ORDER

NO BID

DISCOUNTS ARE INCLUDED IN PRICE OF THE ITEM AT TIME ITEM IS QUOTED-BASED ON QUANTITY REQUESTED BY CUSTOMER

144-288
 289-576
 577-1008

DEPENDING ON ITEM
 25,50,100, 250, 500, 1000

48, 96, 144, 288, 500

12. Jerzees 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo

Size S-XL Est Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

6.00

3.95

3.95

3.49

4.00

4.19

6.00

5.35

Size 2X Est Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

8.00

5.20

5.20

4.59

5.25

5.58

8.00

6.35

Size 3X Est Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

8.00

5.20

5.20

4.69

5.25

5.58

9.00

7.95

13. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
**PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
 PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY**
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Speciality
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
Price \$ _____

5.80

3.75

3.75

3.29

3.20

3.75

5.50

4.75

Size 2X Est Qty-75
Price \$ _____

7.65

4.95

4.95

4.39

4.25

5.14

7.50

5.75

Size 3X Est Qty-75
Price \$ _____

7.65

4.95

4.95

4.49

4.25

5.14

8.50

6.75

**14. Jerzees 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green FF logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.00

3.95

3.95

3.49

4.20

4.19

6.00

5.00

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.00

5.20

5.20

4.59

5.25

5.58

8.00

6.00

Size 3X Est.. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.00

5.20

5.20

5.69

5.25

5.58

9.00

7.00

15. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
**PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
 PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY**
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

**16. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color White FF
 logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25

**17. SAME AS ABOVE
 Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____**

**18. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green3 FF logo
 Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____**

**19. SAME AS ABOVE
 Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____**

**20. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz
 Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton
 Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo**

5.80

7.65

7.65

5.90

5.50

5.90

5.50

3.75

4.95

4.95

3.95

3.75

3.95

3.75

3.75

4.95

4.95

3.95

3.75

3.95

3.75

3.29

4.39

4.49

3.69

3.49

3.69

3.49

3.20

4.25

4.25

4.10

3.10

4.10

3.10

3.75

5.14

5.14

4.19

3.75

4.19

3.75

5.50

7.50

8.50

6.00

5.50

6.00

5.50

4.40

5.40

6.40

5.00

4.40

4.60

4.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

6.70

3.95

3.95

3.49

4.40

4.45

6.00

5.85

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

8.45

5.20

5.20

4.59

5.45

5.72

8.00

6.85

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

8.60

5.20

5.20

4.69

5.50

5.72

9.00

7.85

21. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

6.25

3.75

3.75

3.29

3.44

4.00

5.50

5.25

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

7.85

4.95

4.95

4.39

4.49

5.27

7.00

6.25

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
 Prices \$ _____

8.00

4.95

4.95

4.49

4.54

5.27

8.50

7.25

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

**22. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz
 Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton
 Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green FF logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty 25
 Price \$ _____

5.55

3.95

3.95

3.49

4.40

4.45

6.00

5.50

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

7.00

5.20

5.20

4.59

5.45

5.72

8.00

6.50

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

7.15

5.20

5.20

4.69

5.50

5.72

9.00

7.50

23. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

5.15

3.75

3.75

3.29

3.44

4.00

5.50

4.90

Size 2X Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

6.55

4.95

4.95

4.39

4.49

5.27

7.50

5.90

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

6.65

4.95

4.95

4.49

4.54

5.27

8.50

6.90

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773	Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828	Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721	All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314	Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741	American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811	Barker Specialty 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222	Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741
24. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____		3.95	3.95	3.69	4.27	4.30	6.00	5.50
25. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	5.75	3.75	3.75	3.49	3.31	3.86	5.50	4.90
26. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter Green FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	5.15	3.95	3.95	3.69	4.27	4.30	6.00	5.10
27. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	4.75	3.75	3.75	3.49	3.31	3.86	5.50	4.50
28. Do you charge for art charges _____ Yes _____ No	YES X 1	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	No Not Normally
29. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	40.00			0.00		0.00		
30. Are setup charges extra _____ Yes _____ No	YES	YES	YES	YES	NO	YES	NO	No
31. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	15.00/COLOR	25.00/COLOR/SIDE	25.00/COLOR/SIDE	25.00/COLOR		35.00		

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

A+ Uniforms
 3341 Bracken Fern Dr.
 Harmony, FL 34773

Adventures in Advertising
 Ad Specialists, Inc.
 2431 Fawnlake Trail
 Orlando, FL 32828

Adventures in Advertising
 Kreative Promotional Concepts
 3596 Rochelle Lane
 Apopka, FL 32721

All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles
 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G
 Davie, FL 33314

Alpha Specialties and Awards
 305 W. Bass St.
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

American Ad Spec
 3306 Maggie Blvd
 Orlando, FL 32811

Barker Specialty
 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222
 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222

Cambroc Sports
 3726 Grissom Ln
 Kissimmee, FL 34741

32. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

1-12 0%
 13-24 5%
 25-74 10%
 75-100 15%
 100+ 20%

GIVEN

ALREADY GIVEN

37-72
 73-143
 144-287
 288-575
 576+

DISCOUNTS ARE INCLUDED IN PRICE OF THE ITEM AT TIME ITEM IS QUOTED-BASED ON QUANTITY REQUESTED BY CUSTOMER

24-36
 37-48
 49-60
 61-72
 73-144
 145-288
 289-576
 577-1200
 1201-2400

72-144
 250-500
 750-1000

15-35
 36-71
 72-143
 144-287
 288-500
 500-100

33. Outer Banks 2112, Men's Pique Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical stripes on welt collar and cuff. Cuffs. 6.5 oz 100% Cotton Navy/Bimini/White color shirt LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print

Size S-XL Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

23.55

18.65

18.65

18.99

19.20

19.00

24.00

22.72

Size 2X Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

26.99

18.65

18.65

20.99

21.20

22.00

26.00

24.72

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773	Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828	Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721	All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314	Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741	American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811	Barker Speciality 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222	Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741
Size 3X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	29.93	18.65	18.65	21.99	22.55	23.00	27.00	26.72
34. SAME AS ABOVE								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	19.46	18.65	18.65	17.99	17.25	18.00	22.00	22.72
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	22.36	18.65	18.65	19.99	19.25	20.00	24.00	24.72
Size 3X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	24.84	18.65	18.65	20.99	20.60	22.00	25.00	26.72
35. Outer Banks 2113, Lady's Pique Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical stripes on collar. Y-neck, Welt Collar. Three-button clean finish welt packet Cuffs. 6.5 oz 100% Cotton Natural/Bimini/Navy color shirt LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	21.95 2X-24.88	16.65	16.65	18.99	18.20	18.00	23.00	21.90
36. SAME AS ABOVE NO PRICING								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	18.12	16.65	16.65	17.99	16.30	16.75	21.00	21.90
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	20.58	16.65	16.65	19.99	17.85	19.00	23.00	23.90

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773	Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828	Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721	All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314	Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741	American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811	Barker Speciality 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222	Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741
37. Jerzees J200, Men's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, Cuffs. 6.8 oz 100% Cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Forest Green Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	15.63	11.75	11.75	14.99	14.55	13.65	19.00	16.99
Size 2X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	19.10	13.95	13.95	16.99	16.45	16.00	21.00	18.99
Size 3X est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	19.29	13.95	13.95	17.99	16.50	16.50	22.00	20.99
38. SAME AS ABOVE								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	12.79	11.75	11.75	13.99	12.60	12.50	17.00	16.99
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	15.72	13.95	13.95	15.99	14.50	14.50	18.00	18.99
Size 3X Est. Qty 25 Prices \$ _____	15.88	13.95	13.95	16.99	14.55	15.00	20.00	20.99

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773	Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828	Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721	All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314	Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741	American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811	Barker Speciality 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222	Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741
39. Jerzees J200W Lady's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, 6.8 oz 100% cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Dark Lavender Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	15.63	14.75	14.75	14.99	14.55	14.75	19.00	16.99
Size 2X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	19.26	16.95	16.95	16.99	16.50	17.50	21.00	18.99
40. SAME AS ABOVE								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	12.79	14.75	14.75	13.99	12.60	12.50	17.00	16.99
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	15.88	16.95	16.95	15.99	14.55	15.00	19.00	18.99
41. Digitizing charges \$ _____	FIRST DESIGN IS FREE 35.00	0-50.00	0-50.00 STOCK LOGOS NO CHARGE	50.00	NO CHARGE	0.00		N/C For Standard School Logo \$15/Thousand Stitches
42. Are setup charges extra Yes _____ No _____	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO
43. If yes what is the charge \$ _____				0.00		0.00		

<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____</p>	<p>A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773</p>	<p>Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828</p>	<p>Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721</p>	<p>All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314</p>	<p>Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741</p>	<p>American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811</p>	<p>Barker Specialty 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222</p>	<p>Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741</p>
<p>44. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75) _____ _____ _____</p>	<p>1-6 5% 7-12 12% 13-23 15% 24-75 20%</p>	<p>GIVEN</p>	<p>ALREADY GIVEN</p>	<p>25-74 75-150 151-300 300+</p>	<p>DISCOUNTS ARE INCLUDED IN PRICE OF THE ITEM AT TIME ITEM IS QUOTED- BASED ON QUANTITY REQUESTED BY CUSTOMER</p>	<p>1-12 13-24 25-48 49-96 97-150 151-300 301-600 601-1200</p>	<p>24-72-144 250-500-750</p>	<p>1-7 22-143 144-288</p>
<p>45. What is your percentage mark-up of items (to include overhead, fringe, general and administrative, or any other elements of cost) percentage mark-up must be guaranteed throughout the term of this contract _____%</p>	<p>30.00%</p>	<p>15.00%</p>	<p>15.00%</p>	<p>16.00%</p>	<p>0.00%</p>	<p>23.00%</p>	<p>20.00%</p>	<p>From 10-30%</p>
<p>46. Delivery after receipt of Purchase Order and/or sign off of art work is different from Bid specifications _____ days</p>		<p>10 DAYS PER CUSTOMER REQUEST</p>	<p>10 DAYS</p>	<p>10 DAYS</p>	<p>15 DAYS FOR DELIVERY FOR EMBROIDERY</p>	<p>5-10 DAYS</p>	<p>10 DAYS FOR SCREEN-15-20 FOR EMBROIDERY</p>	<p>Est 20 Working Days</p>
<p>47. List "Your Bid or Quote Number" if required on each Purchase Order _____</p>		<p>YES</p>	<p>YES</p>			<p>YES</p>	<p>AB 100F</p>	<p>Quote Number</p>
<p>48. Minimum Order Amount if required \$ _____</p>	<p>NONE</p>	<p>NONE</p>	<p>SHIRTS-NO MIMIMUM- DEPENDS ON ITEM</p>	<p>NONE</p>		<p>NO MINIMUM</p>	<p>12 PIECES</p>	<p>N/A</p>

<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____</p>	<p>A+ Uniforms 3341 Bracken Fern Dr. Harmony, FL 34773</p>	<p>Adventures in Advertising Ad Specialists, Inc. 2431 Fawnlake Trail Orlando, FL 32828</p>	<p>Adventures in Advertising Kreative Promotional Concepts 3596 Rochelle Lane Apopka, FL 32721</p>	<p>All Seasons Uniforms & Textiles 3600 Hacienda Blvd., Suite G Davie, FL 33314</p>	<p>Alpha Specialties and Awards 305 W. Bass St. Kissimmee, FL 34741</p>	<p>American Ad Spec 3306 Maggie Blvd Orlando, FL 32811</p>	<p>Barker Specialty 27 Realty Drive, Caller Box 222 Cheshire, CT 06410-0222</p>	<p>Cambroc Sports 3726 Grissom Ln Kissimmee, FL 34741</p>
<p>49. Exclusions (if any) must be listed here _____ _____ _____</p>	<p>ADDITIONAL PRICE FOR BACK PRINTING ON SHIRTS</p>	<p>NO CHARGE STOCK LOGO-CUSTOM AVERAGE IS 40.00</p>	<p>N/A</p>		<p>N/A</p>	<p>NONE</p>		
<p>50. In State Service Representative: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ Fax # _____ Cellular # _____</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>
<p>51. Inside Sales contact if assigned Service Representative is unavailable: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ # _____ Cellular # _____ Fax _____</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>	<p>SEE BID</p>

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994	K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irls Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744	Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772	My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027	Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331	Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809	Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Debarment?	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
QUESTIONNAIRE? YES OR NO?	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Addenda?	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
PRICE SHEET								
1. 20oz bottle durable polycarbonate material w/easy carry screw top, Translucent Royal Blue w/Matching color Lid and rubber grip w/1-color yellow gold logo. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-48 Price \$ _____	K&R #S304BL 3.65	No Exact Item	Bulletline #SM6761 N/A	Hit Promo #5837 2.24	N/A	RCC Koozzie #832920 4.31	Hit Promotion #5837 4.25	N/B
2. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-144 Price \$ _____	3.45 Set- Up+40.00+Ship		4.05	2.14	N/A	4.04	3.78	N/B
3. Large Microfiber Portfolio with Embossed PVC Trim Size 10 3/8" W X 13 1/2" H Outside Zipper 8 card holders, elastic pen loop, 3 interior pockets one with a zipper and one mesh ID holder Royal Blue w/one color gold logo. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-20 Price \$ _____	Vitronic #V6100-6 25.00	Best Buy BPF2 8.98*	Nissin #5022 9.75	Hit Promo #6630 4.13	N/A	RCC Koozzie #832192 8.99	Hit Promotion #6630 7.98	N/B

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994	K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744	Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772	My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027	Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331	Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809	Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716
4. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-100 Price \$ _____	18.50 Setup+40.00+ Ship	7.70 *Prices do not include shipping due to differences in weight a firm price will be given at ordering	9.25	3.95	N/A	8.99	6.70	N/B
5. 11oz Colored Stoneware Mug with C- Handle. Almond Color with 1-color logo Hunter Green. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-144 Price \$ _____	Allen Mugs #A4920 1.99	Best Buy #BCM2000 .96*	CPI #6m605 1.66	Hit Promo #7125 .82	N/A	RCC Koozie #832888 1.30	Hit Promotion #7125-6 1.98	N/B
6. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-576 Price \$ _____	1.69 + Ship	.81*	1.31	0.79	N/A	1.12	1.48	N/B
7. Do you charge for art charges Yes _____ No _____	Yes	Yes	NO	Yes	N/A	Yes	No	N/B
8. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	\$55 Per Hour	Varies		32.00	N/A	\$40/hour		N/B
9. Are setup charges extra Yes _____ No _____	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	N/A	Yes	Yes	N/B
10. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	40.00	Varies See Catalog	Varies \$10-\$30	32.00	N/A	\$40/hour	32.00	N/B

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

11. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

144, 288, 432 +

50-99
 100-149
 150-249
 250-499
 500-999

Varies Per Item

N/A

72, 144, 288, 576, 1008

Free Shipping on all items with quantity of 100 pieces or more

N/A

12. Jerzees 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo

Size S-XL Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.00

4.75

5.25

5.25

TSC525
 Champion T-Shirts
 100% Pre-Shrunk Cotton
 6.1 oz
 5.20

8.48

3.58

4.00 = 100.00

Size 2X Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

7.50

5.75

6.25

6.86

5.20

10.34

4.60

5.40=135.00

Size 3X Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.00

5.75

7.25

7.96

5.20

10.34

4.70

5.40=135.00

13. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

5.75

4.25

4.75

4.74

5.20

5.75

3.45

4.00 = 300.00

Size 2X Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

7.25

5.25

5.75

5.94

5.20

7.61

4.50

5.40=405.00

Size 3X Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

7.75

5.25

6.75

7.49

5.20

7.61

4.60

5.40=405.00

14. Jerzees 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter Green FF logo

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

5.50

4.75

5.15

5.25

TSG200
 Gildan 100%
 Cotton 6.1 oz
 Sand-Closest to
 Khaki color
 5.40

8.48

3.58

4.00 = 100.00

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

7.00

5.75

6.15

6.86

5.40

10.34

4.60

5.40=135.00

Size 3X Est.. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

7.50

5.75

7.15

7.96

5.40

10.34

4.70

5.40=135.00

15. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
**PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
 PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY**
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

5.25

4.25

4.60

4.74

5.40

5.75

3.48

4.00 = 300.00

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

6.75

5.25

5.60

5.94

5.40

7.61

4.50

5.40=405.00

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75

7.25

5.25

6.60

7.49

5.40

7.61

4.60

5.40=405.00

16. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color White FF
 logo

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25

5.50

4.75

5.45

3.56

TSG200B-Youth
 4.95

8.03

3.88

4.00=100.00

17. SAME AS ABOVE
 Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

5.25

4.25

4.95

5.08

4.95

5.30

3.78

4.00=300.00

18. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green3 FF logo
 Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

5.35

4.75

5.35

6.56

TSG200B-Youth
 4.95

8.06

3.88

4.00=100.00

19. SAME AS ABOVE
 Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

5.10

4.25

4.75

5.08

4.95

5.30

3.78

4.00=300.00

20. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz
 Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton
 Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.50

4.75

5.45

5.67

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

8.87

3.95

4.06=101.50

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.00

5.75

6.45

7.21

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

10.70

4.80

6.00=150.00

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.50

5.75

7.45

8.42

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

10.70

4.90

6.00=150.00

21. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75
Price \$ _____

6.25

4.25

4.95

5.17

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

6.14

3.75

4.06=304.50

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

7.75

5.25

5.95

6.82

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

7.97

4.70

6.00=450.00

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
Prices \$ _____

8.28

5.25

6.95

7.95

TSG 200-Gildan
 5.40
 or TSC200
 Champion
 5.20

7.97

4.80

6.00=450.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

**22. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz
 Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton
 Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green FF logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty 25
Price \$ _____

6.00

4.75

5.35

5.67

TSG200G
 Gildan "Sand"
 Closest to Khaki
 5.40

8.87

3.95

4.06=101.50

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

7.50

5.75

6.35

7.21

TSG200G
 Gildan "Sand"
 Closest to Khaki
 5.40

10.70

4.80

6.00=150.00

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

8.00

5.75

7.35

8.42

TSG200G
 Gildan "Sand"
 Closest to Khaki
 5.40

10.70

4.90

6.00=150.00

23. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
Price \$ _____

5.75

4.25

4.85

5.17

5.40

6.14

3.75

4.06=304.50

Size 2X Est. Qty-75
Price \$ _____

7.25

5.25

5.85

6.82

5.40

7.97

4.70

6.00=450.00

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
Price \$ _____

7.75

5.25

6.85

7.92

5.40

7.97

4.80

6.00=450.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994	K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744	Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772	My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027	Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331	Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809	Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716
24. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	5.75	4.75	5.60	7.00	TSG200B- Yourh 4.95	8.87	4.18	4.06=101.50
25. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	5.50	4.25	5.05	5.46	4.95	6.14	4.33	4.06=304.50
26. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter Green FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	5.60	4.75	5.60	7.00	TSG200B- Yourh 4.95	10.70	4.18	4.06=101.50
27. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	5.35	4.25	5.05	5.46	4.95	7.97	4.08	4.06=304.50
28. Do you charge for art charges ____ Yes ____ No	NO	Yes/No	No	Yes	No	Yes	No	No
29. If yes what is the charge \$ _____		Depends on # of shirts \$35 for new designs. Free if # of shirts greater than 200		24.00/HR		\$40/hour		
30. Are setup charges extra ____ Yes ____ No	NO	No	No	Yes	No	No	Yes	Yes
31. If yes what is the charge \$ _____				10.00/Screen			15.00 per screen	10.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
**PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
 PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY**
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

**32. What discount quantity breaks do
 you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)**

72, 144, 299.
 432

96-143
 143-199
 200+

12-23
 24-47
 48-143
 144-287
 288-431
 432-576

36-71
 72-144
 145-299

Contact Sales
 Rep for pricing

24, 48, 72, 144,
 288, 500

Free shipping on
 all order of 100
 pieces or more

Minium Order is
 12 Pieces

**33. Outer Banks 2112, Men's Pique
 Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical
 stripes on welt collar and cuff. Cuffs. 6.5
 oz 100% Cotton Navy/Bimini/White
 color shirt LH embroidery logo w/
 department in block print, RH name in
 script print**

Size S-XL Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

30.00

23.95

21.95

48.25

See enclosed
 Neff Apparel
 Collection
 catalog for
 selection of
 sport shirts.
 Suggest
 SS8500
 Premier page
 11
 25.00

Min Qty 12
 21.50

28.95

17.95=89.75

Size 2X Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

32.00

25.95

22.95

49.90

25.00

21.50

28.95

21.40=107.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
**PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
 PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY**
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irlon Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

Size 3X Est. Qty-5 Price
 \$ _____

33.00

26.95

23.95

51.00

25.00

24.97

28.95

21.40=107.00

34. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____

25.00

21.95

19.95

44.15

25.00

21.50

23.95

16.80=420.00

Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____

27.00

23.95

20.95

45.80

25.00

21.50

24.75

20.00=500.00

Size 3X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____

28.00

24.95

21.95

46.90

25.00

24.97

26.25

20.00=500.00

35. Outer Banks 2113, Lady's Pique Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical stripes on collar. Y-neck, Welt Collar. Three-button clean finish welt packet Cuffs. 6.5 oz 100% Cotton Natural/Bimini/Navy color shirt LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____

30.00

21.95

18.40

46.27

Suggest
 SS8500
 Premier Page
 11
 25.00

Min Qty 12
 19.06

27.95

16.55=82.75

36. SAME AS ABOVE NO PRICING

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____

27.00

19.95

16.95

42.47

25.00

19.06

22.50

15.55=388.75

Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____

29.00

21.95

17.95

44.12

25.00

21.50

24.00

17.75=443.75

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Craig's Designs, Inc.
 832 SE NVC Hwy 1
 Stuart, FL 34994

K & M Custom Creations
 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy
 Kissimmee, FL 34744

Master's Design
 5700 Sweetheart Ct
 St Cloud, FL 34772

My Office Products
 111 Westwood Place
 Suite 305
 Brentwood, TN 37027

Neff Co
 645 Pine St
 Greenville, OH 45331

Office Depot
 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy
 Orlando, FL 32809

Plexus, Inc
 118 W New York Ave.
 Deland, FL 32720

Pride Enterprises
 12425 28th St N
 St Petersburg FL 33716

37. Jerzees J200, Men's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, Cuffs. 6.8 oz 100% Cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Forest Green Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print

Size S-XL Est. Qty-5
 Price \$ _____

27.00

15.95

14.95

39.01

See pg 12 of catalog SS150-"Performance" pique sport shirt 18.05

Min Qty 12 13.39

19.95

12.55=62.75

Size 2X Est. Qty-5
 Price \$ _____

30.00

17.95

15.95

40.66

18.05

17.18

21.95

15.55=77.75

Size 3X est. Qty-5
 Price \$ _____

30.00

17.95

15.95

41.76

18.05

17.18

22.95

15.55=77.75

38. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

25.00

13.95

12.95

36.30

18.05

13.39

18.95

12.00=300.00

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

27.00

15.95

13.95

37.95

18.05

17.18

19.95

15.00=375.00

Size 3X Est. Qty 25
 Prices \$ _____

28.00

15.95

13.95

39.05

18.05

17.18

20.95

15.00=375.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994	K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744	Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772	My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027	Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331	Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809	Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716
39. Jerzees J200W Lady's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, 6.8 oz 100% cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Dark Lavender Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	27.00	12.95	12.95	38.94	Page 12- Performance pique SS150 18.05	Min Qty 12 24.35	22.95	12.55=62.75
Size 2X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	29.00	14.95	13.95	40.59	18.05	27.09	24.65	15.55=77.75
40. SAME AS ABOVE								
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	27.00	11.95	10.95	36.25	18.05	22.55	19.95	12.00=300.00
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	29.00	13.95	11.95	37.90	18.05	25.29	21.70	15.00=375.00
41. Digitizing charges \$ _____	150.00	\$25 for new design	Varies by Stitch Count	125.00	N/C	\$80 up to 8,000 Stitches	12.00/mstitches	No
42. Are setup charges extra Yes _____ No _____	NO	NO	NO	NO	No	Yes	No	Yes
43. If yes what is the charge \$ _____						\$14/m stitches over 8,000 .40/m run charge		10.00

<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____</p>	<p>Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994</p>	<p>K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irl Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744</p>	<p>Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772</p>	<p>My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027</p>	<p>Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331</p>	<p>Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809</p>	<p>Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720</p>	<p>Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716</p>
<p>44. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75) _____ _____ _____</p>	<p>72+, 144+ Digitizing is free</p>	<p>96-143 144-199 200+</p>	<p>1-11 12-23 24-47 48-95 96-143 144</p>	<p>36-71 72-143 144-299</p>	<p>See enclosed catalog</p>	<p>Items 33-40 Price is same for all qtys</p>	<p>Free Digitizing on orders of 75 pieces or more sam design free shipping on orders of 100 pieces or more</p>	<p>No</p>
<p>45. What is your percentage mark-up of items (to include overhead, fringe, general and administrative, or any other elements of cost) percentage mark-up must be guaranteed throughout the term of this contract _____%</p>	<p>3.00%</p>	<p>50-100%</p>	<p>10-50 % Varies by Garment or Product</p>	<p>15.00%</p>	<p>0.00%</p>	<p>N/A</p>	<p>PPI</p>	<p>No-pricing will remain form per section 3.01 of the contract</p>
<p>46. Delivery after receipt of Purchase Order and/or sign off of art work is different from Bid specifications _____ days</p>	<p>14 Days</p>	<p>10 Days</p>	<p>10 Days</p>	<p>14-20 Days</p>	<p>20-25 Days</p>	<p>10 Business Days</p>	<p>21 days</p>	<p>10-20 working days for screenprint & embroidery</p>
<p>47. List "Your Bid or Quote Number" if required on each Purchase Order _____</p>	<p>Osceola</p>		<p>No</p>	<p>N/A</p>		<p>N/A</p>		<p>SDOC 06-105-LC</p>
<p>48. Minimum Order Amount if required \$ _____</p>	<p>N/A</p>		<p>None</p>	<p>12 Units/Design</p>	<p>N/A</p>	<p>N/A</p>	<p>Minimus order on sheets</p>	<p>48.00/12 pieces</p>

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Craig's Designs, Inc. 832 SE NVC Hwy 1 Stuart, FL 34994	K & M Custom Creations 2240 E Irlon Bronson Memorial Hwy Kissimmee, FL 34744	Master's Design 5700 Sweetheart Ct St Cloud, FL 34772	My Office Products 111 Westwood Place Place Suite 305 Brentwood, TN 37027	Neff Co 645 Pine St Greenville, OH 45331	Office Depot 1707 Orlando Cent Pkwy Orlando, FL 32809	Plexus, Inc 118 W New York Ave. Deland, FL 32720	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St N St Petersburg FL 33716
49. Exclusions (if any) must be listed here _____ _____ _____	Shipping Charges Extra		None			Prices Valid Until 12/31/06 Pg 430 Product Disclaimer Paper Proffs \$10 each ground shipping-standard		Screen Print Prices are for 1 color art
50. In State Service Representative: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ Fax # _____ Cellular # _____	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID
51. Inside Sales contact if assigned Service Representative is unavailable: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ Fax # _____ # _____ Cellular # _____	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID *

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES
Debarment?	YES	YES	YES
QUESTIONNAIRE? YES OR NO?	YES	YES	YES
Addenda?	YES	YES	YES
PRICE SHEET			
1. 20oz bottle durable polycarbonate material w/easy carry screw top, Translucent Royal Blue w/Matching color Lid and rubber grip w/1-color yellow gold logo. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-48 Price \$ _____	Hit Promotional Products #5837 4.54	4.58	Hit #5837 3.664
2. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-144 Price \$ _____	4.08	4.26	Hit #5837 3.24
3. Large Microfiber Portfolio with Embossed PVC Trim Size 10 3/8" W X 13 1/2" H Outside Zipper 8 card holders, elastic pen loop, 3 interior pockets one with a zipper and one mesh ID holder Royal Blue w/one color gold logo. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-20 Price \$ _____	12-1/4"W X 10"H Logomark #KP4206N 50 QTY 10.21 See Exclusions page 24	8.47	Hit #6637 6.776

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
4. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-100 Price \$ _____	8.28	7.87	6.30
5. 11oz Colored Stoneware Mug with C-Handle. Almond Color with 1-color logo Hunter Green. Mfg _____ Item # _____ Est. Qty-144 Price \$ _____	Hit Promotional Products #7125-6 1.68	1.69	Hit #7125 1.352
6. SAME AS ABOVE Est. Qty-576 Price \$ _____	1.52	1.57	1.26
7. Do you charge for art charges ____ Yes ____ No	Yes	Yes	No
8. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	60.00/hour	50.00	
9. Are setup charges extra ____ Yes ____ No	Yes	Yes	Yes
10. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	40.00	50.00	35.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

11. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

Varies with item ordered

12. Jerzees 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo

Size S-XL Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

4.99

7.84

4.52

Size 2X Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.53

9.44

5.95

Size 3X Est Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.59

9.44

6.00

13. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

4.80

5.84

3.92

Size 2X Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

6.29

7.44

5.34

Size 3X Est Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

6.35

7.44

5.40

**14. Jerseys 29M, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6
 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green FF logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

4.37

7.84

4.52

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

5.91

9.44

5.95

Size 3X Est.. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

5.97

9.44

6.00

15. SAME AS ABOVE

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
Size S-XL Est. Qty-75	4.20	5.84	3.92
Size S-XL Est. Qty-75	5.69	7.44	5.34
Size S-XL Est. Qty-75	5.75	7.44	5.40
16. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Red Color w/ 1-color White FF logo			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25	4.86	7.48	4.40
17. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	4.68	8.48	4.40
18. Jerzees 29B, Heavyweight 50/50 5.6 oz Tee. Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter Green3 FF logo Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	4.23	7.48	4.40
19. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____	4.08	5.48	4.40
20. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo			

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

Size S-XL Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

5.29

8.16

4.79

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

6.74

10.36

6.14

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

6.86

10.36

6.25

21. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est. Qty-75
 Price \$ _____

5.09

6.16

4.19

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
 Price \$ _____

6.49

8.36

5.53

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
 Prices \$ _____

6.61

8.36

5.64

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

**22. Gildan 2000 Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz
 Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton
 Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter
 Green FF logo**

Size S-XL Est. Qty 25
Price \$ _____

4.66

8.16

4.79

Size 2X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.12

10.36

6.14

Size 3X Est. Qty-25
Price \$ _____

6.24

10.36

6.25

23. SAME AS ABOVE

Size S-XL Est Qty-75
Price \$ _____

4.49

6.16

4.19

Size 2X Est. Qty-75
Price \$ _____

5.89

8.36

5.53

Size 3X Est. Qty-75
Price \$ _____

6.01

8.36

5.64

<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____</p>	<p>Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940</p>	<p>The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743</p>	<p>The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751</p>
<p>24. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Red Color w/ 1-color white FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____</p>	5.12	7.86	4.64
<p>25. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____</p>	4.93	5.86	4.64
<p>26. Gildan 2000B Ultra Cotton, 6.1 oz Heavyweight 100% Preshrunk cotton Tee Khaki Color w/ 1-color Hunter Green FF logo Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____</p>	4.50	7.86	4.64
<p>27. SAME AS ABOVE Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-75 Price \$ _____</p>	4.33	5.86	4.64
<p>28. Do you charge for art charges _____ Yes _____ No</p>	Yes	Yes	No
<p>29. If yes what is the charge \$ _____</p>	60.00/hour	40.00	
<p>30. Are setup charges extra _____ Yes _____ No</p>	Yes	Yes	No
<p>31. If yes what is the charge \$ _____</p>	25.00 Per location and color	30.00	

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

32. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

144
 216
 288

12-74
 75-200
 201-325

See Attached Sheet

33. Outer Banks 2112, Men's Pique Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical stripes on welt collar and cuff. Cuffs. 6.5 oz 100% Cotton Navy/Bimini/White color shirt LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print

Size S-XL Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

29.80

21.00

24.85

Size 2X Est. Qty-5
Price \$ _____

32.51

23.00

27.45

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-06-105-LC**
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **7/26/06@2:00PM**
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

Size 3X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	34.88	24.00	29.70
34. SAME AS ABOVE			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	26.64	25.00	23.80
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	29.43	28.00	26.35
Size 3X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	31.28	29.00	28.50
35. Outer Banks 2113, Lady's Pique Sport Shirt w/ contrasting nautical stripes on collar. Y-neck, Welt Collar. Three-button clean finish welt packet Cuffs. 6.5 oz 100% Cotton Natural/Bimini/Navy color shirt LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print Sizes S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	29.12	N/A	23.60
36. SAME AS ABOVE NO PRICING			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	26.33	27.50	22.65
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	28.19	28.50	24.80

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-06-105-LC PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
37. Jerzees J200, Men's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, Cuffs. 6.8 oz 100% Cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Forest Green Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	25.74	17.50	18.90
Size 2X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	27.77	19.00	21.60
Size 3X est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	29.80	19.50	21.80
38. SAME AS ABOVE			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	22.92	13.00	18.10
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	24.47	15.00	20.75
Size 3X Est. Qty 25 Prices \$ _____	26.33	15.50	20.90

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
39. Jerzees J200W Lady's Cotton Pique Sport Shirt, 6.8 oz 100% cotton Taped welt collar and welt cuff. Dark Lavender Color LH embroidery logo w/ department in block print, RH name in script print			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	25.74	17.00	18.90
Size 2X Est. Qty-5 Price \$ _____	27.77	19.50	21.60
40. SAME AS ABOVE			
Size S-XL Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	22.92	N/A	18.10
Size 2X Est. Qty-25 Price \$ _____	24.47	N/a	20.75
41. Digitizing charges \$ _____	0.00	40.00	
42. Are setup charges extra Yes _____ No _____	Yes	No	No
43. If yes what is the charge \$ _____	\$25 to \$40	0.00	

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-06-105-LC
 PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 7/26/06@2:00PM
PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN
PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____

Promotional & Advertising
 Products
 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104
 Melbourne, FL 32940

The Kissimmee Scorpions
 Unlimited
 3291 Amberly Park Circle
 Kissimmee, FL 34743

The Sunshine Group
 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue
 Maitland, FL 32751

44. What discount quantity breaks do you offer (example 1-25, 26-75)

1-25 as quoted
 26-75 Depends on Garment

1-24
 25-100
 101-175

75 Pieces Up
 Less 5%

45. What is your percentage mark-up of items (to include overhead, fringe, general and administrative, or any other elements of cost) percentage mark-up must be guaranteed throughout the term of this contract _____%

65.00%

5%
 Of Total

10.20%

46. Delivery after receipt of Purchase Order and/or sign off of art work is different from Bid specifications _____ days

We can meet Bid specifications

10-15 days

7-10 Days

47. List "Your Bid or Quote Number" if required on each Purchase Order _____

None Required

N/A

N/A

48. Minimum Order Amount if required \$ _____

100.00

N/A

N/A

TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-06-105-LC</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>7/26/06@2:00PM</u> <u>PROMOTIONAL ITEMS, SCREEN</u> <u>PRINTING AND EMBROIDERY</u> READ BY: _____ RECORDED BY: _____	Promotional & Advertising Products 3270 Suntree Blvd., #104 Melbourne, FL 32940	The Kissimmee Scorpions Unlimited 3291 Amberly Park Circle Kissimmee, FL 34743	The Sunshine Group 1443 B South Orlandon Avenue Maitland, FL 32751
49. Exclusions (if any) must be listed here _____ _____ _____	The item in Part A, Item 3, is not available through ASI, as described. A similar item is substituted. Please note quantity change		
50. In State Service Representative: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ Fax # _____ Cellular # _____	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID
51. Inside Sales contact if assigned Service Representative is unavailable: Name _____ Address _____ City _____ Email _____ Phone _____ # _____ Cellular # _____ Fax	SEE BID	SEE BID	SEE BID