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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES NO BID YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES NO BID YES YES NOT SIGNED YES
PRICE SHEET NO BID
LOT 1-Equipment Rack, Lowell Cabinet 
"ONLY"-(Mfg. Phone #314-257-3400) NO BID

1. Model # L260-77                                     
77" Rack w/Door                                        
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Model # L15-310                                     
3.5" Shelf                                                    
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Model # L5-191                                       
1.75" Perforated Panel (1 rack unit)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____               

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Model # L5-193                                       
3.5" Perforated Panel (2 rack units)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____  

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. Model # L5-193                                     
3.5" Blank Panel                                         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       
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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form
PRICE SHEET
LOT 1-Equipment Rack, Lowell Cabinet 
"ONLY"-(Mfg. Phone #314-257-3400)
1. Model # L260-77                                     
77" Rack w/Door                                        
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
2. Model # L15-310                                     
3.5" Shelf                                                    
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
3. Model # L5-191                                       
1.75" Perforated Panel (1 rack unit)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____               
4. Model # L5-193                                       
3.5" Perforated Panel (2 rack units)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____  

5. Model # L5-193                                     
3.5" Blank Panel                                         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       
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YES YES
YES YES

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

6. Model # U180                                          
AC Strip                                                      
Est Qty-9                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7. Model # L35-1912                                   
Fan Panel assembly w/guards                 
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8. LOT 1-Total $_____ NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ALTERNATE
LOT1-Equipment Rack, Middle Atlantic 
Cabinet "ONLY"-ERK Series 19" Stand 
Alone/Gangable Rack

1a. Model # ERK-4420-LRD & ERK-VRD-
44                                                                 
77" Rack w/Door                                        
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

401.50 505.00 NO BID 404.70 488.00 550.00 422.25

2a. Model # U2                                            
3.5" Shelf                                                    
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

30.75 42.00 NO BID 27.65 36.00 42.00 30.78

3a. Model # VT1                                          
1.75" Perforated Panel (1 rack unit)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____               

7.30 11.25 NO BID 6.25 8.50 13.00 8.97
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

6. Model # U180                                          
AC Strip                                                      
Est Qty-9                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
7. Model # L35-1912                                   
Fan Panel assembly w/guards                 
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
8. LOT 1-Total $_____
ALTERNATE
LOT1-Equipment Rack, Middle Atlantic 
Cabinet "ONLY"-ERK Series 19" Stand 
Alone/Gangable Rack

1a. Model # ERK-4420-LRD & ERK-VRD-
44                                                                 
77" Rack w/Door                                        
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
2a. Model # U2                                            
3.5" Shelf                                                    
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
3a. Model # VT1                                          
1.75" Perforated Panel (1 rack unit)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____               
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NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

680.40 463.30

29.50 33.90

10.71 7.63
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

4a. Model # VT2                                          
3.5" Perforated Panel (2 rack units)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____  

9.45 13.00 NO BID 7.55 10.30 14.00 8.81

5a.Model # EB2-193                                   
3.5" Blank Panel                                         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

6.35 8.75 NO BID 5.25 7.20 10.00 6.13

6a. Model # PD-615C                                 
AC Strip                                                      
Est Qty-9                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      

65.00 71.50 NO BID 59.50 77.80 70.00 66.22

7. Model # (1) ERK-4FT                              
Fan Panel assembly w/guards                 
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
Model # (3) FANS, &                                  
Est Qty-12                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
Model # (3) GUARDS                                 
Est Qty-12                                                   

ERK-4FT  20.25  
***             

FANS 28.50     
***             

GUARDS  3.50

299.75 NO BID

ERK-4FT  18.80  
***             

FANS  26.55     
***             

GUARDS  2.98   

ERK-4FT  24.30   
***              

FAN  11.58      
***              

GUARDS  103.00

ERK-4FT   30.00  
***             

FANS  35.00     
***             

GUARDS  5.00

ERK-4FT   20.93  
***             

FANS  29.54     
***             

GUARDS  3.32

8a. ALTERNATE LOT 1-Total                    
$_____ 3733.02 5362.50 NO BID 3517.86 5364.36 5010.00 3856.82

LOT 2-Modulators/Combiner-Blonder-
Tongue "ONLY"
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

4a. Model # VT2                                          
3.5" Perforated Panel (2 rack units)         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____  

5a.Model # EB2-193                                   
3.5" Blank Panel                                         
Est Qty-20                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
6a. Model # PD-615C                                 
AC Strip                                                      
Est Qty-9                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
7. Model # (1) ERK-4FT                              
Fan Panel assembly w/guards                 
Est Qty-4                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
Model # (3) FANS, &                                  
Est Qty-12                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
Model # (3) GUARDS                                 
Est Qty-12                                                   
8a. ALTERNATE LOT 1-Total                    
$_____
LOT 2-Modulators/Combiner-Blonder-
Tongue "ONLY"

W
at

so
n 

In
du

st
rie

s,
 In

c.
   

   
   

   
   

 
10

56
 N

E
 P

in
e 

Is
la

nd
 R

d.
   

   
   

   
 

C
ap

e 
C

or
al

, F
L 

33
90

9 

W
H

 L
og

is
tic

s,
 In

c.
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
98

50
 R

ee
ve

s 
R

oa
d 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
Ta

m
pa

, F
L 

33
61

9 

13.72 9.04

7.92 6.78

84.77 78.54

ERK-4FT  31.40  
***             

FANS  17.17     
***             

GUARDS  3.95

ERK-4FT  32.54  
***             

FANS  32.26     
***             

GUARDS  4.50

5100.57 4278.34
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

9. Model # BIDA-450-30                             
Amplifier                                                     
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      

272.25 291.25 NO BID 269.47 272.75 299.00 261.08

10. Model # OC                                           
16 Channel Combiner                                
Est Qty-10                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

270.00 289.10 NO BID 266.22 269.50 295.00 257.93

11. Model # ZDM                                        
806 Agile Demodulator                              
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

165.00 174.60 NO BID 159.00 161.00 176.00 154.04

12. Model # MAVM-861-2                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

13. Model # MAVM-861-3                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

14. Model # MAVM-861-4                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

15. Model # MAVM-861-5                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

9. Model # BIDA-450-30                             
Amplifier                                                     
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____                                      
10. Model # OC                                           
16 Channel Combiner                                
Est Qty-10                                                   
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
11. Model # ZDM                                        
806 Agile Demodulator                              
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
12. Model # MAVM-861-2                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
13. Model # MAVM-861-3                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
14. Model # MAVM-861-4                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
15. Model # MAVM-861-5                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
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NO BID 315.00

NO BID 313.01

NO BID 186.45

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

16. Model # MAVM-861-6                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

17. Model # MAVM-861-7                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

18. Model # MAVM-861-T7                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

19. Model # MAVM-861-8                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

20. Model # MAVM-861-9                    
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

21. Model # MAVM-861-10                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

22. Model # MAVM-861-11                       
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

16. Model # MAVM-861-6                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
17. Model # MAVM-861-7                           
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
18. Model # MAVM-861-T7                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
19. Model # MAVM-861-8                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
20. Model # MAVM-861-9                    
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
21. Model # MAVM-861-10                        
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
Total Cost-$_____
22. Model # MAVM-861-11                       
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
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NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

23. Model # MAVM-861-12                  
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

24. Model # MAVM-861-13                      
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

25. Model # MAVM-861-14                         
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

370.00 384.25 NO BID 357.93 362.00 397.00 346.79

26. Model # DSV #4375                              
Diplex Splitter                                            
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

30.75 39.85 NO BID 29.34 29.70 35.00 28.43

27. Model # SXRS-2                                   
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

1.50 7.33 NO BID 1.07 1.14 1.48 1.04

28. Model # SXRS-4                                  
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.75 8.25 NO BID 1.95 2.08 2.65 1.89

29. Model # SXRS-8                                   
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

3.75 9.10 NO BID 2.80 3.00 3.80 2.72
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

23. Model # MAVM-861-12                  
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

24. Model # MAVM-861-13                      
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

25. Model # MAVM-861-14                         
Modulator                                                   
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

26. Model # DSV #4375                              
Diplex Splitter                                            
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

27. Model # SXRS-2                                   
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

28. Model # SXRS-4                                  
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

29. Model # SXRS-8                                   
Coaxial Splitter                                          
Est Qty-2                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
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NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 424.82

NO BID 36.73

NO BID 1.24

NO BID 2.43

NO BID 3.33
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

30. Model # SRT-4A (1194-8)                     
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

31. Model # SRT-4A (1194-11)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

32. Model # SRT-4A (1194-14)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

33. Model # SRT-4A (1194-17)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

34. Model # SRT-4A (1194-20)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

35. Model # SRT-4A (1194-23)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

36. Model # SRT-4A (1194-26)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

30. Model # SRT-4A (1194-8)                     
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

31. Model # SRT-4A (1194-11)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

32. Model # SRT-4A (1194-14)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

33. Model # SRT-4A (1194-17)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

34. Model # SRT-4A (1194-20)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

35. Model # SRT-4A (1194-23)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

36. Model # SRT-4A (1194-26)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       
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NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

37. Model # SRT-4A (1194-29)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

38. Model # SRT-4A (1194-32)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

39. Model # SRT-4A (1194-35)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

2.55 8.70 NO BID 2.44 2.47 3.28 2.36

40. Model # CAP-60-S/V T7                       
to Channel 7 Heterodyne Processor        
Est. Qty-2                                                    
Unit Cost-$_____                        

900.00 882.15 NO BID 831.10 841.00 930.00 805.22

41. LOT 2-TOTAL $_____ 16,678.75 NO BID 16,204.11 16,394.09 18,022.86 15,699.50
LOT 3-Adaptors "F" type barrels "OR 
EQUAL" List Manufacturer
42. Female "F" to Male RCA Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        NO BID 1.10 NO BID 0.18 0.69 NO BID NO BID

43. Female "F" to Male BNC Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        

GILBERT 
#004670       6.25 1.70 NO BID 0.30 0.95 NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

37. Model # SRT-4A (1194-29)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

38. Model # SRT-4A (1194-32)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

39. Model # SRT-4A (1194-35)                   
Directional Coupler                                   
Est Qty-5                                                     
Unit Cost-$_____                                       

40. Model # CAP-60-S/V T7                       
to Channel 7 Heterodyne Processor        
Est. Qty-2                                                    
Unit Cost-$_____                        

41. LOT 2-TOTAL $_____
LOT 3-Adaptors "F" type barrels "OR 
EQUAL" List Manufacturer
42. Female "F" to Male RCA Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        

43. Female "F" to Male BNC Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        
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NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 3.01

NO BID 988.75

NO BID 19,192.62

1.06 0.32

1.74 0.45
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-031-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

44. Female RCA to Male "F" Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        NO BID 1.30 NO BID 0.18 0.35 NO BID NO BID

45. Female RCA to Male BNC Adaptors  
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        NO BID 1.30 NO BID 0.23 1.07 0.99 NO BID

46. Allen Tel #GBNC60 RG59 Screw On 
Connectors or equal                                  
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-200                                                 
Unit Cost $_____                                        

EMERSON  
#084423       0.85 3.80 NO BID 4.20 / C 0.71 NO BID NO BID

47. Belden #543945 RG59 Coaxial 
Cable, or equal                                           
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-2000'                                              
Unit Cost $_____                                        

155.00 / 1000' 173.00 NO BID 212.50 / 1000' 0.172 NO BID NO BID

48. Thomas & Betts #SNS6 Snap-N-Seal 
RG6 "F" Connectors ONLY                       
Est. Qty-200                                             
Unit Cost $_____                        

0.55 1.25 NO BID 0.39 0.33 NO BID NO BID

49. LOT 3-Total $_____                              1,626.00 NO BID 555.90 705.00 NO BID
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DATE/TIME: 9/28/06@2:00PM                
CATV DISTRIBUTION SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS                        
READ BY:  LAURA ELAM           
RECORDED BY:  LISA KESECKER       

44. Female RCA to Male "F" Adaptors     
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        

45. Female RCA to Male BNC Adaptors  
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-50                                                   
Unit Cost $_____                                        

46. Allen Tel #GBNC60 RG59 Screw On 
Connectors or equal                                  
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-200                                                 
Unit Cost $_____                                        

47. Belden #543945 RG59 Coaxial 
Cable, or equal                                           
Mfg.__________                                         
Est Qty-2000'                                              
Unit Cost $_____                                        

48. Thomas & Betts #SNS6 Snap-N-Seal 
RG6 "F" Connectors ONLY                       
Est. Qty-200                                             
Unit Cost $_____                        

49. LOT 3-Total $_____                              
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1.25 0.32

1.25 0.37

1.81 0.07

408.00 0.31

NO BID 0.55

 817.00
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