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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Insurance Documentation YES YES YES YES NO NO YES NO
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Catalogs YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
1. Discount off Supplies ________%

40% 54% 5 TO 20% 5% 40% 15% 53.10% 30%

2. Discount off Equipment ________%

40%

33% TO 
INCLUDE 
OFFICE 

ACCESSORIE
S AND ALL 

BOARDS AND 
EASELS

5 TO 60% 5% 25% 7% 33.10% 30%

3. Discount off Copier Toner/Cartridges 
________% 40% 15% 5 TO 20% 5% 30% 15% 28.10% NO BID

4. Discount off Printer Cartridges 
_________% 40% 28% 5 TO 20% 5% 30% 15% 28.10% NO BID

5. Discount off Fax Machine 
Toner/Cartridges _________% 40% 28% 5 TO 20% 5% 30% 15% 28.10% NO BID

6. Discount off Typewriter Ribbons, 
Correction Tape/Cartridges 
_________%

40% 32% NO INKS 
OR TONERS 5 TO 20% 5% 35% 15% 28.10% NO BID

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-07-065 KB                   
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 01/31/07@1:00PM              
CATALOG BID FOR OFFICE 
SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT              
READ BY:____Kathy Brown   _
RECORDED BY:__Laura Elam__
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DATE/TIME: 01/31/07@1:00PM              
CATALOG BID FOR OFFICE 
SUPPLIES AND EQUIPMENT              
READ BY:____Kathy Brown   _
RECORDED BY:__Laura Elam__

7. Discount off Office Machines 
(Copiers, Fax Machines, Etc.) 
_________%

40% 5% 5 TO 20% 5% 25% 7% 18.10% NO BID

8. Exclusions/Exceptions 
_________________________________

NONE

IF FURNITURE 
ORDERED, 

ADDITIONAL 
DELIVERY 

AND SET UP 
CHARGES 

MAY APPLY

N/A 

ORDERS 
OVER $200.00-

FREE 
FREIGHT, 
ORDERS 
UNDER 

$200.00-$10.45 
FRIEGHT 
EXCEPT 

FURNITURE, 
ALL 

FURNITURE 
WII BE 

CHARGED 
16% FREIGHT. 
EXCEPTIONS 
INCLUDE-ANY 

MAIL IN 
REBATES, 

FREE 
FREIGHT 

CUPONS, AND 
PROMOTIONA

L PRICING.  
WE DO NOT 

PROVIDE 
INSTALLATION 
OR SET UP OF 

ANY KIND.

NONE

SECURITY 
PRODUCTS 

MANUFACTUR
ED 3M 

TATTLE, 
CHECKPOINT, 
BIBLIOTECH, 

SPECIAL 
ORDERS, 

SOFTWARE, 
LIFE SECURE, 
PEEK A BOOK, 
LIBRAMATION, 

CELL ZONE, 
CUSTOM SET 

UP FEES. 

FURNITURE 
33.1%         

KODAK, HP, 
PHOTO/SPECI
ALTY PAPER

ONLY 
PRODUCTS 

ON 
ENCLOSED 

PRICE 
SHEETS
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OTHER BIDS, 
SALE 

CATALOGS, 
OR OTHER 

PROMOTIONS 
AND 

SPECIALS.  IN 
THE EVENT A 
SALE PRICE IS 
LOWER THAN 

YOUR 
DISCOUNTED 
PRICE, YOU 

WILL BE 
GIVEN THE 

BEST PRICE.  
EXPRESS 

SHIPPING IS 
NOT 

INCLUDED.  
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9. Minimum order amount (if applicable)
$___________

$25.00 NONE $0.00 N/A $0.01 $50.00 $25.00 NET $15.00

10. Quote or Contract number (if 
applicable) ____________ 07-065KB N/A 07-065KB NONE C73084 SDOC 07-065 

KB N/A

11. Other entities may piggy-back off 
this bid ______yes ______no YES YES YES YES NO NO YES YES

12. Collusion YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
13. Name, address, phone and fax 
number of local representative:               
_________________________________   
_________________________________   
_________________________________   

YES YES NO  YES YES YES YES
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5% ON 
LEARNING 
MATERIALS 
(PAGES 298-
457) IN 2007 
CATALOG.
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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Insurance Documentation
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form
Catalogs
PRICE SHEET
1. Discount off Supplies ________%

2. Discount off Equipment ________%

3. Discount off Copier Toner/Cartridges 
________%
4. Discount off Printer Cartridges 
_________%
5. Discount off Fax Machine 
Toner/Cartridges _________%
6. Discount off Typewriter Ribbons, 
Correction Tape/Cartridges 
_________%
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PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
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CATALOG BID FOR OFFICE 
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YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
NO NO NO YES YES NO NO YES
YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
YES YES NO (CD) YES NO YES YES YES

2% 8% 20% 55% 20% 66% 59% 54%

2% 8% 30% 30% 20% 41% 35% 34%

2% N/A 10% 32% 20% 36% 35% 30%

2% N/A 10% 32% 20% 36% 35% 30%

2% N/A 10% 32% 20% 36% 35% 30%

2% N/A 20% 33% 36% 40% 40%
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7. Discount off Office Machines 
(Copiers, Fax Machines, Etc.) 
_________%
8. Exclusions/Exceptions 
_________________________________

G
lo

ba
l G

ov
t E

du
ca

tio
n 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
69

90
 U

S
 R

T 
36

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
Fl

et
ch

er
, O

H
 4

53
26

H
ig

hs
m

ith
, I

nc
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
W

55
27

 H
w

y 
10

6 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
Fo

rt 
A

tk
in

so
n,

 W
I 5

35
38

IK
O

N
 O

ffi
ce

 S
ol

ut
io

ns
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

26
00

 L
ak

e 
Lu

ci
en

 D
r, 

S
te

 1
00

   
   

   
   

   
M

ai
tla

nd
, F

L 
32

75
1

M
y 

O
ffi

ce
 P

ro
du

ct
s 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 
18

78
 L

ak
e 

H
ill 

C
irc

le
 S

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

81
8

N
or

th
 A

m
er

ic
an

 O
ffi

ce
 S

ol
ut

io
ns

   
   

   
  

63
14

 K
in

gs
po

in
te

 P
kw

y 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
S

ui
te

 1
07

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
81

9

O
ffi

ce
 D

ep
ot

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

17
07

 O
rla

nd
o 

C
en

tra
l P

kw
y 

   
   

   
   

   
  

S
ui

te
 1

00
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

80
9

O
ffi

ce
 M

ax
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

18
01

 C
yp

re
ss

 L
ak

e 
D

r. 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
83

7

P
at

te
rs

on
's

 O
ffi

ce
 S

up
pl

y,
 In

c.
   

   
   

   
  

37
22

 G
ris

so
m

 L
an

e 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
K

is
si

m
m

ee
, F

L 
34

74
1

2% 8% 30% 20% 20% 39% 30% 23%

IF PRICE 
LEVEL 

SHOULD 
INCREASE, 

WE RESERVE 
THE RIGHT TO 

INCREASE 
THE PRICING.  

DOES NOT 
INCLUDE 
INSIDE 

DELIVERY 
UNLOADING 

AND 
ASSEMBLY.  

OTHER 
DISCOUNTS, 

BIDS, 
LIBRARYSPAR
KS MAGAZINE, 
3M SECURITY 
PRODUCTS, 

SALE 
CATALOGS, 
EDUPRESS, 

MIND SPARKS, 
INTERACT 

AND ORDERS 
ALREADY IN 
PROGRESS.  

NONE N/A

FURNITURE, 
DATED 

GOODS, 
PAPER, 

TELEPHONES, 
PDA'S, 

HEADSETS, 
AND SEATING

CUSTOM 
ITEMS
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9. Minimum order amount (if applicable)
$___________

10. Quote or Contract number (if 
applicable) ____________

11. Other entities may piggy-back off 
this bid ______yes ______no
12. Collusion
13. Name, address, phone and fax 
number of local representative:               
_________________________________   
_________________________________   
_________________________________   
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$200.00 FOR 
FREE 

FREIGHT

$200.00 FOR 
FREE 

SHIPPING AND 
HANDLING. 
ADDITIONAL 
CHARGES 

FOR INSIDE 
DELIVERY, 
LIFTGATE 

DELIVERY OR 
PRIOR 

NOTIFICATION 
WILL BE PRE-

PAID AND 
ADDED TO 
INVOICE.  

$0.00 N/A $0.00

$1.00 SERVICE 
CHARGE FOR 

ORDERS 
UNDER $50.00

SDOC 07-065 
KB TICKET 

7763
195064.00 N/A N/A 600-340-06-1 N/A 378342

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
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ALSO 
OFFERING 

THE OFFICE 
MAX RETAIL 
CONNECT 

CARD
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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Insurance Documentation
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form
Catalogs
PRICE SHEET
1. Discount off Supplies ________%

2. Discount off Equipment ________%

3. Discount off Copier Toner/Cartridges 
________%
4. Discount off Printer Cartridges 
_________%
5. Discount off Fax Machine 
Toner/Cartridges _________%
6. Discount off Typewriter Ribbons, 
Correction Tape/Cartridges 
_________%
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YES YES YES YES
YES NO NO NO
YES YES YES YES
YES YES YES NO

25% FOR ALL 
IN STOCK 

CONSUMABLE 
SUPPLIES

10% 15% 10%

10% FOR      
NON-STOCK, 
FURNITURE 

AND 
EQUIPMENT, 
INDICATED IN 

CATALOG 
WITH AN 8 

DIGIT NUMBER 
ENDING IN 

THE LETTER 
"N".

10% 10% 5%

25% 10% 15% 5%

25% 10% N/A 5%

25% 10% N/A 5%

25% 10% 15% 5%
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7. Discount off Office Machines 
(Copiers, Fax Machines, Etc.) 
_________%
8. Exclusions/Exceptions 
_________________________________
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10% 0% 10% 5%

WILL DO OUR 
BEST TO 

HOLD OUR 
PRICES 

THROUGHOUT 
THE YEAR 

BUT CANNOT 
GUARANTEE 

THIS.  IF A 
PRODUCT IS 
DISPLAYED 

OR 
DESCRIBED 

IMPROPERLY, 
WE WILL 

ATTEMPT TO 
NOTIFY YOU 

BEFORE 
PROCESSING 

ORDER. 
INSTALLATION 

BY OWNER.

OFFICE 
FURNITURE, 

OFFICE 
MACHINES, 
COMPUTER 

HARDWARE/S
OFTWARE, 

SALE ITEMS, 
SPECIAL 

ORDERS, AND 
QUILL 

SPECIAL 
ORDER 

CATALOG. 
OTHER 

DISCOUNTS, 
CUPONS OR 

PROMOTIONS

3M, OR 
CHECKPOINT 

SECURITY 
ITEMS, ROLL 
LAMINATORS, 

OTHER 
SPECIAL 
OFFERS, 

PROMOTIONS 
OR CUPONS, 

PRODUCT 
TRAINING, LAB 

FEES FOR 
PRODUCT 
TESTING, 

INSTALLATION 
OF 

EQUIPMENT/F
URNITURE, 

DISPOSAL OF 
TRASH, 

SHIPPING 
CHARGES 
WILL BE 

ADDED TO 
INVOICES.  
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9. Minimum order amount (if applicable)
$___________

10. Quote or Contract number (if 
applicable) ____________

11. Other entities may piggy-back off 
this bid ______yes ______no
12. Collusion
13. Name, address, phone and fax 
number of local representative:               
_________________________________   
_________________________________   
_________________________________   
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N/A

NONE, 
ADDITIONAL 

CHARGE FOR 
INSIDE 

DELIVERY, 
INSTALLATION
/SET UP NOT 
INCLUDED.  

$50.00 $100.00

2007190113AP 07-87         
ACCT # 129372 BID07SP WTR-CB0SE

YES NO YES YES

YES YES YES YES

YES YES NO YES
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30% OFF ALL 
ADVANTAGE 
PRODUCTS, 
635 BOOK 

TAPE, BEAR 
HUG 

BOOKENDS.  
25% OFF 

BOOK 
POCKETS, 

BOOK 
JACKETS, 

BOOK CARDS, 
CATALOG 

CARDS, LABEL 
PROTECTORS, 

BIO FRESH 
LAMINANTS. 
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 22% OFF 
BOOK LOCK 
TAPE. 20% 

OFF 
CLEARSEAL 
LAMINATING 
FILM.  18% 

OFF 
VISTAFOIL 

LAMINATING 
FILM.  15% 
OFF ITEMS 

NOT 
SPECIFIED OR 

LISTED IN 
EXCLUSIONS.


