
Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Invitation to Bid cover page Yes Yes No Bid No Bid
Completed and executed Bid Submittal 
form Yes Yes
Any addenda pertaining to this ITB
Drug Free Workplace Certification Yes Yes
Debarment Certification Yes Yes
Emergency/Storm related catastrophe-
Contractor agreement form Yes Yes
Conflict of Interest form Yes
References, in accordance with 
Section_____, Definition of Responsive 
and Responsible Yes Yes
Hold Harmless Agreement and/or 
Notice of Election to be Exempt, if 
required
Copy of Osceola County Business Tax 
Receipt for those businesses located 
Osceola County, Florida
Did you include a CD, as required in the 
section entitle Bid Submittal Form?

Yes Yes
Contact information included for both 
regular business hours and after 
business hours
PRICE SHEET

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY  EA. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION
1.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 94 Inches 
(238.8 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 690,         
P/N SB690  ONLY 10 1,768.50$     $         17,685.00 1515  $        15,150.00  $                    -      

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY  EA. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

Audio Visual Innovations      
6301 Benjamin Rd          

Tampa, FL 33634-5115

CCS Presentation Systems  
9655 W Florida Mining    

Blvd.                    
Builging 500, Suite 509      
Jacksonville, FL 32257

MPC - NSC               
300 N. Centennial Dr.,       

Suite 220                 
Noth Sioux City, SD 57049   

Tech Depot              
6 Cambridge Drive        

Trumbull, CT 06611

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________



Audio Visual Innovations      
6301 Benjamin Rd          

Tampa, FL 33634-5115

CCS Presentation Systems  
9655 W Florida Mining    

Blvd.                    
Builging 500, Suite 509      
Jacksonville, FL 32257

MPC - NSC               
300 N. Centennial Dr.,       

Suite 220                 
Noth Sioux City, SD 57049   

Tech Depot              
6 Cambridge Drive        

Trumbull, CT 06611

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________

2.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 77 Inches 
(195.6 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 680,         
P/N SB680  ONLY 200 1,174.00$     $       234,800.00 

1150.00
 $      230,000.00  $                    -      

3.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 64 Inches 
(162.9 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 660,         
P/N SB660  ONLY 10 945.00$      $           9,450.00 

910.00
 $          9,100.00  $                    -      

4.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 48 Inches 
(121.9 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 640,         
P/N SB640  ONLY 10 625.00$      $           6,250.00 

575.00
 $          5,750.00  $                    -      

5.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 77 Inches 
(195.6 cm) diagnal, with Unifi 45 Projector, 
Smart Board 680, P/N SB680i2  ONLY

200 2,959.00$   $       591,800.00 

3594.00

 $      718,800.00  $                    -      
6.     Stand, Floor, 640, for SB640 Only, 
P/N FS640  ONLY 10 275.00$      $           2,750.00 

250.00
 $          2,500.00  $                    -       

7.     Stand, Floor, 670, for SB660 and 
SB680 Only, P/N FS670  ONLY 20 339.00$      $           6,780.00 

286.00
 $          5,720.00  $                    -   

8.     Mount, Wall, Height-adjustable for 
SB680i2, P/N HAWM-600i2  ONLY 25 637.00$      $         15,925.00 

609.00
 $        15,225.00  $                    -   

9.     Slate, Wireless, Airliner WS100,          
P/N WS100  ONLY 200 343.00$      $         68,600.00 

326.00
 $        65,200.00  $                    -   

10.     Connection, Wireless, Bluetooth, for 
Smart Board 600 Series (North America), 
P/N WC6-NA  ONLY 25 185.00$      $           4,625.00 

163.00
 $          4,075.00  $                    -   

11.     System, Audio, USB for Smart 
Board 600 Series (North America),              
P/N SBA-NA  ONLY 10 285.00$      $           2,850.00 

244.00
 $          2,440.00  $                    -   

DESCRIPTION QUANTITY  EA. UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION UNIT EXTENSION

12.     Display, Pen, Interactive, 15 inch, 
Sympodium ID350, P/N SSID350  ONLY 10 1,695.00$   $         16,950.00 

1449.00
 $        14,490.00  $                    -   

13.     Display, Pen, Interactive, 17 inch, 
Sympodium ID370, P/N SSID350  ONLY 10 2,175.00$   $         21,750.00 

1860.00
 $        18,600.00  $                    -   



Audio Visual Innovations      
6301 Benjamin Rd          

Tampa, FL 33634-5115

CCS Presentation Systems  
9655 W Florida Mining    

Blvd.                    
Builging 500, Suite 509      
Jacksonville, FL 32257

MPC - NSC               
300 N. Centennial Dr.,       

Suite 220                 
Noth Sioux City, SD 57049   

Tech Depot              
6 Cambridge Drive        

Trumbull, CT 06611

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________

14.     System, Audio, USB for Smart 
Board 600 Series (North America),              
P/N SBA-NA  ONLY 200 285.00$      $         57,000.00 

244.00
 $        48,800.00  $                    -   

15.     System, Senteo, with Receiver, 
twenty-four (24) Remotes and Software 
CD, P/N SNT-24  ONLY 200 1,375.00$   $       275,000.00 

1283.00
 $      256,600.00  $                    -   

16.     System, Senteo, with Receiver, thirty-
two (32) Remotes and Software CD,            
P/N SNT-32  ONLY 200 1,750.00$   $       350,000.00 

1603.00
 $      320,600.00  $                    -   

17.     Receiver, Senteo, with Soft P/N SNT-
RCV-1  ONLY 10 550.00$      $           5,500.00 

572.00
 $          5,720.00  $                    -   

18.     Remote, Senteo, P/N SNT-RMT-1  
ONLY 10 82.00$        $              820.00 

85.00
 $             850.00  $                    -   

19.     Remote, Senteo, Set of Five (5)         
P/N SNT-RMT-5  ONLY 10 308.00$      $           3,080.00 

323.00
 $          3,230.00  $                    -   

20.     Installation charge - per Unit 1 345.00$      $              345.00 135.00 135.00$           

Training shall be considered at no charge, 
unless a fee is added for this item, initial 
here _______ if there is no charge

Hourly Rate

GRAND  TOTAL 1,691,960.00$  1,742,985.00$ No Bid No Bid

 Responsive & 
Responsible 
bidder 

 Did not submit 
certifications 
&/or mfg letter 



Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
Invitation to Bid cover page
Completed and executed Bid Submittal 
form
Any addenda pertaining to this ITB
Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Debarment Certification
Emergency/Storm related catastrophe-
Contractor agreement form
Conflict of Interest form

References, in accordance with 
Section_____, Definition of Responsive 
and Responsible
Hold Harmless Agreement and/or 
Notice of Election to be Exempt, if 
required
Copy of Osceola County Business Tax 
Receipt for those businesses located 
Osceola County, Florida
Did you include a CD, as required in the 
section entitle Bid Submittal Form?

Contact information included for both 
regular business hours and after 
business hours
PRICE SHEET

DESCRIPTION
1.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 94 Inches 
(238.8 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 690,         
P/N SB690  ONLY

DESCRIPTION

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________

Yes

Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes

Yes

UNIT EXTENSION UNIT

‐$               $                  -    

UNIT EXTENSION UNIT

QWIZDOM              
20525 Detroit Road # 8     
Rocky River, OH 44116



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________

2.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 77 Inches 
(195.6 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 680,         
P/N SB680  ONLY

3.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 64 Inches 
(162.9 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 660,         
P/N SB660  ONLY

4.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 48 Inches 
(121.9 cm) diagnal, Smart Board 640,         
P/N SB640  ONLY

5.     Interactive, Whiteboard, 77 Inches 
(195.6 cm) diagnal, with Unifi 45 Projector, 
Smart Board 680, P/N SB680i2  ONLY

6.     Stand, Floor, 640, for SB640 Only, 
P/N FS640  ONLY 

7.     Stand, Floor, 670, for SB660 and 
SB680 Only, P/N FS670  ONLY

8.     Mount, Wall, Height-adjustable for 
SB680i2, P/N HAWM-600i2  ONLY

9.     Slate, Wireless, Airliner WS100,          
P/N WS100  ONLY

10.     Connection, Wireless, Bluetooth, for 
Smart Board 600 Series (North America), 
P/N WC6-NA  ONLY

11.     System, Audio, USB for Smart 
Board 600 Series (North America),              
P/N SBA-NA  ONLY

DESCRIPTION

12.     Display, Pen, Interactive, 15 inch, 
Sympodium ID350, P/N SSID350  ONLY

13.     Display, Pen, Interactive, 17 inch, 
Sympodium ID370, P/N SSID350  ONLY

QWIZDOM              
20525 Detroit Road # 8     
Rocky River, OH 44116

 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   

UNIT EXTENSION UNIT
 $            -   

 $                  -   
 $            -   

 $                  -   



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-08-B-092-CB
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 4/17/08 @ 2:00 PM 
PURCHASE OF SMART BOARDS & 
ASSOCIATED EQUIPMENT
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________

14.     System, Audio, USB for Smart 
Board 600 Series (North America),              
P/N SBA-NA  ONLY

15.     System, Senteo, with Receiver, 
twenty-four (24) Remotes and Software 
CD, P/N SNT-24  ONLY

16.     System, Senteo, with Receiver, thirty-
two (32) Remotes and Software CD,            
P/N SNT-32  ONLY

17.     Receiver, Senteo, with Soft P/N SNT-
RCV-1  ONLY

18.     Remote, Senteo, P/N SNT-RMT-1  
ONLY

19.     Remote, Senteo, Set of Five (5)         
P/N SNT-RMT-5  ONLY

20.     Installation charge - per Unit

Training shall be considered at no charge, 
unless a fee is added for this item, initial 
here _______ if there is no charge

GRAND  TOTAL

QWIZDOM              
20525 Detroit Road # 8     
Rocky River, OH 44116

 $            -   

 $                  -   

1,181.25  $    236,250.00 

1,507.80  $    301,560.00 

220.50  $        2,205.00 

43.05  $           430.50 

215.25  $        2,152.50 

542,598.00$  
Alternate 
items bid does 
not meet spec


