

<p align="center">TABSHEET BID # SDOC 09-B-019 KR Trash Compactors 10/1/08 2:00 PM Read By: Cheryl Jessee Recorded By: Kristy Rumping</p>	<p align="center">FL Container Services, Inc. 3795 S. Sanford Ave. Sanford, FL 32773</p>	<p align="center">Marathon Equipment Co. 950 County Hwy 9 South Vernon, AL 35592</p>	<p align="center">Republic Services of Florida, LP 11255 Rocket Blvd. Orlando, FL 32824</p>	<p align="center">Waste Services of Florida 1099 Miller Dr. Altamont Springs, FL 32701</p>	<p align="center">Wastequip Industrial 2624 Mine & Mill Lane Lakeland, FL 33801</p>
Completed Invitation To Bid cover page	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Completed Bid submittal form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Drug Free Certification	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Debarment Certification	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Emergency/ Storm related catastrophe	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Conflict of Interest form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
References	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
Copy of Occupational License	YES	NO	NO	YES	NO
Proof of Insurance	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
Hold Harmless Agreement	NO	NO	YES	NO	NO
Copy of Bid submittal on CD?	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES
Addendum 1	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Manufacturer's Letter Stating that you are an authorized Dealer, Installer and Warranty Service Provider	YES	N/A	NO	YES	N/A
Training Certifications	YES	N/A	NO	NO	NO
Technical Specs	NO	YES	YES	YES	YES
Prompt Payment Terms: _____ % _____ Days; Net 45 Days	NONE	1% 10 DAYS	2% 20 DAYS	2% 10 DAYS	NONE
Do you accept electronic funds transfer? If yes, does your firm offer a discount?	NO	YES, N/A	NO	YES, 0%	YES, 0%
Do you accept purchase/ payment by Visa	NO	YES	NO	YES	YES

TABSHEET BID # SDOC 09-B-019 KR Trash Compactors 10/1/08 2:00 PM Read By: Cheryl Jessee Recorded By: Kristy Rumping	FL Container Services, Inc. 3795 S. Sanford Ave. Sanford, FL 32773	Marathon Equipment Co. 950 County Hwy 9 South Vernon, AL 35592	Republic Services of Florida, LP 11255 Rocket Blvd. Orlando, FL 32824	Waste Services of Florida 1099 Miller Dr. Altamont Springs, FL 32701	Wastequip Industrial 2624 Mine & Mill Lane Lakeland, FL 33801
--	--	--	--	--	---

Lot 1. Compactor & Options

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE	PRICE
1	Marathon, Ram Jet 100 SC, (30 yards self-contained) Or Equal, Specify below if bidding an alternate Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	\$20,670.00	\$15,525.34 EquipCo Mfg. 30 self-contained	\$17,493.50 EquipCo Mfg. Self Pack 30	\$14,605.00 Wastequip 255HD 30 yd
2	Marathon, Ram Jet 250 SC, (30 yards self-contained) Or Equal, Specify below if bidding an alternate Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	\$21,320.00	\$15,531.25 EquipCo Mfg. 30 self-contained	\$17,493.50 EquipCo Mfg. Self Pack 30	\$15,463.00 Wastequip 265X 30 yd
3	What percentage of the pricing above is contributed directly to the cost of the equipment? (i.e.. NOT overhead, fuel, or labor) *This percentage shall be used later for price redetermination, see paragraph 2.21 for details.	NO BID	75%	90%	80%	-
4	Remote Control On/Off Switch, Specify below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	\$370.00	\$177.50 EquipCo Mfg. Remote	\$200.00 EquipCo Mfg. n/a	\$353.00 B&J Atlantic Remote start/stop Station w/ cable

<p align="center">TABSHEET BID # SDOC 09-B-019 KR Trash Compactors 10/1/08 2:00 PM Read By: Cheryl Jessee Recorded By: Kristy Rumping</p>		<p align="center">FL Container Services, Inc. 3795 S. Sanford Ave. Sanford, FL 32773</p>	<p align="center">Marathon Equipment Co. 950 County Hwy 9 South Vernon, AL 35592</p>	<p align="center">Republic Services of Florida, LP 11255 Rocket Blvd. Orlando, FL 32824</p>	<p align="center">Waste Services of Florida 1099 Miller Dr. Altamont Springs, FL 32701</p>	<p align="center">Wastequip Industrial 2624 Mine & Mill Lane Lakeland, FL 33801</p>
8	"Eliminodor Extra" refill, Specify below Plea provide Manufacturer Name, Model and specify the various container sizes and associated pricing Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	-	\$85.00 Fresh Meadow by Alan Chemical 15 or 30	-	-
9	2 yard container with side rails, Specify below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	\$1,950.00	\$17,750.00 EquipCo Mfg. 2yd towable	\$2000.00 EquipCo Mfg. 2 cubic yard towable	\$497.00 Wastequip FL-2
10	Dumping mechanism with arms to pick up and dump 2 yard container, Specify below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	\$9,410.00	\$6,863.33 EquipCo Mfg. Intergrated System	\$7,734.00 EquipCo Mfg. Integrated System	\$12,160.00 Wastequip- Accurate Fork Style dumper
11	Additional Option #1, Specify Below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	-	\$7,336.67 EquipCo Mfg. Stand alone tipper	\$8,333.00 EquipCo Mfg. Stand alone tipper	\$1,875.00 Wastequip- Accurate Separate dumper power unit
12	Additional Option #2, Specify Below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	-	N/A	-	-
13	Additional Option #3, Specify Below Manufacturer: Model:	NO BID	-	N/A	-	-

<p align="center">TABSHEET BID # SDOC 09-B-019 KR Trash Compactors 10/1/08 2:00 PM Read By: Cheryl Jessee Recorded By: Kristy Rumping</p>		<p align="center">FL Container Services, Inc. 3795 S. Sanford Ave. Sanford, FL 32773</p>	<p align="center">Marathon Equipment Co. 950 County Hwy 9 South Vernon, AL 35592</p>	<p align="center">Republic Services of Florida, LP 11255 Rocket Blvd. Orlando, FL 32824</p>	<p align="center">Waste Services of Florida 1099 Miller Dr. Altamont Springs, FL 32701</p>	<p align="center">Wastequip Industrial 2624 Mine & Mill Lane Lakeland, FL 33801</p>
14	For additional options and/or parts & accessories to be considered as part of this award, you must provide product information sheet including pricing. Are additional options included?	NO BID	-	See Parts & Accessories Sheet	YES	-
15	Cost for Delivery either to the location of the awarded vendor for Lot 2 for installation or directly to the School District Location	NO BID	-	\$75.00	\$200.00	\$250 per load
16	Best Possible Delivery after receipt of purchase order	NO BID	40 DAYS	15 DAYS	15 DAYS	30-45 DAYS
Lot 2. Compactor Installation						
1	Cost for Complete installation as specified on page 5, lot 2, compactor installation. If using a subcontractor, please submit all contact information.	\$1,150.00	-	\$850.00	\$1,200.00	NO BID
Lot 3. Compactor Maintenance & Service						
1	Cost per Compactor for Annual (Once per year) Maintenance / Service to Include all labor and materials to complete the Annual Maintenance as specified on Page 6, Lot 3, Annual Maintenance	\$335.00	-	\$350.00	\$500.00	NO BID

<p align="center">TABSHEET BID # SDOC 09-B-019 KR Trash Compactors 10/1/08 2:00 PM Read By: Cheryl Jessee Recorded By: Kristy Rumping</p>		<p align="center">FL Container Services, Inc. 3795 S. Sanford Ave. Sanford, FL 32773</p>	<p align="center">Marathon Equipment Co. 950 County Hwy 9 South Vernon, AL 35592</p>	<p align="center">Republic Services of Florida, LP 11255 Rocket Blvd. Orlando, FL 32824</p>	<p align="center">Waste Services of Florida 1099 Miller Dr. Altamont Springs, FL 32701</p>	<p align="center">Wastequip Industrial 2624 Mine & Mill Lane Lakeland, FL 33801</p>
2	Cost per Compactor for Semi Annual (Twice per year) Inspection, to be completed as specified on page 6, Lot 3, Semi Annual Inspection	\$60.00 PER INSPECTION	-	\$231.00	\$350.00	NO BID
3	Emergency Service Call for Equipment not covered under warranty	\$60.00	-	\$115.50	\$125.00	NO BID
4	Percentage Discount off parts (provide catalog or printed price sheet)	0%	-	RETAIL	8%	NO BID
5	Hourly Rate for Labor (Monday-Friday, 8:00 AM-5:00 PM)	\$60.00	-	\$77.00	\$88.00	NO BID
6	Hourly Rate for Labor (After Hours, Weekends & Holidays)	\$60.00	-	\$115.50	\$125.00	NO BID
7	Are you able to re-build or re-furbish compactors?	YES	-	YES	YES	NO BID
		Lot 2 and 3 awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.				Lot 1 awarded to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder.