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Bid Submittal Form Signed YES YES YES YES YES YES
Catalogs (2) for every Manufacturer? YES YES YES YES YES YES
CD? YES OR NO YES YES YES YES YES YES
PRICE SHEET
1.  ARTCO BELL:                                        
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2.  BEVIS:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BASYX (REPLACES 
BEVIS)             
40.2%              
40.2%              
40.2%         

(INSTALLATION ADD 
9%)

3.  ECKADAMS:                                          
Discount off Casegoods ________%         
Discount off Seating ________%        
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4.  GLOBAL:                                                
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID
35%               
35%               
35%

NO BID NO BID

50.1%              
50.1%              
50.1%              

(INSTALLATION ADD 
7%)

5.  GLOBE:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating _________%               
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

Page 1 of 35



Bid Submittal Form Signed
Catalogs (2) for every Manufacturer?
CD? YES OR NO
PRICE SHEET
1.  ARTCO BELL:                                        
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

2.  BEVIS:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

3.  ECKADAMS:                                          
Discount off Casegoods ________%         
Discount off Seating ________%        
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

4.  GLOBAL:                                                
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

5.  GLOBE:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating _________%               
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
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CD? YES OR NO
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2.  BEVIS:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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Bid Submittal Form Signed
Catalogs (2) for every Manufacturer?
CD? YES OR NO
PRICE SHEET
1.  ARTCO BELL:                                        
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
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________%
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AND OFFICE FURNITURE
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PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

6.  HALE:                                                     
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7.  HAMILTON:                                            
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8.  HASKELL:                                              
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9.  HAWORTH:                                            
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%           
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10.  HON:                                                 
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
59% *              
59% *              
59% *

61.9%              
61.9%              
61.9%            

(INSTALLATION ADD 
7%)

11.  KI:                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
51% *              
51% *              
51% *

NO BID
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

18.  SMITH SYSTEM:                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID
45%               
45%               
45%

NO BID NO BID

19.  UNITED CHAIR:                                   
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

20. VIRCO:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

21. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off  Seating _________%              
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

ABC SCHOOL 
SUPPLY - PRE-K TO 
GRADE 3 & EARLY 

CHILDHOOD-INFANT 
TO GRADE 2        

12%               
12%               
12%

CHILDCRAFT 
GROWING YEARS   

12%               
12%               
12%

BUILT-RITE OFFICE 
FURNITURE         

42%               
42%               
N/A

CREST 
MANUFACTURING   

49%               
49%               
49%

NATIONAL          
60% *              
60% *              
60% *

ABCO              
59.8%              
59.8%              
59.8%          

(INSTALLATION ADD 
9%)

22. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                          
Discount off Casegoods _______%             
Discount off Seating _______%                   
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID

CARMEL 
FURNITURE         

35%               
35%               
N/A

MEDIA 
TECHNOLOGIES     

48%               
48%               
48%

NO BID

GHENT             
20.1%              
20.1%              
20.1%            

(INSTALLATION ADD 
9%)
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

18.  SMITH SYSTEM:                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

19.  UNITED CHAIR:                                   
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

20. VIRCO:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

21. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off  Seating _________%              
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

22. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                          
Discount off Casegoods _______%             
Discount off Seating _______%                   
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ABCO              
40.46%             
40.46%             

N/A

ACADEMIA          
66%               
66%               
66%

LUXOR             
30% OFF UPS ITEMS 

15% OFF TRUCK 
ITEMS

ABCO              
50%               
50%               
50%

KAPLAN EARLY 
LEARNING          

15%               
15%               
N/A

IOPC               
19.3%              
19.3%              

N/A                          IF 
UNDER $2800 

(AFTER DISCOUNT) 
ADD $300

DIVERSIFIED 
WOODCRAFTS      

33%  (ALL ITEMS)    
N/A                
N/A

NO BID

INDIANA DESK      
57.1%              
57.1%              
57.1%

NO BID
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

18.  SMITH SYSTEM:                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

19.  UNITED CHAIR:                                   
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

20. VIRCO:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

21. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off  Seating _________%              
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

22. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                          
Discount off Casegoods _______%             
Discount off Seating _______%                   
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
30%               
30%               
30%

45%               
N/A                
N/A

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LAKESHORE 
LEARNING 
MATERIALS         

5%                
5%                
N/A

PALMER SNYDER 
FURNITURE         

45%               
45%               
45%

CANO              
46%               
46%               
46%

NO BID

AMTAB             
40%               
40%               
40%

BESTRITE/BALT     
40%               
40%               
N/A

NO BID NO BID

CORRELL          
40%               
40%               
40%

NO BID

FLEETWOOD       
25%               
25%               
25%

BRETFORD         
55%               
55%               
N/A
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

18.  SMITH SYSTEM:                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

19.  UNITED CHAIR:                                   
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

20. VIRCO:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

21. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off  Seating _________%              
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

22. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                          
Discount off Casegoods _______%             
Discount off Seating _______%                   
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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39%               
39%               
39%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

N/A                
52%               
N/A

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

N/A                
64.5% *             
64.5% *            

TAILGATE 
DELIVERY TO 1 

LOCATION

NO BID

ALLIED PLASTICS   
43%               
43%               
43%

SPECTRUM 
INDUSTRIES        

N/A                
42%               
N/A

FOOD COURT 
DESIGN GROUP     

25%               
25%               
25%               

45-60 DAY 
DELIVERY ON ALL 

ITEMS

NO BID
WOOD ETC CORP. 20%  

N/A                    
N/A

BALT              
32.1%              
32.1%              
32.1%

NO BID

WORKING WALLS   
5%                
N/A                
N/A                

30-60 DAYS 
DELIVERY

NO BID NO BID
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

18.  SMITH SYSTEM:                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

19.  UNITED CHAIR:                                   
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

20. VIRCO:                                                  
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

21. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                    
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off  Seating _________%              
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

22. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                          
Discount off Casegoods _______%             
Discount off Seating _______%                   
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

23. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID

OFM               
42%               
42%               
42%

PARAGON          
40%               
40%               
40%

NO BID

HIGHPOINT         
60.2%              
60.2%              
60.2%              

(INSTALLATION ADD 
7%)

24. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

NO BID NO BID

RUDNICK           
42%               
42%               
42%

USA CAPITOL       
43%               
43%               
43%

NO BID

SANDUSKY         
40.1%              
40.1%              
40.1%        

(INSTALLATION ADD 
5%)

25. Percentage/Cost per hour for 
installation (If required)                                 
$_____________hour 12% OF TOTAL 

ORDER
12% OF TOTAL 

ORDER 35.00 / HOUR 4%  OF TOTAL COST $30.00       PER MAN 
PER HOUR SEE BID

26. Other Entities can piggy-back from this 
bid: ______Yes         ______No YES YES YES YES YES YES

27. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

ALLISON 
MCCARTHY         

PH 800-669-4222     
FAX 717-653-7930

PAT SCORZETTI    
PH 352-688-8161     
FAX 352-688-8161

ROSE GIGLIO       
PH 954-972-3375  
FAX 954-970-3566

ANNE ROEPER      
PH 325-225-6469     
FAX 877-373-0622

SUSAN FINCH       
PH 407-420-9022    
FAX 407-420-4664    

RON MORRIS       
PH 352-793-2745   
FAX 352-793-2778

28.  Letters from Manufacturers stating 
that they are an authorized 
Dealer/Distributor?

YES YES YES YES YES YES

29.  Prompt Payment Discount
NO  NO 3%  30 DAYS        

1%   ETF NO  NO NO  

30.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form YES YES YES YES YES YES
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

23. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

24. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

25. Percentage/Cost per hour for 
installation (If required)                                 
$_____________hour

26. Other Entities can piggy-back from this 
bid: ______Yes         ______No 

27. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

28.  Letters from Manufacturers stating 
that they are an authorized 
Dealer/Distributor?
29.  Prompt Payment Discount

30.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
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METRO             
33.72%             
33.72%             

N/A                
$1000 MINIMUM 
ORDER AFTER 

DISCOUNT

NATIONAL PUBLIC 
SEATING           

38%               
38%               
38%

NO BID

NOW SEATING      
N/A                
50%               
50%

NO BID

OFM, INC.          
27.74%             
27.74%             

N/A                
$1000 MINIMUM 
ORDER AFTER 

DISCOUNT

OKLAHOMA SOUND  
39%  (ALL ITEMS)    

N/A                
N/A

NO BID

TEKNION           
60%               
60%               
60%               

SYSTEMS 
FURNITURE 69%

NO BID

SEE BID 10% OF COST      
(MIN $250)

UNABLE TO 
INSTALL IN FLORIDA 

AT THIS TIME.

35.00 / HOUR        
***                 

50.00 / HOUR 
(AFTERHOURS & 

WEEKENDS)

-

YES YES YES YES YES

BOB ECKES         
PH 407-708-5902    
FAX 407-805-9977

EVAN BASH         
PH 407-325-7135     
FAX 407-363-1075

SHAWNA LEY       
PH 800-543-2180     
FAX 800-350-6236

KEITH TOLMICH    
PH 407-294-4141    
FAX 407-294-1477

BRENDA ROBERTS  
PH 800-334-2014     
FAX 336-712-2243

YES YES YES YES YES

NO  NO NO  NO NO

YES YES YES NO PROGRAM YES
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

23. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

24. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

25. Percentage/Cost per hour for 
installation (If required)                                 
$_____________hour

26. Other Entities can piggy-back from this 
bid: ______Yes         ______No 

27. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

28.  Letters from Manufacturers stating 
that they are an authorized 
Dealer/Distributor?
29.  Prompt Payment Discount

30.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
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NO BID NO BID

HIGHPOINT         
54%               
54%               
54%

NO BID

INFINITE 
FURNITURE 
SOLUTIONS         

30%               
30%               
30%

LSI                
35%               
35%               
N/A

NO BID NO BID

MAXON            
46%               
46%               
46%

NO BID

LOGIFLEX          
35%               
35%               
35%

MIDWEST 
(INSTITUTIONAL)    

34%               
34%               
N/A

FREE FOR ORDERS 
OVER $10,000  **    

15% FOR ORDERS 
UNDER $10,000

- 10% N/A 15% -

YES YES YES YES YES -

NIKKI GLASCO      
PH 800-421-5354     
FAX 310-537-7990

ROBERT PUCKET    
PH 800-535-4519     
FAX 859-266-3473

MATT PATTERSON   
PH 407-847-8899    
FAX 407-847-2115

BOB LERCZAK      
PH 800-323-8484     
FAX 708-594-1907

JANET RANALDI     
Ph 407-359-2516     

FAX 920-993-4362

DAVID MORGAN   
PH 813-928-8815   
FAX 813-855-5414

YES YES YES YES YES YES

NO  NO  NO NO NO  NO

YES YES YES YES YES YES
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1/20/09

23. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

24. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

25. Percentage/Cost per hour for 
installation (If required)                                 
$_____________hour

26. Other Entities can piggy-back from this 
bid: ______Yes         ______No 

27. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

28.  Letters from Manufacturers stating 
that they are an authorized 
Dealer/Distributor?
29.  Prompt Payment Discount

30.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
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BEST RITE          
32.1%              
32.1%              
32.1%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

COLUMBIA 
MANUFACTURING   

23%               
23%               
23%

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9% ADDITIONAL  6%  OF 
TOTAL LIST PRICE SEE BID

20%  ** MINIMUM OF 
$2500 PER 

PURCHASE ORDER, 
PER LOCATION

N/A

YES YES YES NO  YES

TODD OFFUTT      
PH 407-299-0896     
FAX 407-299-0985

THERESA 
THOMPSON         

PH 800-235-1262     
FAX 800-335-0473

BARRY SCHUSTER  
PH 800-330-7328    
FAX 800-586-3291

SEAN WATSON     
PH 800-448-4726     
FAX 501-513-1620

WOLFGANG WALTHER   
PH 214-747-1310         
FAX 214-747-1317

YES YES YES YES YES

NO  NO  NO NO NO  

YES YES YES YES YES
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CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
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1/20/09

23. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

24. _______ List manufacturer quoting 
on:                                                               
Discount off Casegoods ________%           
Discount off Seating ________%                 
Discount off Cafeteria Furniture 
________%

25. Percentage/Cost per hour for 
installation (If required)                                 
$_____________hour

26. Other Entities can piggy-back from this 
bid: ______Yes         ______No 

27. CONTACT PERSON:____________    
PHONE NUMBER:_______________        
FAX NUMBER:__________________        
E-MAIL ADDRESS:______________

28.  Letters from Manufacturers stating 
that they are an authorized 
Dealer/Distributor?
29.  Prompt Payment Discount

30.  Drug Free Workplace Certification 
Form
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

31.  Certificate of Debarment?
YES YES YES YES YES YES

32.  Emergency Storm Agreement Form?
YES YES YES YES YES YES

33.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?
YES YES YES YES YES YES

34.  List of References?
YES YES YES YES YES YES

35.  Certificate of Insurance?

YES YES YES YES YES YES

36.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed. WC INS WC INS WC INS WC INS WC INS WC INS

37.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed? N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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31.  Certificate of Debarment?

32.  Emergency Storm Agreement Form?

33.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

34.  List of References?

35.  Certificate of Insurance?

36.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

37.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?
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YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

WC INS WC INS WC INS WC INS WC INS

N/A NO NO NO NO
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31.  Certificate of Debarment?

32.  Emergency Storm Agreement Form?

33.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

34.  List of References?

35.  Certificate of Insurance?

36.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

37.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?
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YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES DELIVERY COMMON 
CARRIER/UPS ONLY YES YES

WC INS WC INS WC INS N/A HOLD HARMLESS 
AGREEMENT

HOLD HARMLESS 
AGREEMENT

NO NO NO NO N/A N/A    
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CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
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31.  Certificate of Debarment?

32.  Emergency Storm Agreement Form?

33.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

34.  List of References?

35.  Certificate of Insurance?

36.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

37.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?
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YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES

YES DELIVERY COMMON 
CARRIER/UPS ONLY YES YES YES

WC INS HOLD HARMLESS 
AGREEMENT WC INS WC INS HOLD HARMLESS 

AGREEMENT

N/A                N/A N/A NO N/A
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CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
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1/20/09

31.  Certificate of Debarment?

32.  Emergency Storm Agreement Form?

33.  Conflict of Interst Form Signed?

34.  List of References?

35.  Certificate of Insurance?

36.  If no Worker's Comp Insurance - They 
Need the Hold Harmless Agreement Form 
Signed.

37.  Any Confidential Materials?  If Yes, Is 
the Non-Disclosure Form Signed?
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-055-LK PAGES
GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:12-16-08 @ 2:00 PM                                         
CATALOG BID FOR CLASSROOM
AND OFFICE FURNITURE
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker   
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 
1/20/09

NOTES: FREE UPS 
DELIVERY ON 
ORDERS OVER 
$100.00  ****                
FREE S/H CHARGES 
FOR TRUCK 
DELIVERIES OVER 
$750.00

FREE UPS 
DELIVERY ON 
ORDERS OVER 
$100.00  ****                
FREE S/H CHARGES 
FOR TRUCK 
DELIVERIES OVER 
$750.00

*DELIVERY IS 
SUBJECT TO 
PRODUCT 
AVAILABILITY FROM 
MANUFACTURER
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EXCLUSIONS:  
PLAYGROUND 
STRUCTURES, 
PARTS, SURFACING 
OR SERVICES 
PLAYGROUND.    
DISCOUNT DOESN'T 
APPLY TO LOFTS, 
COMPUTERS & 
ACCESSORIES, 
ASSESSMENTS & 
SCREENING 
MATERIALS, "ALL 
ABOUT ECERS-R", 
"ALL ABOUT ITERS-
R", TOT TREE 
(#96616) AND 
MINOTOUR SCHOOL 
ACTIVITY BUS
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EXCEPTIONS:  
CAREERPLUS 
MODULES, PAXTON 
ACTION LAB 
MODULES, 
GROWING UP 
READY MODULES, 
ADMIN, BUILDING 
SKILLS CTAS, 
HERMAN MILLER 
FURNITURE, 
PRISMATIQUE 
FURNITURE, SIS 
FURNITURE, SMITH 
SYSTEMS 
FURNITURE, AND 
SPECTRUM 
FURNITURE.
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64.5% STANDARD 
DISCOUNT, 
ORDERS  2500 TO 
7499.99 TAKE 65.5% 
DISCOUNT, 
ORDERS 7500 TO 
14999.99 TAKE 69% 
DISCOUNT, 
ORDERS 25000 TO 
29999.99 TAKE A 
70.5% DISCOUNT, 
ORDER OVER 30000 
TAKE A 71.5% 
DISCOUNT.  SEE 
BID
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