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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Debarment Certification YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Emergency Agreement YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Conflict of Interest YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
References YES YES YES YES YES YES YES
Proof of Insurance YES YES NO YES YES NO YES
Hold Harmless N/A N/A N/A N/A YES N/A N/A
One Original, One Copy & One CD YES YES NO YES NO YES YES
PRICE SHEET
1. Bobcat Excavator

a. Daily Rental                                               
$______/day x  1 (est. qty.)                          
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$110.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$160.00

$180.00        
$200.00        
$30.00         
$410.00

$145.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$268.50

$160.00        
$80.00         

$0            
$240.00

$190.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$240.00

$172.00        
$180.00        
$3.00          

$355.00

$156.00           
$65.00/$65.00      

$2.00             
$288.00

b. Weekly Rental                                           
$______/week x  7 (est. qty.)                        
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$275.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$1,975.00

$460.00        
$200.00        
$30.00         

$3,450.00

$495.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$3,588.50

$470.00        
$80.00         

$0            
$3,370.00

$760.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$5,370.00

$472.00        
$180.00        
$9.00          

$4,627.00      
Math Error 

Corrected Total 
$3,493.00

$544.00           
$455.00/455.00     

$28.00            
$4,746.00         

Math Error Correct 
Totals            

$544.00           
$65.00/$65.00      

$4.00             
$3,942.00

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-067 CJ
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 2/3/09 @2:00PM   

RENTAL EQUIPMENT, HEAVY &
LIGHT DUTY

READ BY:_Kristy Rumping_
RECORDED BY:_Cheryl Jessee_
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-067 CJ
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 2/3/09 @2:00PM   

RENTAL EQUIPMENT, HEAVY &
LIGHT DUTY

READ BY:_Kristy Rumping_
RECORDED BY:_Cheryl Jessee_

c. Monthly Rental                                          
$______/month x  12 (est. qty.)                    
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$825.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$9950.00

$1,190.00      
$200.00        
$30.00         

$14,510.00

$1,100.00      
$120.00        
$3.50          

$13,323.50

$950.00        
$80.00         

$0            
$11,480.00

$1,520.00      
$50.00         

$0            
$18,290.00

$1,072.00      
$180.00        
$21.00         

$15,276.00     
Math Error 

Corrected Total  
$13,065.00

$924.00           
$780.00/780.00     

$96.00            
$12,744.00        

Math Error Correct 
Totals            

$924.00           
$65.00/$65.00      

$8.00             
$11,226.00

2.  4 Wheel Drive Back Hoe

a. Daily Rental                                               
$______/day x  1 (est. qty.)                          
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$120.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$220.00

$170.00        
$200.00        
$30.00         
$400.00

$175.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$298.50

$185.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$285.00

$250.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$300.00

$200.00        
$180.00        
$4.00          

$384.00

$199.00           
$65.00/65.00       

$2.00             
$331.00

b. Weekly Rental                                           
$______/week x  1 (est. qty.)                        
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$350.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$450.00        

$440.00        
$200.00        
$30.00         
$670.00

$545.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$668.50

$545.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$645.00

$1,000.00      
$50.00         

$0            
$1,050.00

$560.00        
$180.00        
$11.00         
$751.00

$598.00           
$65.00/65.00       

$4.00             
$732.00

c. Monthly Rental                                          
$______/month x  20 (est. qty.)                    
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$1,000.00      
$100.00        

$0            
$20,100.  

$1,150.00      
$200.00        
$30.00         

$23,230.00

$1,250.00      
$120.00        
$3.50          

$25,123.50

$1,150.00      
$100.00        

$0            
$23,100.00

$2,000.00      
$50.00         

$0            
$40,050.00

$1,320.00      
$180.00        
$26.00         

$30,520.00     
Math Error 

Corrected Total  
$26,606.00

$1,195.00         
$1300.00/1300.00   

$160.00           
$26,660.00        
Math Error 

Corrected Totals    
$1,195.00         

$65.00/$65.00      
$8.00             

$24,038.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-067 CJ
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 2/3/09 @2:00PM   

RENTAL EQUIPMENT, HEAVY &
LIGHT DUTY

READ BY:_Kristy Rumping_
RECORDED BY:_Cheryl Jessee_

3. Box Dump Truck Min. 6 Yards Dump Trailer 3 
Yards 5.6 YARD

a. Daily Rental                                               
$______/day x  1 (est. qty.)                          
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$140.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$240.00

NO BID

$185.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$308.50

$213.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$313.00

$77.00         
$50.00         

$0            
$127.00

$172.00        
$180.00      
$3.00          

$355.00

$204.00           
$65.00/65.00       

$5.00             
$339.00

b. Weekly Rental                                           
$______/week x  2 (est. qty.)                        
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$400.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$900.00

NO BID

$475.00        
$120.00        
$3.50          

$1,073.50

$595.00        
$100.00        

$0            
$1,290.00

$308.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$358.00        

Math Error 
Corrected Total  

$666.00        

$472.00        
$180.00        
$9.00          

$1,322.00      
Math Error 

Corrected Total  
$1,133.00

$675.00           
$130.00/130.00     

$20.00            
$1,630.00         
Math Error 

Corrected Totals    
$675.00           

$65.00/$65.00      
$10.00            

$1,490.00
c. Monthly Rental                                          
$______/month x  10 (est. qty.)                    
+ $_____Pick-up/Delivery                            
+ $___ Environmental Fee = 
$_______________ Total Rental Cost

$1,200.00      
$100.00        

$0            
$12,100.00

NO BID

$1,400.00      
$120.00        
$3.50          

$14,123.50

$1495.00       
$100.00        

$0            
$15,050.00

$616.00        
$50.00         

$0            
$6,210.00

$1,416.00      
$180.00        
$28.00         

$16,240.00     
Math Error 

Corrected Total  
$14,368.00

$1,499.00         
$650.00/650.00     

$150.00           
$16,440.00        
Math Error 

Corrected Totals    
$1,499.00         

$65.00/$65.00      
$15.00            

$15,135.00
4. Estimated Yearly Grand Total                 
$________________________

$46,095.00

$42,670.00 
(DOES NOT 

INCLUDE 
PRICING FOR 

ITEM #3)

$58,775.50 $55,773.00

$71,995.00     
Math Error 

Correct Total    
$72,303.00

$69,830.00     
Math Error 

Corrected Total  
$60,510.00

$63,910.00        
Math Errors Correct 

Total         
$57,521.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-067 CJ
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 2/3/09 @2:00PM   

RENTAL EQUIPMENT, HEAVY &
LIGHT DUTY

READ BY:_Kristy Rumping_
RECORDED BY:_Cheryl Jessee_

5.  Explain how your environmental fees 
are calculated and charged to the 
District:____________________________
___________________________________ No Charges Fee charge per 

billing cycle

Environmental 
fees are a one 
time charge per 
item per rental 

period

No Charge None 2% OF Rental 
Rate

See bid it varies by 
day/week/month 

and amount of H.P. 
equipment is from 

$1.00 - $15.00

6.  Price per gallon for fuel?                    
Gasoline $__________/gallon                      
Diesel $____________/gallon

$4.00          
$5.00

$3.90          
$4.50

$6.95          
$6.95

$4.50          
$5.50

$1.97          
$2.50

$6.00          
$6.00

$4.29             
$4.82             

Adjusts with 
National Average

7.  The School Board may, from time to 
time, require the rental of equipment that 
is not covered on the Bid Price Sheet.  
Please indicate the discount % you will 
offer the School Board from your Printed 
Retail Price List: _____________%

20% 30%
5% daily, 10% 
weekly, 15% 

monthly
15% 10% 20% 20%

8.  Best possible delivery after receipt of 
purchase order?  ______/days 1 1 3 Same Day 1 1 1

9.  Best possible delivery for emergency 
situations? ______/days

0 1

if in stock 
immediate 

delivery, if not 2-
3 days 

depending on 
availability

Same Day 1 Hour 1 2
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-09-B-067 CJ
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 2/3/09 @2:00PM   

RENTAL EQUIPMENT, HEAVY &
LIGHT DUTY

READ BY:_Kristy Rumping_
RECORDED BY:_Cheryl Jessee_

10.  Store Locations: 
___________________________________
___________________________________
__________________________

Orlando, 
Florida; Atlanta, 

Georgia; 
Birmingham, 

Alabama; 
Nashville, 

Tennessee

Orland, Ocala & 
Tampa

see attached list 
of locations

11909 S. OBT 
Orlando, Florida 
3500 King St. 
Cocoa, Florida

Kissimmee and 
ST. Cloud

North & Central 
Florida

Kissimmee, 
Orlnado, Disney, 

Cocoa, Sanford & 
Winter Haven

Prompt Payment Terms:    __________%  
_________Days;                Net 45 Days

- 100% 30 Days 0% 0 Days N/A - - -

Do you accept electronic funds tranfer 
(ETF)?  Yes or No - YES YES YES NO YES YES

If yes, does your firm offer a discount?   
__________% - NO BID 0.00 N/A - - NO

Do you accept Purchase/Payment by 
Visa card?   Yes or No - YES YES YES YES NO YES


