¢ 5 . <
TAB SHEET e ~ % & s § § ~ g B
SDOC 09-B-068 CJ ALUMINUM WALKWAY % § - e S R 3 _g b, N ; E
COVERS S L9 §§%§d 2 T & L 2
Bid Opening: FebruarY 11, 2009 @ 2PM o é E c § 4§ = _g ; 2T _g = g )
Read By: Kristy Rumping § 56 &R £ e LE o 98 .(49; LE % 2 ucE’
Recorded By: Cheryl Jessee T £Ea<C S O<a&a 2O S £38=z0 z a8
Invitation Cover Sheet YES YES YES YES
Completed Submittal Form YES YES YES YES
Drug Free Certification YES YES YES YES
Debarment Certification YES YES YES YES
Emergency Agreement YES YES YES YES
Conflict of Interest YES YES YES YES
References YES YES YES YES
Licenses YES YES YES YES
Proof of Insurance YES YES YES YES
Hold Harmless YES N/A N/A N/A
1 Original, 1 copy and 1 CD YES YES YES YES
Descriptive Literature of Mfg. NO YES, FOR EXTRUDED YES, FOR EXTRUDED YES
Proof of Mfg. Distributor, Inst. & War. LETTER FROM ALL BRIGHT YES YES, FOR EXTRUDED YES
Single 4" Double 4" Single 4" Double 4" Single 4" Double 4" Single 4" Double 4"
Column per [Column per [Column per [Column per |Column per |Column per |Column per |Column per
Item # |Description sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft.
LOT 1 - PROVIDE & INSTALL LAMINATED COVERED
WALKWAYS AS SPECIFIED
1.1 |[Up to 500 square feet S 2070|S 2137|S 1883 |S 1883 |S 19.00|S$S 19.00|S 15.15(S 16.05
1.2 |500 to 5,000 square feet S 2070|$ 2137|S$ 1747 |S 17.47|S 17.78|S 1778 |S 1490|S 15.85
1.3 [Over 5,000 square feet S 2070|S 2137 |S 1747 |S 1747 |S 17.15|S 17.15|S 1445(|S 15.50
1.4 |Manufacturer of Product bidding  |All Bright Custom, Inc. STRUCTALL or ELITE NOT NOTED METALS, USA
LOT 2 - PROVIDE & INSTALL EXTRUDED COVERED
WALKWAYS AS SPECIFIED
2.1 |Up to 500 square feet S 2466|S 2533|S 1821 |S 1821 (S 37.74|S$ 37.74 | NOBID NO BID
2.2 |500 to 5,000 square feet S 2466|S 2533|S 1700|S 1700|S 33.91|S$S 33.91|NOBID NO BID
2.3 |Over 5,000 square feet S 2466|S8 2533|S 1700|S 17.00(S 29.33|S$ 29.33 | NOBID NO BID
CUSTOM SCREENS &
2.4 |Manufacturer of Product bidding  |All Bright Custom, Inc.  |ARCHITECTURAL MASON CORP. NO BID




TAB SHEET

SDOC 09-B-068 CJ ALUMINUM WALKWAY
COVERS

Bid Opening: February 11, 2009 @ 2PM
Read By: Kristy Rumping

Recorded By: Cheryl Jessee

Kissimmee, FL 34745-

All Bright Custom,
1057

Inc.
P.O. Box 451057

Custom Screen &
Architectural
Products, Inc.

4881 Distribution Ct.
Orlando, FL 32822

MVB & Associates,

Inc.
6565 Hazeltine

National Dr. #12
Orlando, FL 32822

1150 Albright Road
Sanford, FL 32771

Nelson LC

LOT 3 - MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR AND/OR
RELOCATION WORK OF LAMINATED COVERED
WALKWAYS

3.1 [Materiasl - % markup from cost

9%

25%

25%

20%

3.2 |[Labor - Flat Hourly Rate

$45.00

$218.36/FULL CREW

$37.50

$50.00

LOT 4 - MISCELLANEOUS REPAIR AND/OR
RELOCATION WORK OF EXTRUDED COVERED
WALKWAYS

4.1 |[Materiasl - % markup from cost

9%

25%

25%

NO BID

4.2 |Labor - Flat Hourly Rate

$45.00

$218.36/FULL CREW

$37.50

NO BID

PRICE REDETERMINATION CLAUSES,
PARAGRAPHS 2.21 & 2.22

List what % of your bid cost is associated
with fuel

3%

NOT EVALUATED
SEPARATELY

5%

7%

List what % of your bid cost is associated
with fuel

60%

40-45% + OR -

29%

72%

If unable to meet the to meet the delivery
and installation time lines as stated in this
bid document, how many days after recept
of Purchase Order can your company
commence: ____ days

N/A

60-90 DAYS ALUMINUM
MARKET CONDITIONS
APPLY

30 DAYS

30 DAYS




TAB SHEET 55 _ £ 2
SDOC 09-B-068 CJ ALUMINUM WALKWAY _ § N 20 g N
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Bid Opening: February 11, 2009 @ 2PM 2 g § _8‘ T=23%g
o 3 O s~ T
Read By: Kristy Rumping L €9 5 5 22 &
Recorded By: Cheryl Jessee R\l 6386
Invitation Cover Sheet YES YES
Completed Submittal Form YES YES
Drug Free Certification YES YES
Debarment Certification YES YES
Emergency Agreement YES YES
Conflict of Interest YES YES
References YES YES
Licenses YES YES
Proof of Insurance YES YES
Hold Harmless N/A YES
1 Original, 1 copy and 1 CD 10RIG.& 1CD NO CD
Descriptive Literature of Mfg. BID AS SPECIFIED NO
Proof of Mfg. Distributor, Inst. & War. YES NO
Single 4" Double 4" Single 4" Double 4"
Column per |Column per [Column per |Column per
Item # |Description sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft. sq. ft.
L[OT 1- PROVIDE & INSTALL LAMINATED COVERED
WALKWAYS AS SPECIFIED
1.1 |Up to 500 square feet S 2650(|S 26508 29.00|S 34.00
1.2 500 to 5,000 square feet S 2350|$ 2350|$ 23.00|S$S 28.00
1.3 |Over 5,000 square feet S 2250(|S$S 2250|$ 17.25|S 23.00
1.4 |Manufacturer of Product bidding METALS, USA METALS, USA
LOT 2 - PROVIDE & INSTALL EXTRUDED COVERED
WALKWAYS AS SPECIFIED
2.1 |Up to 500 square feet S 2800|$S 2800|$S 4100|S$S 46.00
2.2 |500 to 5,000 square feet S 2300(S 2300|S% 3600|S 41.00
2.3 |Over 5,000 square feet S 21.00|S 2100(S 3400(S$S 3500
2.4 [Manufacturer of Product bidding  |Perfection Architectural [NOT NOTED




TAB SHEET

SDOC 09-B-068 CJ ALUMINUM WALKWAY
COVERS

Bid Opening: February 11, 2009 @ 2PM
Read By: Kristy Rumping

Recorded By: Cheryl Jessee

Materiasl - % markup from cost

Perfection

Architectural

2310 Mercator Dr.
Orlando, FL 32807

The Ford Design
Group, LLC

10507 Leader Lane

Orlando, FL 32825

Labor - Flat Hourly Rate

4.1 |Materiasl - % markup from cost

25%

25%

4.2 |Labor - Flat Hourly Rate

List what % of your bid cost is associated

$50.00

$70.00

with fuel 1.50% 6%
List what % of your bid cost is associated
with fuel 70% 6%

If unable to meet the to meet the delivery
and installation time lines as stated in this
bid document, how many days after recept
of Purchase Order can your company
commence: days

45 DAYS

15 DAYS




