TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR
SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION
4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC
12801 Commodity Place
Tampa, FL 33626-3104

Completed Invitation To Bid cover page YES
Completed Bid submittal form YES
Addendum 1 YES
Drug Free Certification YES
Debarment Certification YES
Emergency/ Storm related catastrophe agreement from YES
Conflict of Interest form YES
References YES
Licenses/Occupational NO
Proof of Insurance YES
Hold Harmless Agreement N/A
Non-Disclosure Agreement for Confidential Materials NO
One Original, One Copy and Copy of Bid submittal on CD? YES
Samples as requested in Section 1.03, H. Required Samples NO
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION
Lot 1. Total Turn-key Pricing for Magnesium Alloy or
equal Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida Inventory of School
Housing) Signs
Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity
10, 50, Quantity 51- 101+,
cost per cost per 100, cost  |cost per
Item Standard Sizes each each per each each
1 2x5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 3x8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 3x10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 3x12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 4x5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 4x6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 4x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 4x12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 5x7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 5x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 6x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

*Alternate*

Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.

Quantity 1-
10,

cost per
each

S 30.90
S 53.35
S 57.80
S 63.70
S 46.10
S 52.25
S  66.95
S 79.10
S 63.70
S 76.35
S 82.60

P.O. Box 4144
Winter Park, FL 32793

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO
YES ON SEPARATE FORMS

NO

YES

NO

NO

YES

YES
Quantity 11- Quantity
50, Quantity 51- 101+,
cost per 100, cost  cost per
each per each each
S 3035 $ 2935 $ 2850
S 5225 $ 5160 $ 50.70
S 5675 $ 5595 $ 55.00
S 6290 $ 6215 $ 61.55
S 4565 S 4495 $§ 4455
S 5160 $ 5070 $ 50.00
S 6630 S 6565 S 65.00
S 7830 $ 77.60 S 76.70
S 6215 S 6170 $§ 61.55
S 7565 S 7490 $§ 74.25
S 8215 $ 8170 $ 81.30
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC

12801 Commodity Place
Tampa, FL 33626-3104

Lot 2. Total Turn-key Pricing for Zinc or equal Signs,
F.I.S.H. (Florida Inventory of School Housing) Signs

Quantity 1- 'Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
Iltem |Standard Sizes each each per each per each

1 2x5 S 33.00|$S 2850 S 2850 |S 24.00
2 3x8 $ 7124 |S 598 S 59.86 S 49.08
3 3x10 S 8780 |S 7383 $ 7383 S 6135
4 3x12 $ 9212 |s 77.08 $ 77.08 S 63.48
5 4x5 $ 6020|S$ 5055 S 5055 |S 4140
6 4x6 $ 7124 |S 598 S 59.86 S 49.08
7 4x9 S 9212|S$ 7708 $ 77.08 S 63.48
8 4x12 S 121.16 ' $ 10144 S 10144 S 83.64
9 5x7 S 101.60 S 8546 S 8546 |S 70.20
10 5x9 S 11380 $ 9535 S 9535 $ 78.72
11 6x9 $ 13568 | S 113,62 $ 11362 S 93.72
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Lot 3. Total Turn-key Pricing for Acrylic and/or

Photopolymer (Nylon Polymer) Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida

Inventory of School Housing) Signs

Quantity 1- |Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per |50, cost per |100, cost 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 2x5 $ 2250|$ 2000 S 1350|S 9.50
2 3x8 S 40.00 $ 3400 S 2540 S 20.00
3 3x10 $ 4750|S$ 4000 S 3050 S 2450
4 3x12 S 5500/S 4600 S 3560 S 29.00
5 4x5 S 3500 $ 4000 S 2200 S 17.00
6 4x6 $ 40.00|S$S 3400 S 2540 S 20.00
7 4x9 S 55.00 $§ 4600 S 3560 S 29.00
8 4x12 $ 7000|$S 5800 S 4580 S 38.00

*Alternate*
Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.
P.O. Box 4144
Winter Park, FL 32793

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 3230 $ 3140 S 3055 S  29.50
S 5525 $ 5440 $ 5365 S 52.90
S 6090 $ 6030 S 59.70 $ 59.20
S 6633 S 6590 $ 6565 S 65.25
S 4805 $ 4710 S 46.10 $ 45.10
S 5435 $ 5350 $§ 5265 S 51.85
S 6980 $ 6935 S 6895 S 68.60
S 8190 $ 8130 S 8060 $ 80.10
S 6620 S 6540 S 6460 S 63.85
S 7960 $ 79.05 S 7840 S 77.85
S 8790 $ 8760 $ 87.10 S 86.75

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 2680 $§ 2620 S 2550 S 25.05
S 4360 S 4325 S 4210 S 41.10
S 5050 S 4990 S 4930 S 48.80
S 5510 S 5460 S 5395 S 53.65
S 3780 S 3715 $ 3660 S 35.90
S 4360 S 4325 S 4210 S 41.10
S 5510 S 5460 S 5395 S 53.65
S 7110 $§ 7010 S 69.10 S 68.10
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SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC
12801 Commodity Place
Tampa, FL 33626-3104

9 5x7 $ 5375|S$ 4500 $§ 3475 S 28.25
10 5x9 S 6625 § 5500 S 4325 S 3575
11 6x9 $ 7750|$S 6400 S 5090 S 4250
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Lot 4. Total Turn-key Pricing for Acrylic Fused and

Embedded or equal Building Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida

Inventory of School Housing) Signs

Quantity 1- |Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per |50, cost per |100, cost 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes each each per each per each

1 2x5 $ 2500|$ 2158 $§ 19.10 | $ 15.50
2 3x8 S 43.40|S 3809 $§ 3393 S 2792
3 3x10 S 53.00 $§ 46.18 S 4164 S 35.40
4 3x12 S 6260 S 5462 S 5203 S 40.88
5 4x5 S 37.00 § 3212 |S 2876 S 23.60
6 4x6 S 4340 $ 3774 'S 3393 § 27.92
7 4x9 $ 6260|S 5462 § 52.03 S 40.88
8 4x12 $ 77.00|S$ 6727 S 6096 S 50.60
9 5x7 $ 61.00|$ 5321 S 48.08 S 39.80
10 5x9 $ 7250|S$ 6331 § 5733 S 4757
11 6x9 S 8.00 S 7519 S 6821 S 56.68
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

*Alternate*

Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.

S 54.20
S 67.75
S 77.10

P.O. Box 4144
Winter Park, FL 32793

$ 5360 S 5295
S 6610 S 65.30
S 7650 S 75.85

S 5245
S 64.50
S 75.30

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost

each each per each

S 2835 § 2780 S 25.80
S 5070 S 4990 S 45.65
S 5705 S 5625 $§ 5230
S 6695 S 6600 S 59.50
S 4450 S 4325 S 40.10
S 5020 S 4870 S 46.10
S 6670 S 6540 S 59.50
S 7995 § 7895 S 7295
S 6560 S 6510 $ 58.00
S 7590 $§ 7520 S 68.20
S 8650 S 8540 S 82.00

101+, cost

per each

S 2450
S 43.45
S 50.40
S 57.25
S 38.20
S 43.00
S 56.50
S 70.20
S 55.10
S 67.00
S 77.50
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

*Alternate*
Creative Mailbox Designs LLC

12801 Commodity Place

Tampa, FL 33626-3104 P.O. Box 4144

Winter Park, FL 32793

Lot 5. Total Turn-key Pricing for Post and

Panel/Architectural Systems or Equal (non-illuminated)

Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.

Item ‘Standard Sizes ‘Cost per each Cost per each
A Post and Panel/Architectural Signage
1 4'W x21/2'Hsign S 824.00 S 1,884.30
2 6'Wx31/2'Hsign S 1,036.00 S 2,570.70
3 9'W x 4'Hsign S 1,282.00 S 3,495.00
B Wall Mount
1 4'W x21/2'Hsign S 455.00 S 1,200.00
2 6'Wx31/2'Hsign S 595.00 $ 1,750.00
3 9'W x 4'Hsign S 635.00 S 2,256.10
C Single Pole
1 3'x 3'sign ‘ S 448.00 S 1,305.00
Lot 6. Total Turn-key Pricing for Dimensional Letters
(non-illuminated)
Iltem ‘Standard Sizes ‘Cost per each Cost per each
A Formed Plastic Letters
1 3" high Not available in Kable font S 24.50
2 4" high S 9532 S 25.50
3 6" high S 98.20 S 26.65
4 8" high S 103.24 S 29.90
5 10" high Not available in Kabel font S 34.20
6 12" high S 108.80 S 35.95
B Cast Metal Letters
1 3" high S 101.80 S 28.30
2 4" high S 105.40 S 29.40
3 6" high S 111.40 S 37.25
4 8" high S 118.60 S 44.90
5 10" high S 128.20 S 52.90
6 12" high S 136.60 S 60.25
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR
SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION
4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC
12801 Commodity Place
Tampa, FL 33626-3104

*Alternate*®
Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.
P.O. Box 4144

Lot 7. Pricing for the Purchase of Magnesium Alloy or

Equal Signs
Quantity 1- |Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per |50, cost per |100, cost 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 2x5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 3x8 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 3x10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 3x12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
5 4x5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
6 4x6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 4x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
8 4x12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 5x7 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
10 5x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
11 6x9 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 8. Pricing for the Purchase of Zinc or Equal Signs
Quantity 1- |Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per |50, cost per |100, cost 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 2x5 $ 33.00|$ 2850 $§ 2850 S 24.00
2 3x8 S 7124 S 5986 S 59.86 S 49.08
3 3x10 $ 8780|S 7383 § 7383 S 6135
4 3x12 S 9212|S$ 7708 § 77.08 S 63.48
5 4x5 S 6020 $§ 5055|S 5055 S 41.40
6 4x6 $ 7124|S 5986 S 59.86 S 49.08
7 4x9 S 9212 § 7708 S 77.08 S 63.48
8 4x12 $ 12116 |$ 10144 S 101.44 | S 83.64
9 5x7 S 10160 'S 8546 |S 8546 S 70.20
10 5x9 S 11380 $§ 9535 S 9535 $§ 78.72

Winter Park, FL 32793

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 2140 $§ 2055 S 1960 S 18.86
S 3690 S 3650 S 3620 S 36.00
S 4520 S 4420 S 4350 S 42.90
S 4930 S 4890 S 4840 S 47.85
S 3595 § 3525 $ 3455 S 33,65
S 4010 S 3915 $§ 3865 S 37.95
S 5450 S 5380 S 5290 S 52.40
S 6600 S 6540 S 6470 S 63.60
S 5045 S 4975 S 4890 S  48.25
S 6310 $§ 6235 S 6160 S 60.85
S 7190 S 7080 S 6980 S 68.10

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 2230 $§ 2170 $ 2065 S 19.95
S 4180 S 4095 S 4010 S 39.05
S 4840 S 4770 S 4730 S 46.25
S 5615 § 5540 S 5460 S 53.50
S 3670 S 3640 S 3590 S 35.55
S 4210 $§ 4165 S 41.00 S 40.70
S 5870 S 5795 $§ 5720 S 56.10
S 7085 S§ 7035 S 6960 S 68.90
S 5540 S 5470 S 5390 S 52.80
S 6820 S 6755 S 6670 S 65.30
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SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC

12801 Commodity Place

Tampa, FL 33626-3104

11 6x9 $ 13568 $ 11362 $ 11362 $ 93.72
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 9. Pricing for the Purchase of Fused and Embedded
or Equal Signs
Quantity 1- 'Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
Iltem |Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 2x5 S 25.00 ' § 2158 S 19.10 S 15.50
2 3x8 S 4340 S 38.09|S 3393 S 27.92
3 3x10 S 53.00| S 46.18 | S 4164 S 35.40
4 3x12 $ 6260 $ 5462 5 5203 $ 40.88
5 4x5 $ 3700 $ 3212 $ 2876 $ 23.60
6 4x6 $ 4340 $ 3774 $ 3393 $ 2792
7 4x9 $ 6260 $ 5462 $ 5203 $ 40.88
8 4x12 S 77.00 ' S 67.27|5S 60.96 | S 50.60
9 5x7 S 6100 S 53.21|S$S 48.08 S 39.80
10 5x9 S 7250 'S 6331|S 57.33 S 47.57
11 6x9 S 8600 S 7519 S 68.21 | S 56.68
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 10. Pricing for the Purchase of Acrylic non-ADA
Quantity 1- |Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per |50, cost per |100, cost 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 Fire Alarm Control Panel Inside 12" x 18" S 4466 'S 3800 S 3500 S 29.00
2 Fire Department Connection 12" x 18" S 4466 S 3800 S 3500 S 29.00
3 Riser Room 3" x 6" S 10.00 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50
4 Fire Alarm Control Panel 3" x 6" S 10.00 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50
5 Fire Aid Emergency Shower 8" x 6" S 13.73 'S 1200 S 10.00 S 8.50
6 Emergency Eye Wash Station 8" x 6" S 13.73 § 1200 S 10.00 S 8.50
7 Emergency Power Shut Off 3" x 6" S 10.00 S 9.00 $ 7.00 S 5.50
8 Electrical Room No Storage 5" x 6" S 1055 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50

*Alternate*
Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.
P.O. Box 4144
Winter Park, FL 32793

S 7890 $§ 7810 S 7730 $ 76.30
Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 1875 S 1820 S 1650 S 15.20

S 3705 $§ 3650 S 3225 $ 3045

S 4405 S 4325 S 3930 S 37.40

S 5405 $ 5310 S 4650 S 44.25

S 3150 § 3025 S 27.10 $§ 25.20

S 3610 S 3420 S 3150 S 30.00

S 5340 $§ 5210 S 4650 $ 43.50

S 6710 $§ 6650 S 6005 $ 57.00

S 53.00 S 5250 S 4500 S 42.00

S 6320 $§ 6290 S 5520 $ 54.00

S 7510 S 7460 S 69.10 S 64.50
Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
each each per each per each

S 4830 $ 48.00 S 4760 S 46.25

S 4830 S 48.00 S 4750 S 46.25

S 935 §$ 9.05 $ 895 S 8.80

S 935 §$ 9.05 S 895 S 8.80

S 1525 $§ 1495 S 1475 S 14.25

S 1525 S 1495 S 1475 S 14.25

S 9.35 § 9.05 $ 895 S 8.80

S 1405 $ 1395 $§ 1380 S 13.25
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SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Creative Mailbox Designs LLC
12801 Commodity Place

Tampa, FL 33626-3104

9 Mechanical Room No Storage 5" x 6" S 1055 S 9.00 $ 7.00 S 5.50
10 Emergency Exit Do Not Block 3" x 6" S 10.00 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50
11 Emergency Exhaust Switch 1" x 3" S 10.00 S 9.00 $ 7.00 S 5.50
12 Emergency Gas Shut Off 1" x 3" S 10.00 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50
13 Flammable Storage No Smoking 6" x 5" S 1055 S 9.00 $ 7.00 S 5.50
14 Main Disconnect 3" x 6" S 10.00 S 9.00 | S 7.00 S 5.50
15 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 11. Pricing for the Purchase of Reflective Aluminum
non-ADA Signs
Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity
10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost 101+, cost
Iltem |Standard Sizes each each per each per each
1 Fire Alarm Control Panel Inside 12" x 18" S 2580 |'S 2324 S 2120 $ 17.60
2 Fire Department Connection 18" x 24" S 4742 S 4323 |S 40.12 S 33.82
3 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Lot 12. Pricing for other Signage

1

List any other signs and/or services that you may wish to be considered as part of this bid award:

*Alternate*

Gateway Graphic Systems, Inc.

P.O. Box 4144
Winter Park, FL 32793

S 1405 $ 1395 S 13.80
S 1085 S 1065 S 10.35
S 5.05 S 490 S 4.80
S 5.05 S 490 S 4.80
S 1405 $ 1395 S 13.80
S 935 S 9.05 S 8.95

13.25
10.20
4.65
4.65
13.25
8.80

wvrnunmnununon

Quantity 1- Quantity 11- Quantity 51- Quantity

10, cost per 50, cost per 100, cost

each each per each
$30.25 $29.05 $28.05
$46.75 $45.30 $44.11

101+, cost
per each

$26.95
$42.60

Pricing for Injection Molded acrylic ADA (red) "FIRE
Pricing for Emergency Egress Map Frame Systems:
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR
SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION
4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail
Kissimmee, FL 34744

Completed Invitation To Bid cover page YES
Completed Bid submittal form YES
Addendum 1 YES
Drug Free Certification YES
Debarment Certification YES
Emergency/ Storm related catastrophe agreement from YES
Conflict of Interest form YES
References YES
Licenses/Occupational YES
Proof of Insurance YES
Hold Harmless Agreement YES
Non-Disclosure Agreement for Confidential Materials NO
One Original, One Copy and Copy of Bid submittal on CD? YES
Samples as requested in Section 1.03, H. Required Samples YES
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION
Lot 1. Total Turn-key Pricing for Magnesium Alloy or
equal Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida Inventory of School
Housing) Signs
Quantity 1- Quantity |Quantity Quantity
10, 11-50, 51-100, 101+,
cost per | costper costper |costper
Iltem |Standard Sizes each each each each
1 2x5 S 2830 'S 2165 'S 1935 S 18.55
2 3x8 S 6795 'S 5195 S 46.40 $§ 44.45
3 3x10 S 8490 'S 6485 'S 58.00 $ 55.55
4 3x12 S 10190 'S 7790 $§ 69.60 $ 66.70
5 4x5 S 56.60 S 4325 'S 3865 S 37.05
6 4x6 S 6795 'S 5195 S 46.40 S 44.45
7 4x9 S 10190 S 7790 S 69.60 S 66.70
8 4x12 S 135.85|S$ 103.80 § 92.75 $ 88.90
9 5x7 S 99.05 'S 7570 S 67.65 S 64.80
10 5x9 S 12735|'S 9730 S 86.95 S 83.35
11 6x9 S 152.80 ' $ 116.80 | $ 104.40 $ 100.00
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Quantity 1- Quantity

10,
cost
each

W

RV2 R Vot Vo i Vo R Vo SR Vs SR Vo SR V0 S Vo R V0

per

22.50
40.00
47.50
55.00
35.00
40.00
55.00
70.00

53.75
66.25

77.50

*Primary*

Vital Signs of Orlando
2665 Pemberton Dr.

Apopka, FL 32703-9403

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

YES

NO

YES

YES

Quantity
11-50, 51-100,
cost per  cost per
each each
S 2200 $§ 21.40
S 3880 S 37.36
S 46.00 $ 44.20
S 53.20 $ 51.04
S 3400 $§ 32.80
S 3880 S 37.36
S 5320 $§ 51.04
S 6760 S 64.72
S 52.00 $ 49.90
S 6400 $ 61.30
S 7480 S 71.56

Quantity
101+,
cost per
each

W

21.40
37.36
44.20
51.04
32.80
37.36
51.04
64.72

49.90
61.30

71.56

R 72 0 Vo b Vo S Vo Vo S V0 SR U SR V0 R V0 B Vo
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail
Kissimmee, FL 34744

Lot 2. Total Turn-key Pricing for Zinc or equal Signs,
F.I.S.H. (Florida Inventory of School Housing) Signs

*Primary*
Vital Signs of Orlando
2665 Pemberton Dr.
Apopka, FL 32703-9403

Quantity |Quantity Quantity Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity Quantity 1- 11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost cost per |costper 101+, cost 10, cost costper costper 101+, cost
Iltem |Standard Sizes per each each each per each pereach each each per each
1 2x5 S 2460 $ 1880 'S 16.80|$ 16.10 $ 2130 $ 2090 $ 2030 S 20.30
2 3x8 S 59.05'S$ 4515 'S 4035 |$ 3865 S 3712 S 36.16 $§S 3472 S 3472
3 3x10 S 7380 $ 5640 |S 5040 |S 4830 S 4390 S 4270 S 4090 S 40.90
4 3x12 S 8860 S 6770 S 6050 |S 58.00 S 50.68 S 49.24 S 47.08 S 47.08
5 4x5 S 4920 $ 3760 |$S 3360|$ 3220 S 3260 S 31.80 $ 3060 S 30.60
6 4x6 S 59.05'S$ 4515 'S 4035 |$ 3865 S 3712 S 36.16 $S 3472 S 3472
7 4x9 S 8860 $ 6770 'S 6050|S 5800 S 50.68 S 4924 S 47.08 S 47.08
8 4x12 S 11810 $ 90.25|$S 8065|S 7730 S 6424 S 6232 S 5944 S 59.44
9 5x7 S 8610 'S 6580 S 5880 |$S 5635 S 4955 S 4815 $ 46.05 S 46.05
10 5x9 S 11070 $ 8460 'S 7560 |S 7245 S 60.85 S 59.05 $ 5635 S 56.35
11 6x9 S 132.85 'S 101.55'$S 90.75|$ 86.95 S 7102 S 6886 S 6562 S 65.62
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 3. Total Turn-key Pricing for Acrylic and/or
Photopolymer (Nylon Polymer) Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida
Inventory of School Housing) Signs
Quantity | Quantity Quantity Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity  Quantity 1- 11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost costper costper |101+, cost 10, cost costper costper 101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes per each |each each per each pereach each each per each
1 2x5 S 1660 'S 11.00 $§ 9.20|$ 870 SIGN PRICES ARE THE SAME FOR LOT 4 - see b
2 3x8 S 3985 $ 2640 'S 22.10|S$ 20.90 NO COST GIVEN FOR PHOTOPOLY - IT IS DOUE
3 3x10 S 4980 |S$ 33.00 $ 2760 $ 26.10
4 3x12 S 5980 $ 3960 $§ 33.15|$ 3135
5 4x5 S 3320 $ 22.00 $ 1840 S 17.40
6 4x6 S 3985 S 2640 S 2210 $ 20.88
7 4x9 S 5980 $ 3960 ' $§ 33.15|$ 3135
8 4x12 S 7970 |S 5280 S 4420 S 41.80
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR
SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION
4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail

Kissimmee, FL 34744

9 5x7 S 5810 'S 3850 $ 3220 S 3045
10 5x9 S 7470 'S 4950 'S 4140 $§ 39.15
11 6x9 S 89.65 'S 5940 S 49.70 S 47.00
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Lot 4. Total Turn-key Pricing for Acrylic Fused and

Embedded or equal Building Signs, F.I.S.H. (Florida

Inventory of School Housing) Signs

Quantity |Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost cost per |cost per
Item Standard Sizes per each |each each per each

1 2x5 S 1180 'S 820 'S 680|S 6.00
2 3x8 S 2835 'S 19.70 S 1635 S 14.40
3 3x10 S 3540 |$S 2460 $ 2040 S 18.00
4 3x12 S 4250 |$ 2955 $§ 2450 S 21.60
5 4x5 S 2360 |S 1640 $§ 13.60 S 12.00
6 4x6 S 2835 |$ 1970 $§ 1635 S 1440
7 4x9 S 4250 'S 2955 S 2450 S 21.60
8 4x12 S 56.65 'S 3940 S 3265 S 28.80
9 5x7 S 4130 'S 2870 S 23.80 S 21.00
10 5x9 S 53.10 'S 3690 S 30.60 S 27.00
11 6x9 S 63.75|S$ 4430 $ 36.75 'S 3240
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Vital

*Primary*
Signs of Orlando

2665 Pemberton Dr.
Apopka, FL 32703-9403

Quantity

Quantity

Quantity 1- 11-50,
101+, cost 10, cost
per each

S
s

$

15.60
23.44

26.80

30.16

21.20

23.44
30.16

36.88

29.60

35.20
40.24

cost
each

3
3

$

per

51-100,
cost per
each

Quantity
101+, cost
per each

15.00
22.00

25.00

S
s

$

14.40
20.56

23.20

$ 14.40
$ 2056
S

23.20
28.00

25.84 25.84

20.00 18.80 18.80
22.00

28.00

20.56
25.84

20.56
25.84
34.00

31.12 31.12

27.50 25.40 25.40
32.50

37.00

29.80
33.75

29.80
33.75
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TABSHEET “pri .
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR Sign A Rama ~_rrimary
SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION 2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail Vital Signs of Orlando
4/9/09 2:00 PM . 2665 Pemberton Dr.
Read By: Cheryl Jessee Kissimmee, FL 34744 Apopka, FL 32703-9403
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping
Lot 5. Total Turn-key Pricing for Post and
Panel/Architectural Systems or Equal (non-illuminated)
Item ‘Standard Sizes Cost per each Cost per each
A Post and Panel/Architectural Signage
1 4'W x21/2'Hsign S 1,482.15 S 1,005.00
2 6' W x 3 1/2' H sign S 1,980.75 $ 1,360.00
3 9'W x 4'H sign S 2,567.90 S 1,646.00
B Wall Mount
1 4'W x21/2'Hsign S 913.60 S 445.00
2 6' W x 3 1/2' H sign S 1,216.45 §$ 663.00
3 9'W x 4'H sign S 1,582.15 S 848.00
C Single Pole
1 3'x 3'sign S 1,19290 S 772.00
Lot 6. Total Turn-key Pricing for Dimensional Letters
(non-illuminated)
Iltem ‘Standard Sizes ‘Cost per each Cost per each
A Formed Plastic Letters
1 3" high S 16.50 unavailable
2 4" high S 19.00 S 10.75
3 6" high S 24.00 S 12.71
4 8" high S 27.00 S 16.15
5 10" high S 3150 S 28.89
6 12" high S 36.00 S 19.96
B Cast Metal Letters
1 3" high S 2400 S 16.48
2 4" high S 29.00 S 18.40
3 6" high S 39.00 S 22.50
4 8" high S 47.00 S 28.96
5 10" high S 5400 S 35.68
6 12" high S 63.00 S 42.40
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TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail

Kissimmee, FL 34744

*Primary*

Vital Signs of Orlando
2665 Pemberton Dr.

Apopka, FL 32703-9403

Lot 7. Pricing for the Purchase of Magnesium Alloy or
Equal Signs
Quantity |Quantity Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity Quantity 1- 11-50,
10, cost cost per costper |101+, cost 10, cost cost per
Item Standard Sizes per each |each each per each pereach each
1 2x5 S 2975|S 2275 '$ 2035|$ 1950 S 1650 $ 16.00
2 3x8 S 7135 'S 5455 S 4875|$S 46,70 S 3400 S 32.80
3 3x10 S 89.15 'S 6810 'S 6090 |$S 5835 S 4150 $ 40.00
4 3x12 S 107.00 ' $ 8180 'S 73.10|$ 70.05 S 49.00 S 47.20
5 4x5 S 5945 |S 4545 'S 4060 |S 3890 S 29.00 $ 28.00
6 4x6 S 7135 'S 5455 S 4875|$S 4670 S 3400 S 32.80
7 4x9 S 107.00 ' S 8180 'S 73.10|$S 70.05 S 49.00 S 47.20
8 4x12 S 14265 S 109.00 S 97.40|$ 9335 S 6400 $ 61.60
9 5x7 S 104.00 ' $ 7950 'S 71.05|$S 68.05 S 47.75 S 46.00
10 5x9 S 133.75|$ 10220 'S 9130 |$ 87.55 S 6025 $ 58.00
11 6x9 S 160.45 'S 122.65 'S 109.65|S$ 105.00 S 7150 S 68.80
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 8. Pricing for the Purchase of Zinc or Equal Signs
Quantity |Quantity Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity  Quantity 1- 11-50,
10, cost costper costper |101+, cost 10, cost cost per
Item Standard Sizes per each |each each per each pereach each
1 2x5 S 2585 |/S$ 1975 'S 1765|$ 1695 S 1530 $ 14.90
2 3x8 S 6200 'S 4745 'S 4240 |$S 4060 S 31.12 S 30.16
3 3x10 S 7750 S 5925 'S 5295|$ 50.75 S 3790 $ 36.70
4 3x12 S 93.05/S 7110 'S 6355|$S 6090 S 4468 S 4324
5 4x5 S 5170 'S 3950 'S 3530 |$ 3385 S 2660 S 25.80
6 4x6 S 6200 'S 4745 'S 4240|S$S 4060 S 31.12 $ 30.16
7 4x9 S 9305 'S 7110 'S 6355|S 6090 S 4468 S 43.24
8 4x12 S 12405'S 9480 S 8470 S 8120 S 5824 S 56.32
9 5x7 S 9045 |S 69.10 § 61.75 'S 5920 S 4355 $ 42.15
10 5x9 S 116.25|'S 8885 S 7940 'S 7610 S 5485 S 53.05

Quantity
51-100,
cost per
each

W

15.40
31.36
38.20
45.04
26.80

31.36
45.04

58.72
43.90
55.30
65.56

v nununoeaooeodonnnn

Quantity
51-100,
cost per
each

W

14.30
28.72

34.90
41.08

24.60
28.72
41.08
53.44
40.05
50.35

wvununnnonmonnn

Quantity

101+, cost
per each

15.40
31.36
38.20
45.04
26.80

31.36
45.04

58.72
43.90
55.30
65.56

“wmvnunmnrnoaoomdonnnnn

Quantity
101+, cost
per each
S 14.30
28.72

34.90
41.08

24.60
28.72
41.08
53.44
40.05
50.35

R0 T Vo B V0 R Vo Vo B V2 i V) B Vo i Vo

Page 12 of 14




SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail

Kissimmee, FL 34744

11 6x9 $ 139.50 $ 10665 $ 9530 $ 91.30
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 9. Pricing for the Purchase of Fused and Embedded
or Equal Signs
Quantity |Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost cost per |costper 101+, cost
Iltem |Standard Sizes per each each each per each
1 2x5 S 1240 S 8.65 S 7.15 S 6.30
2 3x8 S 2980 'S 2070 S 17.20 S 15.15
3 3x10 S 3720 'S 2585 S 2145 S 18.90
4  3x12 $ 4465 $ 31.05 $ 2575 $ 22.70
5  4x5 $ 2480 $ 1725 $ 1430 $ 12.60
6 4x6 $ 2980 ¢ 2070 $ 1720 $ 15.15
7 4x9 $ 4465 $ 3105 $ 2575 $ 22.70
8 4x12 S 5950 |S 4140 S 3430 S 30.25
9 5x7 S 4340 'S 30.15 'S 25.00 $ 22.05
10 5x9 S 5580 'S 3875 'S 3215 S 2835
11 6x9 S 6695 'S 4655 S 3860 S 34.04
12 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 10. Pricing for the Purchase of Acrylic non-ADA
Quantity |Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost cost per costper |101+, cost
Item Standard Sizes per each |each each per each
1 Fire Alarm Control Panel Inside 12" x 18" S 66.00 $ 6075 S 5810 S 56.10
2 Fire Department Connection 12" x 18" S 6600 $§ 60.75 § 5810 $§ 56.10
3 Riser Room 3" x 6" S 8.50 S 785 § 7.50 S 7.25
4 Fire Alarm Control Panel 3" x 6" S 850 $ 78 'S 750 $§ 7.25
5 Fire Aid Emergency Shower 8" x 6" S 1800 $§ 1660 |S 1585 S 15.30
6 Emergency Eye Wash Station 8" x 6" S 1800 $ 16.60 $§ 15.85 $§ 15.30
7 Emergency Power Shut Off 3" x 6" S 850 $§ 785|S 750 S 7.25
8 Electrical Room No Storage 5" x 6" S 1500 $§ 1380 $ 1320 $§ 12.75

*Primary*
Vital Signs of Orlando
2665 Pemberton Dr.
Apopka, FL 32703-9403

S 6502 S 6286 S 59.62 S 59.62

Quantity Quantity

Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity

10, cost cost per costper 101+, cost
per each each each per each

S 960 S 900 S 840 S 8.40
S 1744 S 1600 $§ 1456 S 14.56
S 2080 S 19.00 $ 17.20 $§ 17.20
S 2416 S 22.00 S 19.84 S 19.84
S 1520 $ 1400 $§ 1280 $ 12.80
S 1744 S 16.00 S 1456 S 14.56
S 2416 S 2200 $ 1984 S 19.84
S 3088 S 2800 $§ 2512 S 25.12
S 2360 S 2150 S 19.40 S 19.40
S 2920 $ 2650 $§ 23.80 S 23.80
S 4024 S 31.00 S 2775 S 27.75

Quantity Quantity

Quantity 1- 11-50, 51-100, Quantity

10, cost costper costper 101+, cost
per each each each per each

S 8424 S 7560 S 6480 S 64.80
S 8424 S 7560 S 64.80 S 64.80
S 702 $ 630 $§ 540 S 5.40
S 702 S 630 S 540 S 540
S 1872 S 1680 $ 14.40 S 14.40
S 1872 S 16.80 S 1440 S 14.40
S 702 $ 630 $§ 540 $ 5.40
S 1170 S 1050 $ 9.00 S 9.00
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SIGNAGE, PURCHASE & INSTALLATION

TABSHEET
BID # SDOC 09-B-083 KR

4/9/09 2:00 PM
Read By: Cheryl Jessee
Recorded By: Kristy Rumping

Sign A Rama
2583 N. Orange Blossom Trail
Kissimmee, FL 34744

9 Mechanical Room No Storage 5" x 6" S 1500 $§ 1380 'S 1320 'S 12.75
10 Emergency Exit Do Not Block 3" x 6" S 850 $ 78 'S 750 $ 7.25
11 Emergency Exhaust Switch 1" x 3" S 550 $ 510|S 485 S 4.70
12 Emergency Gas Shut Off 1" x 3" S 550 $ 510|$S 485 |S 470
13 Flammable Storage No Smoking 6" x 5" S 1500 $§ 1380 'S 13.20 'S 12.75
14 Main Disconnect 3" x 6" S 850 $ 78 'S 750 $§ 7.25
15 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:
Lot 11. Pricing for the Purchase of Reflective Aluminum
non-ADA Signs
Quantity |Quantity
Quantity 1-11-50, 51-100, Quantity
10, cost cost per |costper 101+, cost
Item |Standard Sizes per each each each per each
1 Fire Alarm Control Panel Inside 12" x 18" S 3295 $§ 2745 |S 20.20 S 16.40
2 Fire Department Connection 18" x 24" S 5645 S 4400 S 3495 $§ 29.70
3 If bidding equal, specify what type of material:

Lot 12. Pricing for other Signage

1

List any other signs and/or services that you mPlease see attached.

*Primary*
Vital Signs of Orlando
2665 Pemberton Dr.
Apopka, FL 32703-9403

S 11.70 $ 1050 § 9.00 $ 9.00
S 702 S 630 S 540 S 5.40
S 117 $§ 105 § 090 $ 0.90
S 117 S 105 $ 090 S 0.9
S 11.70 $ 1050 § 9.00 $ 9.00
S 702 S 630 S 540 S 540
Quantity Quantity

Quantity 1- 11-50, 51-100, Quantity

10, cost cost per costper 101+, cost
per each each each per each

$ 3000 $ 2775 $ 2525 S 25.25
S 60.00 $ 5550 $ 50.50 $ 50.50

See bid response for additional pricing.
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