

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-10-B-008-LC** PAGES _____
 GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____
 PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

ABC School Supply 1156 Four Star Drive Mount Jot, PA 17552	Apple Textbooks 2200 Winter Springs Blvd., Suite 106-315 Oviedo, FL 32765	Avanti Enterprises Inc. P.O. Box 3563 Oak Brook, IL 60522-3563	Baker & Taylor 2550 West Tyvola Road Charlotte, NC 28217	Barnes & Noble #2576 8358 S Orange Blossom Trail Orlando, FL 32809	BE PUBLISHING (Business Education Publishing) PO BOX 8558 WARWICK, RI 02888	Bedford, Freeman & Werth Publishing Group 4B Cedarbrook Drive Cranbury, NJ 08512
--	--	--	--	--	--	---

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Addendum 1	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Addendum 2		YES	YES	YES	YES		YES
Debarment Certification	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES		YES
Emergency/Storm Agreement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES		YES
Conflict of Interest	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
References	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Licenses / Occupational							
Proof of Insurance	YES	YES		YES		YES	YES
Hold Harmless	YES						YES
Non-Disclosure Agreement	YES						
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit			YES	YES	YES	YES	YES

Item #	PRICE SHEET						
	LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE						
1	Hard back Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	Up to 80% off Publisher Prices (varies by book/qty)	42.5%	32.0%	N/A	5.0% 0%
2	Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	Up to 80% off Publisher Prices (varies by book/qty)	35.0%	26.0%	N/A	5.0% 0%
3	Audio Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	-	40.0%	32.0%	N/A	N/A 0%

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-10-B-008-LC** PAGES _____
 GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____
 PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

ABC School Supply
 1156 Four Star Drive
 Mount Jot, PA 17552

Apple Textbooks
 2200 Winter Springs Blvd.,
 Suite 106-3115
 Oviedo, FL 32765

Avanti Enterprises Inc.
 P.O. Box 3563
 Oak Brook, IL 60522-3563

Baker & Taylor
 2550 West Tyvola Road
 Charlotte, NC 28217

Barnes & Noble #2576
 8358 S Orange Blossom Trail
 Orlando, FL 32809

BE PUBLISHING
 (Business Education Publishing)
 PO BOX 8558
 WARWICK, RI 02888

Bedford, Freeman & Werth
 Publishing Group
 4B Cedarbrook Drive
 Cranbury, NJ 08512

4	Educational Material % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	-	15.0%	*	N/A	5.0%	0%
5	Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	\$ 100.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
6	Quote Number (if applicable)	200922300555	3479	AV - 008	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
7	Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	15 - 30 Days	7 - 10 Days	30 Days	** Days	7 Days	14 Days	7-10 Days
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE								
1	Hard back Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	Up to 80% off Publisher Prices (varies by book/qty)	42.5%	No Bid	See Note	5.0%	0%
2	Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	Up to 80% off Publisher Prices (varies by book/qty)	35.0%	No Bid	See Note	5.0%	0%
3	Audio Books % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	-	40.0%	No Bid	See Note	N/A	0%
4	Educational Material % _____ Discount	12% See Attached	-	15.0%	No Bid	See Note	5.0%	0%

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# **SDOC-10-B-008-LC** PAGES _____
 GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____
 PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

		ABC School Supply 1156 Four Star Drive Mount Jot, PA 17552	Apple Textbooks 2200 Winter Springs Blvd., Suite 106-315 Oviedo, FL 32765	Avanti Enterprises Inc. P.O. Box 3563 Oak Brook, IL 60522-3563	Baker & Taylor 2550 West Tyvola Road Charlotte, NC 28217	Barnes & Noble #2576 8358 S Orange Blossom Trail Orlando, FL 32809	BE PUBLISHING (Business Education Publishing) PO BOX 8558 WARWICK, RI 02888	Bedford, Freeman & Werth Publishing Group 4B Cedarbrook Drive Cranbury, NJ 08512
5	Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	N/A	-	N/A	N/A	See Note	N/A	0%
6	Minimum Order (if applicable)	*See Above	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	0%
7	Quote Number (if applicable)	200922300555	3479	AV-008	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
6	Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	15 - 30 Days	7 - 10 Days	30 Days	N/A	7 Days	14 Days	7-10 Days

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
 BID# SDOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
 DATE/TIME: 9/02/09 @2:00 PM
BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 READ BY: _____
 RECORDED BY: _____
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

ABC School Supply
 1156 Four Star Drive
 Mount Jot, PA 17552

Apple Textbooks
 2200 Winter Springs Blvd.,
 Suite 106-3115
 Oviedo, FL 32765

Avanti Enterprises Inc.
 P.O. Box 3563
 Oak Brook, IL 60522-3563

Baker & Taylor
 2550 West Tyvola Road
 Charlotte, NC 28217

Barnes & Noble #2576
 8358 S Orange Blossom Trail
 Orlando, FL 32809

BE PUBLISHING
 (Business Education Publishing)
 PO BOX 8558
 WARWICK, RI 02888

Bedford, Freeman & Werth
 Publishing Group
 4B Cedarbrook Drive
 Cranbury, NJ 08512

*12% Discount with minimum order of \$100.00. Offer excludes Joy Carpets and drop ship items in Active Play and Playground section of the catalog. Offer not valid on sale flyers or Internet orders. And cannot be combined w.any other promotional offer(s)

**SEE ATTACHED FOR SHIPPING AND PAYMENT TERMS

SEE ATTACHED On how to place orders and contact information.

\$0-\$499, RECEIVES A 20% DISCOUNT. A PURCHASE AMOUNT OF \$5000 + RECEIVES A 25% DISCOUNT. 10% DISCOUNT ON ROSETTA STONE MERCHANDISE

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
FOR BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

	Books-A-Million 127 W Park Dr Birmingham, AL 35211-4470	Booksource, Inc. 1230 Macklind Ave. St. Louis, MO 63110	Bridge Books, Inc. 17 E 200 N #209 Provo, UT 84606	Budgetext Corporation 1936 North Shiloh Drive Fayetteville, AR 72704	Capstone Publishers 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Childcraft Education 1156 Four Star Drive Mount Joy, PA 17552	Children's Plus, inc 1387 Dutch American Beecher, IL 60401	Complete Book & Media Supply 715 Discovery Blvd 301 Cedar Park, TX 78613
Indemnity - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Employee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Item 1		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Item 2		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Insurance Certification	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Confidentiality/Storm Agreement	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Conflict of Interest	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
References	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
Professional / Occupational								
Insurance		YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	
Liability Waiver								
Indemnification Agreement				YES				
Intellectual Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit				YES				YES
PRICE SHEET								
LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE								
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	30 % or more	30%	N/A	*15-75%	25-30% OFF LIST*	12*See above label & attached letterhead	25%	5-35%
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	28% or more	30%	See Attachment #1	*15-75%	N/A	12*See above label & attached letterhead	25%	5-35%
Audio Books % _____ Discount	20% or more	30%	N/A	NO BID	0%	12*See above label & attached letterhead	25%	5-35%

QUOTATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES _____
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
\$ & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

Books-A-Million 127 W Park Dr Birmingham, AL 35211-4470	Booksource, Inc. 1230 Macklind Ave. St. Louis, MO 63110	Bridge Books, Inc. 17 E 200 N #209 Provo, UT 84606	Budgetext Corporation 1936 North Shiloh Drive Fayetteville, AR 72704	Capstone Publishers 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Childcraft Education 1156 Four Star Drive Mount Joy, PA 17552	Children's Plus, inc 1387 Dutch American Beecher, IL 60401	Complete Book & Media Supply 715 Discovery Blvd 301 Cedar Park, TX 78613
---	---	--	--	---	---	--	---

Educational Material % _____ Discount	N/A	30%	See Attachment #1	*15-75%	25-30% OFF LIST*	12*See above label & attached letterhead	25%	5-35%
--	-----	-----	----------------------	---------	---------------------	--	-----	-------

Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	NONE	N/A	See Attachment #1	NONE	NONE	See above label & attached letterhead	N/A	\$100.00 FOR FREE FREIGHT
---	------	-----	----------------------	------	------	---	-----	---------------------------------

Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	N/A	NONE	N/A	200922300855	N/A	N/A
------------------------------	-----	-----	-----	------	-----	--------------	-----	-----

Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	WITHIN 7-14 Days	30 Days	30 Days	3-5 DAYS IN STOCK 7-14 DAYS SPECIAL ORDER	7-10 Days ARO**	15-30 days ARO	28 days	7-10 days
--	---------------------	---------	---------	---	--------------------	----------------	---------	-----------

LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE

Hard back Books % _____ Discount	30 % or more	30%	N/A	*15-75%	25-30% OFF LIST*	12*See above label & attached letterhead	NO RETAIL LOCATION	5-35%
-------------------------------------	-----------------	-----	-----	---------	---------------------	--	-----------------------	-------

Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	28% or more	30%	See Attachment #1	*15-75%	N/A	12*See above label & attached letterhead		5-35%
-------------------------------------	----------------	-----	----------------------	---------	-----	--	--	-------

Audio Books % _____ Discount	20% or more	30%	N/A	NO BID	0%	12*See above label & attached letterhead		5-35%
---------------------------------	----------------	-----	-----	--------	----	--	--	-------

Educational Material % _____ Discount	N/A	30%	See Attachment #1	*15-75%	25-30% OFF LIST*	12*See above label & attached letterhead		5-35%
--	-----	-----	----------------------	---------	---------------------	--	--	-------

LATION SHEET FOR: _____ PAGES _____
DOC-10-B-008-LC
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Books-A-Million 127 W Park Dr Birmingham, AL 35211-4470	Booksource, Inc. 1230 Macklind Ave. St. Louis, MO 63110	Bridge Books, Inc. 17 E 200 N #209 Provo, UT 84606	Budgetext Corporation 1936 North Shiloh Drive Fayetteville, AR 72704	Capstone Publishers 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Childcraft Education 1156 Four Star Drive Mount Joy, PA 17552	Children's Plus, inc 1387 Dutch American Beecher, IL 60401	Complete Book & Media Supply 715 Discovery Blvd 301 Cedar Park, TX 78613
Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	YES	N/A	N/A	NOT APPLICABLE	N/A	N/A Catalog discount See above	N/A
Minimum Order (if applicable)	NONE	N/A	See Attachment #1	NONE	NONE	*See above label & attached letterhead	\$100.00 FOR FREE FREIGHT
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	N/A	NONE	NONE	200922300855	N/A
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	7-14 days	30 Days	30 Days	3-5 DAYS IN STOCK 7-14 DAYS SPECIAL ORDER	7-10 Days ARO**	15-30 Days ARO	7-10 days

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Books-A-Million
 127 W Park Dr
 Birmingham, AL 35211-4470

Booksource, Inc.
 1230 Macklind Ave.
 St. Louis, MO 63110

Bridge Books, Inc.
 17 E 200 N #209
 Provo, UT 84606

Budgetext Corporation
 1936 North Shiloh Drive
 Fayetteville, AR 72704

Capstone Publishers
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

Childcraft Education
 1156 Four Star Drive
 Mount Joy, PA 17552

Children's Plus, inc
 1387 Dutch American
 Beecher, IL 60401

Complete Book & Media
 Supply
 715 Discovery Blvd 301
 Cedar Park, TX 78613

5% - 17% DISCOUNT

*Note - discount
 is good for all
 new & used
 items. Books-
 textbooks-
 reference-
 workbooks.
 Free shipping
 (standard on all
 orders)

*Reflected as
 school/library
 price.
 **Orders with
 library
 processing may
 take up to 2-2-
 1/2 weeks ARO

12% DISCOUNT
 W/MINIMUM
 ORADER \$100.

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Delaney Educational Enterprise 1455 West Morena Blvd. San Diego, CA 92110	DEMCO Inc. 4810 Forest Run Road Madison, WI 53704	Didax Inc. 395 Main St. Rowley, MA 01969	EAI EDUCATION Eric Armin Inc. 118 Bauer Dr. Oakland, NJ 07436	E T A / Cuisenaire 500 Greenview Ct Vernon Hills, IL 60061	Educational Resources P.O. Box 1900 Elgin, IL 60121	Educators Outlet P.O. Box 397 Timnath, CO 80547	Follet Educational Services 1433 International Pkwy. Woodridge, IL 60517	
ed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
ee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
um 1	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
um 2	YES	YES			YES	YES	YES	
ent Certification	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
ncy/Storm Agreement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
of Interest	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
ces	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
/ Occipational	YES							
Insurance	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
rmless				YES			YES	
closure Agreement								
l Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit	YES	YES		YES N/A				
PRICE SHEET								
LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE					USED OWN PRICE SHEET			
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	0-30%	7%	0%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS		N/A	15%	5% Off FES CATALOG PRICES
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	10%	7%	0%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS		N/A	15%	5% Off FES CATALOG PRICES
Audio Books % _____ Discount	5%	7%	0%			N/A		0% DISCOUNTED PRICE IS REFLECTED IN FES CATALOG

LATION SHEET FOR: _____ PAGES _____
DOC-10-B-008-LC
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
RESOURCES & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

Delaney Educational Enterprise 1455 West Morena Blvd. San Diego, CA 92110	DEMCO Inc. 4810 Forest Run Road Madison, WI 53704	Didax Inc. 395 Main St. Rowley, MA 01969	EAI EDUCATION Eric Armin Inc. 118 Bauer Dr. Oakland, NJ 07436	E T A / Cuisenaire 500 Greenview Ct Vernon Hills, IL 60061	Educational Resources P.O. Box 1900 Elgin, IL 60121	Educators Outlet P.O. Box 397 Timnath, CO 80547	Follet Educational Services 1433 International Pkwy. Woodridge, IL 60517
Educational Material % _____ Discount	0-10%	7%	20%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS	PLEASE SEE ATTACHED LETTER AND DOCUMENT ATION	15%	5% Off FES CATALOG PRICES
Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	N/A	\$ 50.00	\$15.00 ONLINE		N/A	N/A	0
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	C73084		SDOC-10-B-008-LC	27186	B11005	SDOC-10-B-008-LC
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	35 Days	7-10 Days	7-14 Days	5-7 Business Days	3-15 Days	15 days on instock items	5-10 BUSINESS DAYS UPON RECEIPT OF PURCHASE ORDER
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE							
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	0-30%	7%	0%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS		15%	NO RETAIL LOCATION
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	10%	7%	0%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS		15%	NO RETAIL LOCATION
Audio Books % _____ Discount	5%	7%	0%				NO RETAIL LOCATION
Educational Material % _____ Discount	0-10%	7%	20%	15% WITH EXCEPTIONS		15%	NO RETAIL LOCATION

LATION SHEET FOR: _____ PAGES _____
DOC-10-B-008-LC
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Delaney Educational Enterprise 1455 West Morena Blvd. San Diego, CA 92110	DEMCO Inc. 4810 Forest Run Road Madison, WI 53704	Didax Inc. 395 Main St. Rowley, MA 01969	EAI EDUCATION Eric Armin Inc. 118 Bauer Dr. Oakland, NJ 07436	E T A / Cuisenaire 500 Greenview Ct Vernon Hills, IL 60061	Educational Resources P.O. Box 1900 Elgin, IL 60121	Educators Outlet P.O. Box 397 Timnath, CO 80547	Follet Educational Services 1433 International Pkwy. Woodridge, IL 60517
Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	N/A	\$ 50.00	N/A	No Store Catalog Purchase only		N/A	NO RETAIL LOCATION
Minimum Order (if applicable)	N/A	\$ 50.00		0**		N/A	
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	C73084		SDOC-10-B-008-LC		B11005	
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	35 Days	7-10 Days	7-14 Days	5-7 Business Days		15 Days on in stock items	

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Delaney Educational
 Enterprise
 1455 West Morena Blvd.
 San Diego, CA 92110

DEMCO Inc.
 4810 Forest Run Road
 Madison, WI 53704

Didax Inc.
 395 Main St.
 Rowley, MA 01969

EAI EDUCATION
 Eric Armin Inc.
 118 Bauer Dr.
 Oakland, NJ 07436

E T A / Cuisenaire
 500 Greenview Ct
 Vernon Hills, IL 60061

Educational Resources
 P.O. Box 1900
 Elgin, IL 60121
 Discount
 20%-40%

Educators Outlet
 P.O. Box 397
 Timnath, CO 80547

Follet Educational Services
 1433 International Pkwy.
 Woodridge, IL 60517
 *Excludes
 FollettBound.
 FollettBound
 already
 discounted.
 Discounted price
 is reflected in
 our FES Catalog
 ** Excludes
 Dictionaries,
 Thesauruses,
 Reference
 Books. Prices
 are already
 discounted.
 Discounted
 prices are
 reflected in our
 catalog

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Follett Library Resources 1340 Ridgeview Dr. McHenry, IL 60050	Gale, Cengage Learning 27500 Drake Road Farmington Hill, MI 48331	Gareth Stevens Classroom 111 East 14th Street Suite 349 New York, NY 10003	Gareth Stevens Publishing PO Box 360140 Stronsville, OH 44136	Gumdrop Books P.O. Box 505 Bethany, MO 65525-0505	Heinemann Raintree Classroom 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Heinemann Raintree Library 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Junction of Function, Inc. 8603 Ibis Coves Circle Naples, FL 34119-7728
ed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
um 1	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
um 2	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
ent Certification		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ncy/Storm Agreement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
of Interest	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ces	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
/ Occupational							
Insurance	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	
rmless	N/A						YES
closure Agreement	N/A						
l Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit	N/A						YES
PRICE SHEET							
LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE							
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	*Up to 45%	*	NO BID	25% OFF LIST *	0-70%	N/A	30% Off List
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	*Up to 45%	*	0%	NO BID	0-40%	0%	N/A
Audio Books % _____ Discount	Net Catalog Price		0%	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	N/A

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
\$ & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

	Follett Library Resources 1340 Ridgeway Dr. McHenry, IL 60050	Gale, Cengage Learning 27500 Drake Road Farmington Hill, MI 48331	Gareth Stevens Classroom 111 East 14th Street Suite 349 New York, NY 10003	Gareth Stevens Publishing PO Box 360140 Stronsville, OH 44136	Gumdrop Books P.O. Box 505 Bethany, MO 65525-0505	Heinemann Raintree Classroom 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Heinemann Raintree Library 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Junction of Function, Inc. 8603 Ibis Coves Circle Naples, FL 34119-7728
Educational Material % _____ Discount	**Up to 45%		0%	0% OFF LIST *	NO BID	0%	30% OFF LIST	
Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	N/A	0	\$1.00	\$1.00	N/A	NONE	NONE	
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	200902-P215	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	15 - 17 Days	7-10** DAYS	7-10 Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days	10-15 Business Days	7-10 Days ARO	7-10 Days ARO*	7-10 Business Days
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE								
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	N/A	GALE DOES NOT HAVE RETAIL OUTLETS	NO BID	25% OFF LIST *	0-70%	N/A	30% Off List	
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	N/A		0%	NO BID	0-40%	0%	N/A	
Audio Books % _____ Discount	N/A		0%	NO BID	NO BID	N/A	N/A	
Educational Material % _____ Discount	N/A		0%	0% OFF LIST *	NO BID	0%	30% OFF LIST	25%

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	N/A		NOT AVAILABLE	NOT AVAILABLE	Not Applicable	N/A	N/A	
Minimum Order (if applicable)	N/A		\$1.00	\$1.00	N/A	NONE	NONE	\$1,000.00
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A	10-15 Business Days	N/A	
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	N/A		7-10 Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days W/PROCES	10-15 Business Days	7-10 Days ARO	7-10 Days ARO*	

Follett Library Resources
 1340 Ridgeview Dr.
 McHenry, IL 60050

Gale, Cengage Learning
 27500 Drake Road
 Farmington Hill, MI 48331

Gareth Stevens Classroom
 111 East 14th Street
 Suite 349
 New York, NY 10003

Gareth Stevens Publishing
 PO Box 360140
 Stronsville, OH 44136

Gumdrop Books
 P.O. Box 505
 Bethany, MO 65525-0505

Heinemann Raintree
 Classroom
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

Heinemann Raintree Library
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

Junction of Function, Inc.
 8603 Ibis Coves Circle
 Naples, FL 34119-7728

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Follett Library Resources
 1340 Ridgeview Dr.
 McHenry, IL 60050

 *FOLLETT
 LIRBRADY
 RESOURCE
 ONLINE
 CATALOG
 PRICES
 REFLECT UP
 TO 45%
 DISCOUNT
 FOR TRADE.
 PAPERBACK
 BINDINGS UP
 TO 30%, UP
 TO 40% FOR
 GENERAL
 FOR
 GENERAL
 REFERENCE,
 30%
 DISCOUNT
 FROM THE
 PUBLISHED
 LIST PRICE.
 **EDUCATIO
 NAL
 MATERIAL
 MAY
 INCLUDE
 BOOKS,
 BILINGUAL
 MATERIALS,
 TEACHER

Gale, Cengage Learning
 27500 Drake Road
 Farmington Hill, MI 48331

 *Catalogs
 reflect
 discounts
 ranging from
 0 - 70%.
 **
 Unprocessed
 ARE

Gareth Stevens Classroom
 111 East 14th Street
 Suite 349
 New York, NY 10003

Gareth Stevens Publishing
 PO Box 360140
 Stronsville, OH 44136

 * Catalog
 show both list
 and discount
 prices
 See
 attached:
 1. Service
 Policy
 2. Addendum
 standars and
 Deviations

Gumdrop Books
 P.O. Box 505
 Bethany, MO 65525-0505

Heinemann Raintree
 Classroom
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

Heinemann Raintree Library
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

 *Orders with
 libradly
 processing
 may take up
 to 2-2-1/2
 weeks ARO.

Junction of Function, Inc.
 8603 Ibis Coves Circle
 Naples, FL 34119-7728

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Junior Library Guild 7858 Industrial Pkwy Plain City, OH 43064	KAPLAN 1310 Lewisville-Clemmons Rd. Lewisville, NC 27023-0609	Lakeshore Learning Materials 2695 E. Dominguez St. Carson, CA 90810	Learning Links Inc. 2300 Marcus Avenue New Hyde Park, NY 11042	Learning Services P.O. Box 10636 Eugene, OR 97440-2636	Library Video Company 7 E. Wynnewood Road Wynnewood, PA 19096	Mackin Library Media 3505 County Road 42 W Bursville, MN 55306-3803	Neat Solutions For Healthy Children, Inc 6645 Alambra Ave. Martinez, CA 94553-6104	Perfection Learning 1000 N. 2nd Avenue Logan, IA 51546
ed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
um 1	YES	YES			YES	YES	YES	YES
um 2	YES	YES			YES	YES	YES	YES
ent Certification	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ncy/Storm Agreement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
of Interest	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ces	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
/ Occupational			YES				YES	
Insurance	YES	YES	YES			YES	YES	YES
rmless	N/A						YES	
closure Agreement					YES			
l Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit	N/A			YES	YES		YES	YES
PRICE SHEET								
LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE								
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	Up to 55% off the publisher's retail price	17*	5%	20%			5%	*10% 30%
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%			5%	*10% 30%
Audio Books % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%		0*	5%	N/A NO BID

QUOTATION SHEET FOR: **DOC-10-B-008-LC** PAGES _____
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
\$ & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

	Junior Library Guild 7858 Industrial Pkwy Plain City, OH 43064	KAPLAN 1310 Lewisville-Clemmons Rd. Lewisville, NC 27023-0609	Lakeshore Learning Materials 2695 E. Dominguez St. Carson, CA 90810	Learning Links Inc. 2300 Marcus Avenue New Hyde Park, NY 11042	Learning Services P.O. Box 10636 Eugene, OR 97440-2636	Library Video Company 7 E. Wynnewood Road Wynnewood, PA 19096	Mackin Library Media 3505 County Road 42 W Bursville, MN 55306-3803	Neat Solutions For Healthy Children, Inc 6645 Alambra Ave. Martinez, CA 94553-6104	Perfection Learning 1000 N. 2nd Avenue Logan, IA 51546
Educational Material % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%	10-3%	0*	5%		0%
Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	N/A	\$100.00	NONE	N/A			N/A	\$50.00	N/A
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	1108	N/A	N/A	FL-SDOC- 10-B-008- LC		OSCEOL		219082
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	14 Days	5 Days For instock items 30 days for Backorders	7-10 Days	10-14 days	7-14 Days	3-5 Business Days	30-60 Days	10 Days	14-21 Days
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE									
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	Up to 55% off the publisher's retail price	17*	5%	20%			N/A	N/A	30%
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%			N/A	N/A	30%
Audio Books % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%		0*	N/A	N/A	NO BID
Educational Material % _____ Discount	N/A	17*	5%	20%		0*	N/A	N/A	0%

QUOTATION SHEET FOR: PAGES
DOC-10-B-008-LC
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
FOR SUPPLIES & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRES **BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09**.

Junior Library Guild 7858 Industrial Pkwy Plain City, OH 43064	KAPLAN 1310 Lewisville-Clemmons Rd. Lewisville, NC 27023-0609	Lakeshore Learning Materials 2695 E. Dominguez St. Carson, CA 90810	Learning Links Inc. 2300 Marcus Avenue New Hyde Park, NY 11042	Learning Services P.O. Box 10636 Eugene, OR 97440-2636	Library Video Company 7 E. Wynnewood Road Wynnewood, PA 19096	Mackin Library Media 3505 County Road 42 W Bursville, MN 55306-3803	Neat Solutions For Healthy Children, Inc 6645 Alambra Ave. Martinez, CA 94553-6104	Perfection Learning 1000 N. 2nd Avenue Logan, IA 51546
Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	N/A	N/A	0%	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A
Minimum Order (if applicable)	N/A	\$100.00	N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	N/A
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	1108	N/A	N/A		N/A	N/A	219082
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	14 Days	5 Days For instock items 30 days for Backorders	7-10 Days	10-14 days		N/A	N/A	14-21 Days

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09

Junior Library Guild
 7858 Industrial Pkwy
 Plain City, OH 43064
 *Our prices
 for books are
 at set prices.
 Books are
 priced at
 \$13.24, \$9.00
 or \$5.00 per
 book.

KAPLAN
 1310 Lewisville-Clemmons
 Rd.
 Lewisville, NC 27023-0609
 *EXCLUSIONS
 APPLY
 NOT VALID
 WITH ANY
 OTHER SALES
 OFFERS, BIDS,
 QUOTES,
 COUPONS OR
 DISCOUNTS
 **IF YOU NEED
 PRICE QUOTES
 ON
 PLAYGROUND
 EQUIPMENT,
 STRUCTURES,
 UNITS,
 MATERIALS OR
 SERVICES OF
 PLAYGROUND
 PLEASE CALL.

Lakeshore Learning Materials
 2695 E. Dominguez St.
 Carson, CA 90810

Learning Links Inc.
 2300 Marcus Avenue
 New Hyde Park, NY 11042

Learning Services
 P.O. Box 10636
 Eugene, OR 97440-2636

Library Video Company
 7 E. Wynnewood Road
 Wynnewood, PA 19096
 * See
 attachments I
 -
 Clarificatons
 and
 exceptions.
 *See
 attached
 cover letter

Mackin Library Media
 3505 County Road 42 W
 Bursville, MN 55306-3803

Neat Solutions For Healthy
 Children, Inc
 6645 Alambra Ave.
 Martinez, CA 94553-6104
 * DISCOUNT
 HIGHER IS
 HIGHER
 FOR MORE
 BOOKS
 THAT ARE
 ORDERED

Perfection Learning
 1000 N. 2nd Avenue
 Logan, IA 51546
 *30%
 discount is
 already
 reflect in
 catalog &
 web pricing.
 Discount is
 from current
 list price.
 Proprietary
 products
 excluded
 from
 discount.
 Please
 reference bid
 #SDOC-10-
 B-009-LC to
 qualify for
 discount.

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

	PowerKids Press 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rainbow Book Company 500 East Main Street Lake Zurich, IL 60047	Red Brick Learning 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Renaissance Learning, Inc. 2911 Peach Street Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494	Rosen Classroom 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rosen Publishing 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Step To Literacy P.O. Box 6737 Bridgewater, NJ 08807	Super Duper Publications 5201 Pelham Rd. Greenville, SC 29615
ed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
um 1	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
um 2	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ent Certification	YES	YES	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES
ncy/Storm Agreement	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
of Interest	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
ces	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
/ Occipational							YES	
Insurance	YES		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES
rmless		YES						
closure Agreement								
l Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit				YES			YES	
PRICE SHEET								
LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE								
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	25% OFF LIST *	25% OFF PUBLISHERS LIST PRICE	N/A	NO BID	25% OFF LIST *	NO BID	5%	N/A
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	NO BID	N/A	*0%	NO BID	NO BID	0	5%	N/A
Audio Books % _____ Discount	NO BID	N/A	0%	NO BID	NO BID	0	5%	N/A

QUOTATION SHEET FOR: DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES _____ CROSS THEN DOWN TIME: 9/02/09 @2:00 PM FOR & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL BY: _____ ORDERED BY: _____ REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL <u>9/22/09</u> .	PowerKids Press 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rainbow Book Company 500 East Main Street Lake Zurich, IL 60047	Red Brick Learning 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Renaissance Learning, Inc. 2911 Peach Street Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494	Rosen Classroom 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rosen Publishing 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Step To Literacy P.O. Box 6737 Bridgewater, NJ 08807	Super Duper Publications 5201 Pelham Rd. Greenville, SC 29615
Educational Material % _____ Discount	0% OFF LIST *	N/A	*0%	0%*	0% OFF LIST *	0	5%	0%
Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	\$1.00	N/A	NONE	There is a minimum order of 20 quizzes when ordering Accelerated Reader quizzes online	\$1.00	\$ 1.00	NONE	\$20.00
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A		N/A	N/a	N/A	N/A 7-10 Days	Bid # SDOC-10- B-008-LC	N/A
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days W/PROCESSING	21-42 Days	7-10 Days ARO	7-10 Business Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days W/PROCESSING		10-14 Days	7-10 Business Days
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE								
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	25% OFF LIST *	25% OFF PUBLISHERS LIST PRICE	N/A	NO BID	25% OFF LIST *	NO BID	5%	N/A
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	NO BID	N/A	*0%	NO BID	NO BID	0	5%	N/A
Audio Books % _____ Discount	NO BID	N/A	0%	NO BID	NO BID	0	5%	N/A
Educational Material % _____ Discount	0% OFF LIST *	N/A	*0%	NO BID	0% OFF LIST *	0	5%	0%

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

PowerKids Press 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rainbow Book Company 500 East Main Street Lake Zurich, IL 60047	Red Brick Learning 151 Good Counsel Dr. P.O. Box 669 Mankato, MN 56002-0669	Renaissance Learning, Inc. 2911 Peach Street Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494	Rosen Classroom 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Rosen Publishing 29 East 21st Street New York, NY 10010	Step To Literacy P.O. Box 6737 Bridgewater, NJ 08807	Super Duper Publications 5201 Pelham Rd. Greenville, SC 29615	
Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?	NOT AVAILABLE	N/A	NONE	NO BID	NOT AVAILABLE	NOT AVAILABLE	This Option is not Available	N/A
Minimum Order (if applicable)	\$1.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$1.00	\$ 1.00	NONE	\$20.00
Quote Number (if applicable)	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	BID # SDOC-10-B-008-LC	N/A
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days W/PROCESSING	21-42 Days	7-10 Days ARO	N/A	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days W/PROCESSING	7-10 Days	10-14 Days	7-10 Business Days

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

PowerKids Press
 29 East 21st Street
 New York, NY 10010

Rainbow Book Company
 500 East Main Street
 Lake Zurich, IL 60047

Red Brick Learning
 151 Good Counsel Dr.
 P.O. Box 669
 Mankato, MN 56002-0669

Renaissance Learning, Inc.
 2911 Peach Street
 Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54494

Rosen Classroom
 29 East 21st Street
 New York, NY 10010

Rosen Publishing
 29 East 21st Street
 New York, NY 10010

Step To Literacy
 P.O. Box 6737
 Bridgewater, NJ 08807

Super Duper Publications
 5201 Pelham Rd.
 Greenville, SC 29615

* Catalog show both list and discount prices
 See attached:
 1. Service Policy
 2. Addendum standars and Deviations

*VARIOUS PROGRAMS ARE DISCOUNTED 5-10%. CATALOG PRICING REFLECTS DISCOUNT.

* Catalog show both list and discount prices
 See attached: 1. Service Policy
 2. Addendum standars and Deviations

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Textbook Warehouse
 936 Currie Drive
 Alpharetta, GA 30005

Windmill Books
 303 Park Avenue South
 Suite 1280
 New York, NY 10010-3657

ed - Non Collusion Form	YES	YES
ee Workplace Certification Form	YES	YES
um 1		YES
um 2		YES
ent Certification	YES	YES
ncy/Storm Agreement	YES	YES
of Interest	YES	YES
ces	YES	YES
/ Occupational		
Insurance		YES
rmless	N/A	
closure Agreement	N/A	
l Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit	N/A	

PRICE SHEET

LOT 1 WEB PURCHASE		
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	36.5%	25% OFF LIST *
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount	36.5%	NO BID
Audio Books % _____ Discount	35%	NO BID

QUOTATION SHEET FOR: _____ PAGES _____
DOC-10-B-008-LC
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
BOOKS & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 ORDERED BY: _____
 REQUIRING BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09.

Textbook Warehouse
 936 Currie Drive
 Alpharetta, GA 30005

Windmill Books
 303 Park Avenue South
 Suite 1280
 New York, NY 10010-3657

Educational Material % _____ Discount	10%	0% OFF LIST *
Minimum Order (if applicable) \$ _____	0	\$1.00
Quote Number (if applicable)	0	N/A
Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order _____ Days	5-7 Days	7-10 Days W/O PROCESSING 21-30 Days
LOT 2 RETAIL PURCHASE		
Hard back Books % _____ Discount	N/A NO RETAIL STORE	25% OFF LIST *
Soft-Back Books % _____ Discount		NO BID
Audio Books % _____ Discount		NO BID
Educational Material % _____ Discount		0% OFF LIST *

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Textbook Warehouse
 936 Curie Drive
 Alpharetta, GA 30005

Windmill Books
 303 Park Avenue South
 Suite 1280
 New York, NY 10010-3657

Discount if merchandise is picked up at store location?

NOT AVAILABLE

Minimum Order (if applicable)

\$1.00

Quote Number (if applicable)

N/A

Estimated delivery time after receipt of
 Purchase Order
 _____ Days

7-10 Days
 W/O
 PROCESSIN
 G 21-30
 Days
 W/PROCESS

LATION SHEET FOR:
DOC-10-B-008-LC PAGES
 CROSS THEN DOWN
 TIME: **9/02/09 @ 2:00 PM**
S & EDUCATIONAL MATERIAL
 BY: _____
 RDED BY: _____
 NG BOARD APPROVAL 9/22/09 .

Textbook Warehouse
 936 Curie Drive
 Alpharetta, GA 30005

Windmill Books
 303 Park Avenue South
 Suite 1280
 New York, NY 10010-3657

% Discount
 off (new)
 Publisher list
 price - 10%
 discount off
 used
 textbooks
 (catalog
 price)

* Catalog
 show both list
 and discount
 prices
 See attached:
 1. Service
 Policy
 2. Addendum
 standars and
 Deviations