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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No Yes No No Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes

Item # PRICE SHEET

1 Discount % Off Supplies  ________% 12% 12%
Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
10-75% 18% Up to 20% 15%

2 Discount % Off Equipment ________% 12% 12% 10-75% 18% 10-15% 15% Add 
Shipping

3 Minimum Order Amount (if applicable)

$100.00 for free 
shipping        

*****          
$750.00 on 
items with a 

"Truck" symbol

$50.00 $50.00

$5.00 for 
discount       

*****          
$498.00 for free 

delivery

No Minimum $50.00 

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog
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CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM             
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

4 Quote or Contract Number (if applicable) 2009223757SS SDOC-10-B-
015

SDOC-10-B-
015-KB/LK D62801

5 Can other entities piggy back from this bid? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Contact Person / Sales Representative Dan Parravano Don Sprague Customer 
Service Pat Scorzetti Paul Kozlow Scott Powell

Address 1743 Open 
Field Loop

P.O. Box 43-
0747 P.O. Box 500 8252 Neda 

Street

2028 
Shepherd 

Road        
#307

100 North 
Road

City, State, Zip Brandon, FL 
33510

South Miami, FL 
33243

Sugar Land, TX 
77487

Spring Hill, FL 
34606

Mulberry, FL 
33860

McElhattan, PA 
17748

Phone # 813-833-6419 800-962-4041 800-365-2837 352-293-1943 727-251-7072 800-233-8467

Fax # 813-833-6419 305-665-1800 281-295-1310 352-688-8161 888-201-7631 800-578-1064

6
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM             
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

Excludes: Joy 
Carpets and 
drop ship items 
(DS) in the 
Active Play and 
Playground 
sections, sale 
flyers or internet 
orders

Discount varies 
by product 
manufacturer - 
see attached list

Exclusions:  
Items marked 
with †, are not 
eligible for 
discount, 
furniture & 
equipment with 
a check mark 
symbol are 
subject to 
minimum 
delivery charge, 
call 800-523-
1490 option #2 
for freight quote

Excludes: 
ImageMouse, 
Scan Pro, 
ScanPro 1000, 
ScanPro 2000, 
Security 
Systems and 
Acccessories, 
and Books and 
Automation 
Division 
products
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Item # PRICE SHEET

1 Discount % Off Supplies  ________%

2 Discount % Off Equipment ________%

3 Minimum Order Amount (if applicable)

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog
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35

35

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No Yes No No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
12%

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
25% 5%

5%           
*Includes 

discounted or 
free shipping on 

items listed 
below

12% 25% 5%

5%           
*Includes 

discounted or 
free shipping on 

items listed 
below

$100.00 for free 
shipping        

*****           
$750.00 on 
items with a 

"Truck" symbol

N/A $25.00 $25.00 
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4 Quote or Contract Number (if applicable)

5 Can other entities piggy back from this bid?

Contact Person / Sales Representative

Address

City, State, Zip

Phone #

Fax #

6
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35

35

2009223758SS 10-B-015-
KB/LK

Bid 
#8302FT30

0/650
BQ15142/5F

Yes Yes Yes Yes

Dan Parravano Tami Kipphut Michael 
Klein

Linda Vana 
Huyear

1743 Open Field 
Loop P.O. Box 260

13201 
Arrington 

Road

P.O. Box 530   
21709 Route 4

Brandon, FL 
33510

Rifton, NY 
12471

Grandview, 
MO 64030

Carlinville, IL 
62626

813-833-6419 800-571-8198 800-448-
2972 800-223-3517

813-833-6419 800-865-4674 816-761-
9295 800-754-5154
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35
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Excludes: 
Factory Direct 
items with an 
"*", sale 
catalogs, 
internet orders

Excluded: 
All items 
marked with 
the symbol 
*F.O.B. 
Factory, all 
other 
catalogs, 
sale flyers 
and offers     
*****             
UPS size 
items "free 
freight" on 
orders of 
$300.00 or 
more but 
not items 
with a "+", 
items with 
the "+" "free 
freight  with 
order of 
$650.00 or 
more      

Exceptions: 
Chemicals, 
live/preserved 
specimens, 
media, special 
orders, factory 
direct, 
clearance and 
sales items, and 
quantity 
disscounts     
*****             
Add freight to 
chemicals, 
live/preserved 
speciments, 
media, factory 
direct, large 
equipement and 
furniture
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Items with 
the "*" 
symbol 
F.O.B., 
Factory are 
excluded 
from free 
freight    
*****       
Bidding 
F.O.B. 
Shipping 
Point; not 
delivered; 
for orders 
under the 
"free freight" 
amounts will 
have freight 
added

Will extend the 
free shipping 
offer as long as 
possible, but 
unable to 
commit through 
October of 2012 
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*Microscopes & 
accessories, 
carts, balances 
& scales, lab 
equipment & 
accessories, 
meters, 
thermometers, 
pipets/micropipe
ts, microbiology, 
hardware, 
tubing, 
plasticware/glas
sware, 
measurement, 
physics, earth 
science, 
biology, kits, 
chemistry, 
health/safety, 
furniture



Item # PRICE SHEET

1 Discount % Off Supplies  ________%

2 Discount % Off Equipment ________%

3 Minimum Order Amount (if applicable)

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes No No Yes No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

15%
Completed 
wrong price 

sheet

15% with 
exceptions

Math - 20%   
*****        

Science - 
10%        
*****        

Reading - 6%

3-5% 15% 26% In stock 
consumable 24%

7% 15% with 
exceptions

Math - 20%   
*****        

Science - 
10%        
*****        

Reading - 6%

3-5% N/A
28%  

Excluding 
electronics

24%

$50.00 

$100.00 for 
free shipping, 
add $7.00 for 
orders under 

$100.00

$100.00 for 
free shipping N/A N/A

$150.00 for 
free freight, 
excluding, 

Live, 
Hazardous 
and Motor 

Freight Items
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Phone #
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C73084 SDOC-10-B-
015-KB/LK

OCPS #10-B-
015-KB/LK 27191 B11010 10-B-015-

KB/LK
SS-231640-

09F

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No

Michele Grindle Barbara 
Tuzzeo Glenn Meloni Bill Whiteman Carole Tilley Harriet 

Risher
Steve 

Steinfeld

4810 Forest 
Run Road      

*****          
P.O. Box 7488

P.O. Box 7046
1550 

Executive 
Drive

2157 Turner 
Church Road

232 N. Main 
Street

4500 
Turnberry 

Drive

Madison, WI 
53704

Oakland, NJ 
07436

Boynton 
Beach, FL 

33436

Elgin, IL 
60123

McDonough, 
GA 30252

Bushnell, FL 
33513

Hanover 
Park, IL 
60133

800-750-3428 800-770-8010 800-445-
5985  x3227

800-624-
2926 678-296-2646 352-793-

2745 800-955-1177

888-392-9402 201-891-5689 561-369-
7700

800-610-
5005 770-954-1023 352-793-

2778 800-955-4763
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Exceptions: 
Calculators & 
Peripherals, 
CBLs, CBRs, 
probes, 
Navigator 
systems, 
software, 
stopwatches/ti
mers, or 
overhead 
projectors     
*****                 
Shipping 
applies to 
calculators, 
storage 
products, 
oversize & drop 
shipped items 
from factory

Excluded: 
Special 
promotions, 
quotes, 
brochures 
and bid prices 
(prefixed by 
BD), catalog 
items with the 
letter "P" in 
the third 
position           
(XXP-X) 

Excludes: 
Agent 
programs 
(TTL4, Key 
Skills, 
WriteBrain) 
site licenses, 
networks, 
factory direct 
itms and 
other 
discount 
offers 
including 
special 
bundled 
packages     
*****            
software 
orders add 
6% with a 
$9.95 
minimum

Excludes: 
Calculators

Excludes: 
Items that 
end with "ND" 
*****                
Motor freight 
charges are 
calculate on 
the type of 
delivery 
required and 
weight, 
Hazardous 
Materials fee 
of $19.00 per 
order will be 
charged 
where 
applicable
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On-line orders: 
in 
"COMMENTS" 
box - MUST 
SAY "15% 
discount under 
contract 
#SDOC-10-B-
015-KB/LK"

Addd 
handling fee 
of $6.00 on 
all orders         
*****                
No Shipping 
on software 
$1,000.00 or 
more
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No Yes Yes No Yes No No Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
28% 30% 2%

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
0% 17% 5%

10% off 
Software (with 

exceptions)  
*****          

3% off balance 
of catalog

28%          
*****          

12% Furniture
30% No Bid 0% 17% 5% 3%

None 25.00 $100.00 

Under 
$100.00 

add $10.00  
****        
Over 

$100.00 
add 10% 

*****       
over 

$10,000.00 
free 

shipping

$100.00 None

Add shipping to 
orders except 

software 
orders over 

$150.00
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C-025243816-F HCO-909-01-
100831 9/8/2010 C1108

Per Bid 
#SDOC-10-

B-015

FL-SDOC-10-
B-015-KB/LK

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes (with 
exceptions)

Henry Law John Seale Carrie Lee Aaron 
Claflin Brad Kaplan Ron Mohl Don McNeill

4043 Ashland 
Drive

1135 Arbor 
Glenn Circle

PO Box 
1747       
*****        

913 E. 
Jefferson

6760 
Corporate 

Drive

36417 E. 
Eldorado Lake 

Drive

2695 E. 
Dominquez 

Street

P.O. Box 
10636

Douglasville, 
GA 30135

Winter Springs, 
FL 32708

Pittsburg, 
KS 66762

Colorado 
Springs, CO 

80919

Eustis, FL 
32736

Carson, CA 
90895

Eugene, OR 
97440

404-731-5441 407-399-9786 866-622-
1003

800-888-
9191

800-334-2014  
x5460

800-421-
5354 800-877-9378

770-627-3858 407-540-0669 800-443-
2260

719-593-
2446 336-293-1109 310-537-

7990 800-815-5154
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Exclusions: 
Science 
Exclusive 
Product with a 
prefix of "N", 
other School 
Specialty 
catalogs or 
flyers, live 
specimens, 
hazardous 
materials and 
products with a 
prefix of "L", "H" 
or "T", Motor 
Freight add a 
minimum 
$75.00 or a 
12% of line 
value

Excludes: 
Custom 
made/ordered 
products, GBC 
sourced 
equipment, wide 
format 
laminaters, 
shredders and 
parts/service

Add shipping 
to all orders  
*****              
Exempt: all 
modules, 
lesson plans 
and whole 
class 
curriculums  
*****          
Minimum 
$50.00 for 
repairs on 
non-warranty 
items       
*****              
Returned 
items may 
be charged 
up to 15% 
restocking 
fee

Sole Source 
on 
TouchMath 
products

Exclusions: 
Other sales 
offers, bids, 
quotes, 
coupons or 
discounts, gift 
certificates, 
outdoor 
playground 
structures, 
parts, 
surfacings or 
services of 
playground, 
lofts, 
computers & 
accessories, 
assessments 
& screening 
materials, "All 
About ECERS-
R", "All About 
ITERS-R", Tot 
Tree (#96616 
and items on 
pages 182-
183 in 
Infant/Toddler 
catalog

Exceptions: will 
honor the 
manufacturers 
allowed pricing 
if different than 
discount
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See bid for 
shipping 
chages

Next day air, 
2nd day air 
and K-Truck 
delivery are 
excluded from 
free freight 
offer

web site info.: 
Username:        
osceolacounty   
Password: 
fl34744
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See bid for 
additional bid 
exceptions
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Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-10-B-015-KB/LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME:  9/09/09 @ 2:00 PM             
CLASSROOM SUPLLIES & EQUIPMENT -
CATALOG DISCOUNT BID
READ BY:___________________
RECORDED BY:______________
PENDING BOARD APPROVAL

Li
gh

t S
pe

ed
 T

ec
hn

ol
og

y 
   

   
   

11
50

9 
S

W
 H

er
m

an
 R

d 
   

   
   

  
Tu

al
at

in
, O

R
 9

70
62

M
od

er
n 

S
ch

oo
l S

up
pl

ie
s,

 In
c.

  
13

35
 B

lu
e 

H
ills

 A
ve

.  
   

   
   

   
  

B
lo

om
fie

ld
, C

T 
06

00
2-

53
01

M
S

C
 In

du
st

ria
l S

up
pl

y 
C

o.
   

   
82

49
 P

ar
kl

in
e 

B
lv

d.
, S

ui
te

 
30

0 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

08
09

N
as

co
 F

or
t A

tk
in

so
n 

   
   

   
   

   
P

.O
. B

ox
 9

01
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

Fo
rt 

A
tk

in
so

n,
 W

is
co

ns
in

 
53

53
8-

09
01

O
ne

 M
in

d 
A

t A
 T

im
e,

 In
c.

   
   

  
88

01
 B

is
ca

yn
e 

B
lv

d.
   

   
   

   
   

 
S

te
 1

02
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
M

ia
m

i S
ho

re
s,

 F
L 

33
13

8-
33

81

O
rie

nt
al

 T
ra

di
ng

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

42
06

 S
. 1

08
th

 S
tre

et
   

   
   

   
   

 
O

m
ah

a,
 N

E
 6

81
37

-1
21

5

P
A

S
C

O
 S

ci
en

ce
tif

ic
   

   
   

   
   

  
10

10
1 

Fo
ot

hi
lls

 B
lv

d.
   

   
   

   
   

R
os

ev
ille

, C
A

 9
57

47
-7

10
0 

P
ax

to
n/

P
at

te
rs

on
 L

LC
   

   
   

   
 

75
23

 S
 S

ay
re

 A
ve

nu
e 

   
   

   
   

 
C

hi
ca

go
, I

L 
60

63
8

P
IT

S
C

O
 E

du
ca

tio
n 

   
   

   
   

   
  

P
.O

. B
ox

 1
70

8 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
P

itt
sb

ur
g,

 K
S

 6
67

62
-1

70
8

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No No No Yes No No No Yes
Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

22%
Completed 

wrong 
price sheet

11%
Discount varies 

per catalog - see 
below for list

60%
5%    

Removed at 
end of order

3% 3% or call for 
pricing 0%

24% 11%
Discount varies 

per catalog - see 
below for list

30%
5%    

Removed at 
end of order

3% 3% or call for 
pricing No Bid

N/A 0 $50.00 0
$150.00 for 

free 
shipping

N/A      
Add 

shipping 
to all 

orders

$100.00 for 
free freight, 

under 
$100.00 add 

$10.00

N/A
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Contact Person / Sales Representative
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City, State, Zip

Phone #

Fax #
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SDOC-10-B-
015-KB/LK N/A 38192 None

Customer 
Number     

***    
1120606   

***         
Catalog Key 

Code

QT71951 C7288101 PIT-909-01-
100831

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Ms. Gail 
Rosenberg

Brad 
Reisner Dave Johnson

Sonya 
Samuels/April 

Richards

Customer 
Service

Dori 
Haggerty Bob Lerczak Angela 

Watson

1705 Wharf 
Road

8249 
Parklilne 

Blvd.       
Suite 300

901 Janesville 
Avenue

8801 Biscayne 
Blvd.          

Ste. 102

PO Box 
2308

9728 
Kevin 
View 
Cove

7523 S. 
Sayre 

Aveneu

PO Box 
1708      
*****       

913 E. 
Jefferson

Sarasota, FL 
34231

Orlando, FL 
32809

Fort Atkinson, 
WI 53538

Miami, FL 
33138

Omaha, NE 
68103-2308

Orlando, 
FL 32836

Chicago, IL 
60638

Pittsburg, 
KS 66762

800-861-
6172

407-851-
8089 800-558-9595 877-441-6463 800-228-

0475
800-772-

8700 x514
800-323-

8484
800-835-

0686

941-870-
4922

407-855-
3676 920-563-8296 305-759-9955 800-327-

8904
916-786-

7565
708-594-

1907
800-533-

8104
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NOTE: 
Made 
changes to 
bid 
paragraphs

Arts/Crafts: 20% 
("Z" items 5%)     
****                      
Early 
Learning,Consu
mer Sciences, 
PE & Team 
Sports, Reading 
Resources, 
Hands-On-
Health, Special 
Ed.,Agricultural: 
10%               
*****                    
Elem. Math & 
Science, 
Geometry 
Algebra, Math: 
15%                   
*****                    
Science: 17%

Exceptions: 
Custom 
imprint, 
express 
delivery         
*****              
See bid for 
shipping 
charges for 
orders 
under 
$150.00       
*****              
Online order 
system 
does not 
recognize 
bid, call 
customer 
service to 
manually 
apply 
discount

Exclusions: 
CareerPlus 
modules, 
paxton action 
lab modules, 
growing up 
ready 
modules, 
ADMIN, 
building skills 
CTAs, 
Herman 
Miller 
furniture and 
smith 
systems 
furniture 
(these may 
be purchased 
under this bid, 
but not 
discount)

Hazardous 
material 
charge of 
$30.00 to 
items 
marked in 
the catalog 
*****       
Minimum 
$50.00 for 
repairs on 
non-
warranty 
items     
*****           
Returned 
items may 
be charged 
up to 15% 
restocking 
fee           
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Add Shipping 
To: Clay, 
plaster, 
modelling 
material totaling 
50 lbs or more, 
paper and kraft 
rolls (500' and 
1,000' rolls), 
linoleum rolls, 
furniture, 
equipment, live 
material, 
chemicals and 
items with "Z" 
prefix or truck 
logo

Inside 
delivery, 
delivery on 
trucks with 
liftgates, 
installation, 
setup, debris 
removal and 
training not 
included

See bid for 
shipping 
charges
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Discount 
Exceptions: 
Ready-or-Not 
Tot & 
accessories, To-
Sew, Haan Craft 
kits, Xenopus 
frogs, live 
material coupon 
cards       *****     
Discounts off 
unit price - not 
quantity price, 
will receive the 
lowest price of 
the 2                    
*****                    
Truck shipments 
are dock 
delivery

Add $25.00 
for hazardous 
material per 
order
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3 Minimum Order Amount (if applicable)

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No No No No No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes

2% 12%

Sax Arts:    
20% listed in 

Red on all    
in-stock 

supplies & 
teaching 
materials     

Education 
Essentials  

3% off 
ENP

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
30%

Bogen 
General 
Products     

*****        
No Bid       

Bogen 
Engineered 

Systems     
*****        

No Bid

Apogee 
Sound 

International  
*****        

No Bid

2% No Bid

Sax Arts 
10%    

furniture & 
equipment   

3% off 
ENP 35% 36% 36% 15%

$25.00 

Add 
shipping to 

items in 
catalog 
labeled 

F.O.B./Drop 
Ship

$10.00 for 
discount  

*****        
$75.00 for 
free freight  

*****        
Under 

$25.00 add 
$7.95 

shipping     
*****        

between $25-
$75 add 15%

N/A       
*****       

$69.00 for 
free freight  

*****       
Under 

$69.00 add 
$7.59 

shipping & 
$5.00 

handling

$20.00 $100.00 100.00 100.00
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Phone #
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Q090809 SSCOC-10-
B-015

2009223646
SS

200922364
6SS

Q09-
090402

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Gloria Bobby Mack Dan 
Parravano

Dan 
Parravano

Dongsup, 
Ro

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

365 Blair 
Road

75 Mill 
Street

1743 Open 
Field Loop

1743 Open 
Field Loop

51 Lake 
Street

150 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

150 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

151 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

Avenel, 
NJ 07001

Colchester, 
CT 06415

Brandon, FL 
33510

Brandon, 
FL 33510

Nashua, 
NH 03060

Casselberry, 
FL 32707

Casselberry, 
FL 32707

Casselberry, 
FL 32708

732-381-
8777

800-243-
9232

813-833-
6419

813-833-
6419

603-889-
1830

407-644-
8990

407-644-
8990

407-644-
8991

732-381-
1006

800-432-
2842

603-889-
1766

407-644-
9626

407-644-
9626

407-644-
9627
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Exceptions:  
sale flyers 
or special 
promotions, 
installations 
not included

Exceptions:    
Fine/sterling 
silver, 
computer 
software/har
dware, 
Shorewood 
Prints, Back-
to-School 
catalog, sale 
& specilaty 
flyers              
*****               
Add shipping 
to Firing 
clays, 
plasters and 
investments

Items with 
a Blue 
truck 
symbol or 
in blue 
letters: 
Under 
$425.00 
add 20% 
shipping & 
$5.00 
handling, 
Over 
$425.00 
add 
$90.00/unit 
and no 
handling 
fee          
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Items with 
a Red truck 
symbol or 
in red 
letters: 
Under 
$500 add 
25% 
shipping 
and $25 
handling, 
Over $500 
to $3,000 
add 18% 
shipping, 
Over 
$3,000 add 
12% 
shipping
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Can call 
Dan for 
prices on 
Blue and 
Red truck 
items.



Item # PRICE SHEET

1 Discount % Off Supplies  ________%

2 Discount % Off Equipment ________%

3 Minimum Order Amount (if applicable)

Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form
MWBE - Certified Business Program?

Catalog
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No No No No No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Allen And 
Heath       
*****        

No Bid

Ashly       
*****        

No Bid

Community   
*****        

No Bid

Crown       
*****        

No Bid

D & M 
Professional  

*****        
No Bid

JBL 
Professional  

*****        
No Bid

Lowell       
*****        

No Bid

Pro Co 
Sound       
*****        

No Bid

QSC        
*****        

No Bid

11% 22% 21% 26% 15% 21% 25% 30% 21%

100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
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4 Quote or Contract Number (if applicable)

5 Can other entities piggy back from this bid?

Contact Person / Sales Representative

Address

City, State, Zip

Phone #

Fax #

6
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     

152 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

153 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

154 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

155 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

156 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

157 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

158 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

159 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

160 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

Casselberry, 
FL 32709

Casselberry, 
FL 32710

Casselberry, 
FL 32711

Casselberry, 
FL 32712

Casselberry, 
FL 32713

Casselberry, 
FL 32714

Casselberry, 
FL 32715

Casselberry, 
FL 32716

Casselberry, 
FL 32717

407-644-
8992

407-644-
8993

407-644-
8994

407-644-
8995

407-644-
8996

407-644-
8997

407-644-
8998

407-644-
8999

407-644-
9000

407-644-
9628

407-644-
9629

407-644-
9630

407-644-
9631

407-644-
9632

407-644-
9633

407-644-
9634

407-644-
9635

407-644-
9636
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
No No Yes Yes No No No No No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Shure       
*****        

No Bid

Soundtube 
*****        

No Bid

5-22%           
Discount varies 

per catalog - see 
below for list

5%

20% Math & 
Science     

*****         
15% 

Calculators 
*****         

0% Pre-K & 
Kindergarten

0%
Completed 
wrong price 

sheet

Completed 
wrong price 

sheet
10%

20% 20%

0-5%            
Discount varies 

per catalog - see 
below for list

5%

20% Math & 
Science     

*****         
15% 

Calculators 
*****         

0% Pre-K & 
Kindergarten

0% No Bid

100.00 100.00 N/A None

$50.00       
*****         

Add $5.00 to 
any live 

material order 
less than 
$30.00

$20.00 N/A
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74684 SDOC-10-B-
015KB/LK 38193 N/A

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Chuck 
Gilmore     

Chuck 
Gilmore     Michele Throm Bryan 

Thompson
Dave 

Johnson
Marisa 
Chopp

Frank 
Mavigliano

161 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

156 Wilshire 
Blvd. 

3155 Northwood 
Pkwy

4 Easy 
Street

755 Rockwell 
Avenue

5201 
Pelham 
Road

15353 71st 
Driver N

Casselberry, 
FL 32718

Casselberry, 
FL 32713

Norcross, GA 
30071

Bound 
Brook, NJ 

08805

Fort Atkinson, 
WI 53538

Greenville, 
SC 29615

Palm Beach 
Gardens, FL 

33418

407-644-
9001

407-644-
8996 407-923-2731 800-895-

2804 800-777-8817 800-277-
8737

561-748-
4564

407-644-
9637

407-644-
9632 800-333-0712 866-560-

8699 800-317-2194 800-978-
7379

561-748-
4075
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Sportime/Fitness 
& Sport: 22% off 
items beginning 
with "1" & "3", 5% 
off  drop ship 
items beginning 
with "2" & "4"          
*****                       
Abilitations/Integra
tions/Speech Bin: 
5% off items 
beginning with "1" 
& "3", drop ship 
items beginning 
with "2" & "4" no 
discount                
*****                       

Exceptions: 
Items marked 
with a truck 
logo, live 
materials
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Exclusions:  Other 
bids, special sale 
or Educator's Net 
Price, special 
pricing or 
installation
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