

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
1	40 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 2-part, 20# Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	11.76	10.11
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
2	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 2-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	15.04	12.95
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
3	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 2-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	23.52	20.23
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
4	40 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	13.27	11.54
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
5	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	17.00	14.78
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
6	40 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	26.56	23.07
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
7	10 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	14.19	12.34
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
8	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	18.17	15.71
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
9	40 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	28.38	24.81
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
10	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	14.56	12.77
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
11	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	18.65	16.04
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation
12	20 Cartons	Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	29.14	25.55
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excel	Imation

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
13	1 Carton	Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 2-part Canary/White, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	30.09	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excelerator	
14	1 Carton	Straight precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 3-part, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	31.55	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excelerator	
15	1 Carton	Straight precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 4-part, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000	32.79	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter - Excelerator	
16	2 Gallons	Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Glatfelter Brand, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ _____/Gallon	66.96	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Glatfelter	

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
17	2 Gallons	Imation Brand, Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/Gallon	No Bid	79.80
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	No Bid	Imation
18	2 Gallons	NCR Brand, Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/Gallon	No Bid	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	No Bid	
19	1 Carton	First Choice ColorPrint, 8-1/2 x 11, 28#, White, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	17.48	16.10
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	First Choice	First Choice
20	1 Carton	First Choice ColorPrint, 11 x 17, 28#, White, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	34.97	32.50
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	First Choice	First Choice
21	1 Carton	Digital Color Copy, 12 x 18. 28#, Photo White, Smooth, Hammermill, Or Equal Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	40.61	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Hammermill	

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
22	2 Reams	Wausau Astroparche Cover, 8 1/2 x 11", 65#, List all colors available, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1000 Colors Available	43.20	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Astroparche	
23	1 Carton	French Parchtone Cover, 8 1/2 x 11, 65#, List all colors available: No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1000 Colors Available	50.97	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Parchtone	
24	1 Carton	Wausau Offset Opaque Text, 11x17, 60#, List all colors available, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1000 Colors Available	23.76	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Wausau Exact	
25	1 Box	Wausau Exact Offset Opaque Envelopes, #10 Regular, 60# Smooth, List all colors available, No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1000 Colors Available _____	22.45	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Wausau Exact	

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
26	2 Reams	Wausau Astrobrights Cover, 8 1/2x11, 65#, list all colors available, No Substitutions Price\$ ____/1000 Colors Available	38.75	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Astrobrights	
27	2 Reams	Wausau Astrobrights Text, 8 1/2x11, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ ____/1,000 Colors Available	19.58	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Astrobrights	
28	1 Carton	Wausau Astrobrights Text, 11x17, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ ____/1,000 Colors Available	39.14	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Astrobrights	
29	1 Carton	Wausau Exact Brights Text, 11 x 17, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ ____/1,000 Colors Available	35.07	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Exact	

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
30	2 Reams	Wausau Exact Brights Cover, 8 1/2 x 11, 65#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 Colors Available	34.73	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Exact	
31	1 Carton	Sutton Bond, 8 1/2 x 11, 24# , Ultra Bright White, Light Cockle, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	21.83	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Sutton Bond	
32	1 Carton	Sutton Bond, #10 Envelope, 24#, Ultra Bright White, Light Cockle, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	43.39	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Sutton Bond	
33	1 Carton	Vellum or Smooth Offset, 11x17, 70#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	22.68	20.18
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Husky	Husky
34	1 Carton	Bond, 11x17, 20#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	16.88	14.95
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Quickcopy	Boise x-9

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
35	1 Carton	Bond, 8 1/2x11, 20#, Ivory, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	7.92	8.30
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Exact MP	Domtar Colors
36	1 Carton	Cougar Opaque Cover, 8 1/2x11, 65#, White, Smooth No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	27.93	27.61
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Cougar	Cougar
37	1 Carton	Cougar Opaque Cover, 11 x 17, 65#, White, Smooth, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000	58.39	59.17
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Cougar	Cougar
38	1 Carton	Cougar Opaque Cover, 12 x 18, 65# White Smooth, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	59.54	66.65
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Cougar	Lynx
39	1 Carton	Vellum Bristol Cover, 8 1/2x11, 67#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000	17.34	15.36
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Exact	Domtar

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
40	1 Carton	Vellum Bristol Cover, 8 1/2x11, 67#, Colors, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/1,000	18.36	16.65
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Exact	Domtar
41	5 Cartons	Envelopes, #10, White Wove or Smooth, Plain, 24# 500/Box, 5 Boxes/Carton Brand/Mfg. _____ Price \$ _____/1,000	13.05	14.10
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.	Mac Papers MPEC	Impact/national
42	5 Cartons	Envelopes, #10, White Wove or Smooth, Window, 24# 500/Box, 5 Boxes/Carton Price \$ _____/1,000	15.29	16.75
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.	Mac Papers MPEC	Impact/National
43	2 Boxes	Envelopes, A-2 70#, White Vellum Price \$ _____/1,000	29.13	30.72
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.	Waverly Hall	Impact
44	2 Boxes	Envelopes, A-6 70#, White Vellum Price \$ _____/1,000	32.37	45.51
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.	Waverly Hall	Impact
45	5 Packs	Primeline pressure sensitive offset (per hundred), 8 1/2x11, 60#, White, Substitutions Allowed, Price \$ _____/100	8.66	10.45
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Avery	Impact/Spinaker
46	2 Bundles	Chipboard, 8 1/2x11, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/Bundle	32.28	26.70
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Atl Pkg	Austell

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
47	2 Bundles	Chipboard, 8 1/2x14, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Bundle	31.16	26.70
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Atl Pkg	Austell
48	2 Bundles	Chipboard, 11x17, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Bundle	31.16	26.70
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Atl Pkg	Austell
49	2 Gallons	Regular Padding Adhesive, White, Gallon, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Gallon	22.73	24.10
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Hara	Graphline
50	2 Spools	Spool, Round Stitcher Wire, #25, 5lb., Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Spool	28.86	N/B
		List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	Taconic	
		Specify the Minimum Order Quantity for this item	20 Spools / 2 Cartons	
51	1 Box	Staples, SCCR25, 1/4" Price \$ /Box	No Bid	N/B
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.		
52	1 Box	Staples, SCCR25, 3/8" Price \$ /Box	No Bid	N/B
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.		
53	1 Box	Staples, SCCR25, 1/2" Price \$ /Box	No Bid	N/b
		List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid.		

T a b S h e e t		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-035-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 11/10/09 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u> PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 12/1/09 <u>Prices Valid January 1, 2010 - June 30, 2010</u>	Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32207 Min Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	Redd Paper Company 3851 Center Loop Orlando, FL 32808
Item #	Quantity	Description	Unit Pricing	Unit Pricing
54	2 Rolls	ECF Centerfold Shrink Film, 14"x 3500', 75 gauge, Clear, Cryovac D940 or Bolphane BX-75GA Brand, No Substitutions Price \$ /Roll List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed.	No Bid	178.00
				Bollore
55		Can Other Entities piggy-back from this bid? Yes No	Yes	Yes
56		Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order days	1 - 20	1-2 days
			Minimum Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	
57		List Company Name	Mac Papers, Inc.	Redd Paper Company
		Address	3300 Philips Hwy	3851 Center Loop
		City, State, Zip	Jacksonville, FL 32207	Orlando, FL 32808
		Contact Person	Mark Peterson	Bill Temple
		Phone Number	407-370-5595	407-299-6656
		Fax Number	407-352-7330	407-299-8142
		Email Address	mark.peterson@macpapers.com	btemple@reddpaper.com
			Minimum Order \$250.00 (Full Cartons Only)	