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Bid Submittal Form Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Drug Free Workplace Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Debarment Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Conflict Of Interest Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
References Yes No Yes Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes No
Hold Harmless Agreement No No No Yes No No No Yes No No
Confidentail Materials Form No No No Yes No No No No No No
Certified Business Program Reciprocity No Yes No Yes No No Yes Yes Yes No
NOTE: Unit prices must include 
delivery charges, cases and 
mouthpieces.
GROUP 1: String Instruments                   
"All Or None"
1.  Basses, 1/4 size, includes case and 
German bow, H. Luger, Model #VB100 
ONLY                      1 each

$899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2.  Basses, 1/2 size, includes case and 
German bow, H. Luger, Model #VB100 
ONLY                       4 each

$899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.  Basses, 3/4 size, includes case and 
German bow, H. Luger, Model #VB100 
ONLY                      5 each

$899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

4.  Cellos, 1/2 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger, Model #CC100 ONLY        
2 each

$539.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5.  Cellos, 3/4 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger, Model #CC100 ONLY        
5 each

$539.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

6.  Cellos, 4/4 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger, Model #CC100 ONLY        
5 each

$539.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

7.  Violas, 12", includes case and bow, 
H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY                 
2 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

8.  Violas, 13", includes case and bow, 
H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY                 
3 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-041 KB
DATE/TIME:11-16-09 @ 1:00 PM                           
MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS FOR 
SCHOOLS
READ BY:__Kathy Brown______
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown_
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BID# SDOC-010-B-041 KB
DATE/TIME:11-16-09 @ 1:00 PM                           
MUSICAL INSTRUMENTS FOR 
SCHOOLS
READ BY:__Kathy Brown______
RECORDED BY:__Kathy Brown_

9  Violas, 14", includes case and bow,   
H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY                 
4 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.  Violas, 15", includes case and bow, 
H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY                 
10 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.  Violas, 15 1/2", includes case and 
bow, H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY        
2 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.  Violas, 16", includes case and bow, 
H. Luger, Model #CA300 ONLY                 
4 each

$209.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

13.  Violins, 1/2 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger Model #CV300 ONLY         
5 each

$179.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

14.  Violins, 3/4 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger Model #CV300 ONLY         
11 each

$179.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

15.  Violins, 4/4 size, includes case and 
bow, H. Luger Model #CV300 ONLY         
21 each

$179.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

GROUP 2: Woodwind, Brasswind & 
Drums       "Item By Item"
16.  Alto Saxophones, Yamaha                 
#YAS-23 ONLY                        2 each No Bid $794.00 $835.00 $796.00 $803.50 No Bid No Bid $815.00 No Bid No Bid

17.  Bass Clarinet, Yamaha #YCL221 
ONLY                              1 each No Bid $1,446.00 $1,600.00 $1,448.00 $1,447.00 No Bid No Bid $1,469.00 No Bid No Bid

18.  Bass Clarinet, Vito #716 ONLY          
1 each No Bid

#L7168      
$1,216.00    

#7166 
Discontinued

$1,355.00 $1,165.00 $1,153.00 No Bid $1,294.00 $1,166.00 No Bid No Bid

19.  Bassoon, Fox Renard #41 ONLY       
2 each No Bid $3,583.00 $3,730.00 $3,571.00 $3,554.00 No Bid $3,736.00 $3,535.00 No Bid No Bid

20.  Bassoon, Professional, Fox Renard 
#222 ONLY                  2 each No Bid $3,984.00 $4,580.00 $4,489.00 $4,354.00 No Bid $4,767.00 $4,342.00 No Bid No Bid

21.  Clarinet, Bb, Student, Buffet              
#B12 ONLY                          1 each No Bid $347.00 $380.00 $328.00 $335.00 No Bid $358.00 $367.00 No Bid No Bid
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BID# SDOC-010-B-041 KB
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SCHOOLS
READ BY:__Kathy Brown______
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22.  Clarinet, Bb, Professional, Silver 
Keys, Buffet Crampon #R13 ONLY           
1 each

No Bid $2,287.00 $2,575.00 $1,899.00 $2,203.00 No Bid $2,349.00 $2,457.00 No Bid No Bid

23.  Contra Bas Clarinet, Bb, Leblanc 
#L7182 ONLY                      1 each No Bid $3,074.00 $3,485.00 $2,952.00 $2,873.00 No Bid $3,231.00 $2,945.00 No Bid No Bid

24.  Double French Horn, Siler, F/Bb, 
12.24" Large-Throated Bell, Holton          
#H-379 ONLY                    1 each

No Bid $1,947.00 $2,190.00 $1,861.00 $1,823.00 No Bid $2,062.00 $1,867.00 No Bid No Bid

25.  Electronic Drum Set, Roland #TD9S 
ONLY                         1 set No Bid $1,287.00 $1,599.00 No Bid No Bid $1,398.97 $1,299.00 $1,439.00 No Bid No Bid

26.  Euphonium, Bb, Yamaha                
#YEP-321 ONLY                      2 each No Bid $1,664.00 $1,840.00 $1,667.00 $1,667.00 No Bid No Bid $1,690.00 No Bid No Bid

27.  French Horn, Bb, Yamaha                  
#YHR-32211 ONLY                   1 each No Bid $1,284.00 $1,420.00 $1,294.00 $1,287.00 No Bid No Bid $1,305.00 No Bid No Bid

28.  French Horn, F/Bb, Holton #H378 
ONLY                               2 each No Bid $1,794.00 $2,020.00 $1,718.00 $1,682.00 No Bid $1,906.00 $1,721.00 No Bid No Bid

29.  French Horn, F/Bb, Silver, Holton 
Farkus #H179 ONLY            1 each

No Bid $2,464.00 $2,775.00 $2,354.00 $2,308.00 No Bid $2,602.00 $2,363.00 No Bid No Bid

30.  Oboe, Fox #330 ONLY   2 each No Bid $2,739.00 $2,875.00 $2,719.00 $2,739.00 No Bid $3,110.00 $2,723.00 No Bid No Bid
31.  Tenor Saxophone, Yamaha                
#YTS-23 ONLY                         1 each

No Bid $1,008.00 $1,055.00 $1,009.00 $1,012.00 No Bid No Bid $1,025.00 No Bid No Bid

32.  Trombone, Tenor, Student, Yamaha 
#YSL354 ONLY          1 each No Bid $417.00 $430.00 $416.00 $416.00 No Bid No Bid $419.00 No Bid No Bid

33.  Tuba, Silver, 4-Valve, BBb, Yamaha 
#YBB321SWC ONLY   1 each No Bid $4,032.00 $4,500.00 $4,134.00 $4,069.00 No Bid No Bid $4,133.00 No Bid No Bid

GROUP 3:   Equipment
34.  Tuba Rests, Wenger #054A160 
ONLY                        6 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $149.00 $103.00 No Bid

35.  Estimated Delivery Time ARO 
Group 1 30 Days No Bid

36.  Estimated Delivery Time ARO 
Group 2 No Bid

10-60 Days - 
subject to 

factory 
schedules 

0-90 Days
5-60 Days  
depending 

on item
2 Weeks

37.  Estimated Delivery Time ARO 
Group 3 No Bid No Bid

38.  Quote Number (if required) None Osceola 
FL10b041 1587433


