
Bid Submittal Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Debarment Form
Emergency Signed?
Conflict Of Interest Form
References
Hold harmless Agreement
Confidential Materials Agreement
Insurance 
Addendum #1
Addendum #2
Certified Business Affidavit
PRICE SHEET

1.  Range 36" Restaurant Gas                      
Vulcan Hart Model No. V36.  Value Series 
Restaurant Range 36" gas (6) 28000 BTU 
Burners with lift-off burner heads standard 
oven base s/s front sides backriser & Lift-off 
high shelf fully mig welded chassis 6" 
adjustable legs, 203000 BTU, CSA, NSF. 
With 1 year limited parts & labor warranty.     
OR Equal       6/ea                                          
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
N/A N/A Yes No No No No N/A
No N/A No No No No No N/A
No No No No Yes No Yes No
Yes Yes No Yes Yes Yes Yes No
No No No Yes Yes Yes Yes No
N/A N/A No No No No No N/A

Southbend   
S36D       

$1,297.00    
$7,782.00

Vulcan       
V36         

$1,424.55     
$8,547.30

No Bid $1,364.00     
$8,184.00

Garland        
X36-6R        

$1,185.00      
$7,110.00

$1,490.00      
$8,940.00

Garland      
X36-6R      

$1,150.00    
$6,900.00

$1,462.50      
$8,775.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

2.  Work Table 72" Long                               
John Boos Model No SNS-10.  Work Table 
30" W x 72" L, 1-3/4" laminated Hard Rock 
maple flat top stainless steel legs fixed 
underself & bullet feet, KD, NSF.                
OR Equal          2/ea                                       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

3.  Blender Bar Type                                     
Vita-Mix Model No 1230.  (VM0100A) Drink 
Machine 64 oz. (2liter) high-impact clear 
container w/ice blades, 2-step timer, grey 
base, 2 peak, HP, 120V, 50/60 Hz, 11.5 
amps, UL, cUL listed, NSF certifiied.     OR 
Equal          6/ea                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$710.00      
$1,420.00

Boss         
SNS10       
$598.82      

$1,197.64     

No Bid $658.00      
$1,316.00

Advance       
H2S-306       
$629.00        

$1,258.00

$675.00       
$1,350.00

$435.00      
$870.00

$472.20        
$944.40

$440.00      
$2,640.00

$437.89      
$2,627.34 No Bid $404.00      

$2,424.00

Waring        
MX1000XT     

$332.00        
$1,992.00

$415.00       
$2,490.00

$419.95      
$2,519.70

$452.60        
$2,715.60
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

4.  Food Mixer                                                
Globe Model No. SP30.  Vertical Mixer, 30 
qt., floor model, 3-speed, #12 hub., incl; s/s 
safety guard, bowl, 15 min. timer, dough 
hook, whip & beater, rigid cast iron body, 
safety interlocked bowl guard & bowl lift, 
high torque transmission, NSF, ETL, 1 HP, 6 
ft cord & plug.  With 1 year labor warranty.  
115/60/1, 15 amp.   OR Equal     3/ea            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

5.  Soft -Serve Machine                                 
SaniServ Model No. 404. Soft-Serv/Yogurt 
Freezer, counter model, air-cooled self-
contained refrigeration, 1 head, 20 qt. mox 
cap., welded steel frame, s/s exterior, 
electronic consistency control,  automatic 
audible.visual mix out system, 1 HP dasher, 
2 HP compressor, UL, NSF & cUL.  With 1 
year part, 5 year compressor warranty.   OR 
Equal               1/ea                                         
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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MVP Axis    
AX-M30      

$3,103.00    
$9,309.00

$4,342.20     
$13,026.60 No Bid $3,754.00     

$11,262.00

Berkel         
FMS30        

$3,368.00      
$10,104.00

$3,624.00      
$10,872.00

$3,150.00    
$9,450.00

$3,636.50      
$10,909.50

No Bid $8,127.50 No Bid $8,378.00 No Bid $8,199.00 $8,699.00 $8,235.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

6.  Meat Grinder                                             
Univex Model No. MG8912. Meat Grinder, 
bench style with  #12 attached hub, 
approximately 12-lbs capacity per minute, 
poly "V" belt system, s/s feed pan, aluminum 
housing, 3/16" plate, knife & plunger, 1HP. 
115v/60/1ph, Metallic silver.        OR Equal     
1/ea                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

7.  Ingredient Bin                                           
Cambro Model No. IBS20-148. Ingredient 
/bin, mobile, 21 gallon capacity, 3" casters, 
molded polyethylene w/sliding cover, S-hook 
on front (scoop not Included), (4) 3" heavy 
duty casters (2front swivel,, 2 fixed), with bin 
securely attached to base plate, white.           
OR Equal          5/ea                                       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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MVP Axis    
AX622       

$7,950.00    
$1,162.00 No Bid $1,004.00 

Vollrath/Anvil    
40743/MIN0012 

$620.00
$1,249.00 

Globe       
CC12       

$695.00
$787.10

No Bid $165.93      
$829.65 No Bid $161.87      

$809.35
$166.00        
$830.00

$176.99       
$884.95

$155.95      
$779.75

$168.61        
$843.05
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

8.  Saugsage Stuffer, Manual                       
F. Dick Model No. 9051500. Sausage Filler, 
30 lb. capacity, stainless stell cylinder, gear 
box, support rods and base plate, includes 
3/8", 1/2", 3/4", and 1" filling tubes.     OR 
Equal           1/ea                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

9.  Food Processor, Electric                        
Robot Coupe Model No. R402V. 
Combination Food Processor, 4 qt. stainless 
steel bowl with handle, continuous feed kit 
with kidney shaped & cylindrcical shaped 
hoppers, "S" blade, 27577 5/16 (2mm) 
grating disc, 27566 5/32" (4mm) slicing disc, 
pulse switch, variable speed, 300-3600 
RPM, 120v/60/1-ph, 12 amps, 2 HP, NEMA 
5-15P, ETL, cETL, with 1-year parts & labor 
warranty.OR Equal      2/ea                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $1,669.44 No Bid $1,998.00 No Bid $1,599.00
Alfa         

SS26VHD    
$1,595.00

$1,983.00

$2,625.00    
$5,250.00

$2,439.80     
$4,879.60 No Bid $2,358.00     

$4,716.00

Berkel         
B32           

$1,270.00      
$2,540.00

$2,389.00      
$4,778.00

$2,415.00    
$4,830.00

$2,435.00      
$4,870.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

10.  Bun Pan Rack, Mobile                           
New Age Model No. 1330Z.   "Z" Type 
Nesting Pan Rack, mobile, full height, open 
sides, with slides for (30) 18"x26" pans, 
slides on approximately 2" centers, front 
loading, (4) 5" platform casters, NSF.  5 year 
construction warranty.                              OR 
Equal     12/ea                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

11. Tilting /skillet.Braising Pan, Gas           
Cleveland Range Inc. Model No. SGL30TR. 
Tilting Skillet, Gas, 30 gallon capacity, 
modular open base, standard with electric tilt 
mechanism, stainless steel construction, 
includes spring-assisted cover, gallon 
markings and electronic spark ignition, s/s 
level adjustable feet.  One year limited 
warranty, Gas type to be specified, 
120v/60/1-ph, 1.8 amps.     OR Equal     
1/ea                                                            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $528.08      
$6,336.96 No Bid $438.00      

$5,256.00
$400.00        

$4,800.00
$495.00       

$5,940.00

Channel      
4400AXDN   

$390.00      
$4,680.00

$435.35        
$5,224.20

Southbend   
BGLM30     
$9,876.00    
$9,876.00

$11,094.31 No Bid $11,598.00 $11,988.00 $11,490.00 $9,799.00 
Solaris         

GLTS-30       
$10,405.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

12.  Kettle, Gas                                              
Cleveland Range Inc. Model No. KGL-25.  
Kettle Gas, Stationary, 25 gallon cap., 2/3 
steam jacker, self contained, floor mounted 
control console supports, electronic ignation,  
s/s finish faucet mounting bracket, flanged 
feet, 2" tangent draw-off with strained, spring-
assisted cover, 50 pse rating, One year 
limited warranty, Gas type to be specified,   
120v/60/1-ph, 10/0 amps, electronic spark 
ignition, cord &  plug for controls.           OR 
Equal    1/ea                                                    
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

13.  Convection Oven, Gas                           
Vulcan Hart Model No. VC44GD. 
Convection Oven Gas, doubled-deck, 
standard depth, solid state controls, 
electronic spark igniters, 8" high legs, 
stainless steel front, top and sidesm s/s 
doors with windows, 44,000 BTU each 
section.   one year limited parts & labor 
warranty, Gas tyoe to be specified, 
115v/1ph, 1/2 HP, 9.0 amps, 6' cords & 
plugs standard, SST legs.     OR Equal     
2/ea                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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Southbend   
KSLG20     

$10,679.00   
KSLG40     

$11,153.00

20 gal. 
$9,398.15     No Bid $9,998.00 $10,500.00 $9,985.00 $8,399.00 

Solaris         
GL30E        

$10,870.00

Southbend   
SLGS22SL   
$5,989.00    
$11,978.00

$5,690.00     
$11,380.00 No Bid

$5,744.00     
$11,488.00    
minimum 

order 2 each

Garland        
MCO-GS-20-S  

$7,930.00      
$15,860.00

$5,495.00      
$10,990.00

Garland      
SDG-2       

$4,995.00    
$9,990.00

$6,500.00      
$13,000.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

14.  Refrigerated Counter, Work Top          
True Food Service Equipment, Inc Model 
No. TWT-60, Work Top Refrigerator, two 
section, 15.5 cu.ft., (4) shelves, s/s top with 
rear splash (20 door & sidesm white 
aluminum interior with 300 series s.s floor, 5" 
castors, rear mount, 1/5 HP, 115v/60/1, 
ENERGY STAR®, self-contained 
refrigeration, Five year warranty compressor 
(self-contained only), One year parts and 
labor, alternative hiingiing available, 5" 
castors.             OR Equal  1/ea                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

15.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 22SFSCW-135.  
Packed: 6 pieces CamSquare® Food 
/container, with handles, 22 qt, 11-1/4" x 12-
1/4" x 15-2/4", clear, blue graduation, 
polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, resists 
stains & odors, NSF listed.     OR Equal      
4/cs                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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Turbo Air     
TWR60SD   
$2,118.00    

$2,015.00 No Bid $1,998.00 $2,355.00 $2,198.00 
Continental   
SW-60-BS   
$2,025.00

$2,427.50

No Bid $127.48      
$509.92 No Bid $126.42      

$505.68 No Bid $149.40       
$597.60

$117.60      
$470.40

$128.52        
$514.08
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

16.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SF12-453 cover, for 12, 
18 & 22 qt containers, blue polyethylene.   
OR Equal     4/cs                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

17.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 4SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 4 qt, 
7-1/4 x 7-1/4 x 7-3/8, clear, green 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.      OR 
Equal     4/cs                                                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

18.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC2-452. Cover for 2 
& 4 qt containers, Kelly green polyethylene.    
OR Equal      4/cs                                            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            
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No Bid $15.68       
$62.72 No Bid $15.54       

$62.16 No Bid $19.74        
$78.96

SF612-453   
$14.40       
$57.60

$15.42         
$61.68

No Bid $33.90       
$135.60 No Bid $33.34       

$132.96 No Bid $41.40        
$165.60

$30.90       
$123.60

$33.30         
$133.20

No Bid $8.72        
$34.88 No Bid $8.64        

$34.56 No Bid $12.54        
$50.16

$7.98        
$31.92

$8.58          
$34.32
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

19.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 6SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 6 qt, 
8-3/8 x 8-3/8 x 9-1/8, clear orange 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.     OR 
Equal   4/cs                                                     
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

20.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC6-451 Cover for 6 & 
8 qt containers, winter rose polyethylene.    
OR Equal       4/cs                                           
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

21.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 8SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 8 qt, 
8-3/8 x 8-3/8 x 9-1/8, clear orange 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.    OR 
Equal  4/cs                                                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $29.24       
$116.96 No Bid $42.96       

$128.88 No Bid $50.94        
$203.76

$39.96       
$159.84

$43.02         
$172.08

No Bid $10.79       
$43.16 No Bid $10.68       

$42.72 No Bid $15.54        
$62.16

$9.90        
$39.60

$10.56         
$42.24

No Bid $50.92       
$203.68 No Bid $50.52       

$202.08 No Bid $59.34        
$237.36

$47.10       
$188.40

$50.76         
$203.04
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

22.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC6-451.  Cover for 6 
& 8 qt containers, winter rose polyethylene.    
OR Equal    4/cs                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

23.  Food Storage Container, Box               
Cambro Model No. 182615CW-135. 
Packed: 3 pieces Camwear® Food 
Container, 18" x 26" x 15", 20 gallon 
capacity, clear, polycarbonate, dishwasher 
safe, smooth surface NSF listed.    OR 
Equal  3/cs                                                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

24.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Camwear®  Model No. 1826CCW-135. 
Food storage, flat 18" x 26", clear, 
polycarbonate.          OR Equal     3/cs           
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $10.74       
$42.96 No Bid $10.68       

$42.72 No Bid $15.54        
$62.16

$9.90        
$39.60

$10.56         
$42.24

No Bid $130.24      
$390.72 No Bid $129.39      

$388.17 No Bid $149.70       
$449.10

$120.30      
$360.90

$134.01        
$402.03

No Bid $130.22      
$390.66 No Bid $36.18       

$108.54 No Bid
$77.40        
$232.20       

6 each/CS

Packed 6 pcs 
$66.72       
$200.16

$36.96         
$110.88
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

25.  Food Storage Container, Box               
Cambro Model No. 18269CW-135. Packed: 
4 pieces Camwear® Food Container, 18" x 
26" x 26 x 9", 13 gallon capacity, clear, 
polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, smooth 
surface NSF listed.     OR Equal      3 cs         
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

26.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Camwear®  Model No. 1826CCW-135. 
Food storage, flat 18" x 26", clear, 
polycarbonate.      OR Equal    3/cs                
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________          

27.  Food Mill                                                 
Paderno Worl Cuisine Model No 42570-32.  
Food Mill #3, 12-1/4" H, 5 qt capacity, 3 lbs 
per minute, three cutting plates 1/16", 3/32", 
5/32", 5 qt capacity, stainless steel.  OR 
Equal          1/ea                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $122.60      
$367.80 No Bid $120.08      

$360.24 No Bid $139.60       
$418.80

$111.60      
$334.80

$92.55         
$277.65

No Bid $130.28      
$390.84 No Bid $36.18       

$108.54 No Bid
$77.40        
$232.20       

6 each/CS

Packed 6 pcs 
$66.72       
$200.16

$36.96         
$110.88

No Bid $123.50 No Bid $168.00 No Bid
Eurodib        

X3            
$125.00

$127.50 $117.00 
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

28.  Pocket Thermometer                             
Cooper-Atkins Model No. 1246-02-1.  
Packed 6 pieces.  Pocket Thermometer, test 
1" dial type with 5" stem  , temperature 
range 0 to 220° F, with protective sheath 
with calibration wrench and clip , NSF 
certified, (carded).              OR Equal      
42/ea                                                               
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

29.  Pizza Oven, Conveyor Electric             
Doyon Baking Euipment Model No. C16E.  
Jet Air, Baking/Pizza Conveyor Oven, 
Counter Top,, elecric, single 17-1/2" side 
stainless stell conveyor belt w.variable speed 
control 23" cooking zone, digital temp. 
control, stainless steel interior and exterior 
finish, 4" legs. 208v, 60 hz, 1h, 29.0 amps. 
6.1 kw, NEMA 6-50P.  OR Equal      1/ea       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

30.  Food Dehydrating                                  
Custom model No. VEGIKILN. #75-0301-W, 
6 Tray OR Equal   1/ea                                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $4.76        
$199.92 No Bid $5.37        

$225.54 No Bid $4.90         
$205.80

Winco       
TNT-P1      
$3.95        

$165.90

$4.00          
$168.00

$6,200.00 $5,722.50 No Bid $6,124.00 
Lincoln        

1301/1353      
$4,998.00      

$5,990.00 

Lincoln       
IMPINGER   
1301/1353    
$4,890.00    

$6,127.00

No Bid $100.00 No Bid $154.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

31.  Bun Pan                                                  
Thunder Group Model No. ALSP 1826. 
Sheet Pan full size,  18" x 26", 3003 
aluminum.    OR Equal        50/ea                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

32.  Steam Table Pan, Stainless                  
Johnson-Rose Model No. 58102. Packed 12 
pieces steam table pan, full size, 9 qt cap., 
12" x 20", 2-1/2" deep, crimped edge, 
tapered sides, anti-jam, 18-8 stainless steel, 
24 gauge, NSF.  OR Equal    2/cs                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

33. Induction Brazier                                     
Lincoln foodservice Products model No. 
3320. Centurion® Induction 
Casserole.Brazier Pan, 20 qt., 15-3/4" dia., 
18-10 stainless steel, with alumnum clad 
bottom, NSF.    OR Equal   3/ea                     
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $6.35        
$317.50 No Bid $5.61        

$280.50 No Bid $6.80         
$340.00

Winco       
ALXP-1826 
18 gauge     

$5.95        
$297.50

$8.50          
$425.00

No Bid
4 cases      
$49.69       
$198.76

No Bid $90.60       
$181.20 No Bid

Thunder Group  
STPA-6002    
12 each/CS    

$178.80       
$357.60

Winco       
SPJL-102    

$96.00       
$192.00

$126.60        
$253.20

No Bid $352.00      
$1,056.00

$359.00      
$1,077.00

$310.98      
$932.94 No Bid

$335.00       
$1,005.00      
Vollrath 

purchase 
Lincoln 2009

$340.00      
$1,020.00

$316.50        
$949.50
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

34.  Thermal Circulator                                 
JB prince Model No. P350.                             
Provides exceptional control of liquid heating 
& ciculation, assuring a constant 
temperature.  Three preset buttons make 
selection of frequently used cooking or 
thawing temps fast & fool-proof.  Attaches 
directly to stock potsm roastersm & hotel 
pans,  Liquid circulating capacity: 28 liters. 
120v, 50/60 Hz.,  12 amps.   OR Equal  2/ea 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

35.  Juicer                                                      
JB Prince Model No. P170. Champion 
commerical juicer.     OR Equal   1/ea            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

36.  Sharpening Stone                                  
Norton multi-Oil stone, Model #M902.             
OR Equal    1/ea                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid $1,031.52     
$2,063.04

$1,239.00    
$2,478.00

$1,034.00     
$2,068.00 No Bid $949.00       

$1,898.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $297.60 $358.00 $354.00 No Bid $295.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid $222.00 No Bid $254.00 No Bid
Dexter        

Edge-15       
$179.00

Dexter-
Russell      

Edge-15     
$195.00      

No Bid
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

37.  Stand Mixer                                             
JB Prince Model No. P205.  Kitchen Aid 
NSF Approved, five qt stainless steel bowl,, 
flat beating blade, dough hook, and wire 
whip included.  115 volts, 450 watts, 60 
hertz, Ul listed. 5 speeds plus stir speed, with 
thermal overloas re-set button.  one year 
warranty fom mnufacturer.  16-1/2" high, 10-
1.2" wide, 12-1/2" deep.          OR Equal        
7/ea                                                          
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

38.  TOTAL
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No Bid $484.12      
$3,388.84

$396.00      
$2,772.00

$374.00      
$2,618.00

Kitchen Aid     
KM25G0X      
$375.00        

$2,625.00

Kitchen Aid     
KM25G0XWH  

$359.00       
$2,513.00

$435.00      
$3,045.00

Kitchen Aid     
KM25G0       
$416.80        

$2,917.60

20 gal. kettle 
$64,833.40     
40 gal. kettle 
$65,307.40

$98,671.05 Partial $95,906.78 Partial $96,663.41 Partial       
$83,371.33

Partial         
$95,050.97
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Bid Submittal Form
Drug Free Workplace Certification Form

Debarment Form
Emergency Signed?
Conflict Of Interest Form
References
Hold harmless Agreement
Confidential Materials Agreement
Insurance 
Addendum #1
Addendum #2
Certified Business Affidavit
PRICE SHEET

1.  Range 36" Restaurant Gas                      
Vulcan Hart Model No. V36.  Value Series 
Restaurant Range 36" gas (6) 28000 BTU 
Burners with lift-off burner heads standard 
oven base s/s front sides backriser & Lift-off 
high shelf fully mig welded chassis 6" 
adjustable legs, 203000 BTU, CSA, NSF. 
With 1 year limited parts & labor warranty.     
OR Equal       6/ea                                          
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:
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Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes On File Yes Yes
Yes N/A N/A N/A Yes Yes Yes No
No N/A N/A N/A No Yes No No
No No Yes Yes No No No Yes
Yes No Yes No No No Yes Yes
No No Yes No No No Yes Yes
N/A N/A Yes N/A N/A No No

$2,055.00      
$12,330.00

$2,196.28    
$13,177.68

$1,299.00    
$7,794.00

$1,300.00     
$7,800.00

$1,412.05       
$8,472.30

Royal         
RR-6         

$1,072.61      
$6,435.66

$1,306.25   
$7,837.50

$1,312.50    
$7,875.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

2.  Work Table 72" Long                               
John Boos Model No SNS-10.  Work Table 
30" W x 72" L, 1-3/4" laminated Hard Rock 
maple flat top stainless steel legs fixed 
underself & bullet feet, KD, NSF.                
OR Equal          2/ea                                       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

3.  Blender Bar Type                                     
Vita-Mix Model No 1230.  (VM0100A) Drink 
Machine 64 oz. (2liter) high-impact clear 
container w/ice blades, 2-step timer, grey 
base, 2 peak, HP, 120V, 50/60 Hz, 11.5 
amps, UL, cUL listed, NSF certifiied.     OR 
Equal          6/ea                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$927.00       
$1,854.00

$664.80      
$1,329.60

$519.00      
$1,038.00

$600.00       
$1,200.00

$524.81         
$1,049.62

$485.36       
$970.72

$1,306.25   
$7,837.5

$445.04      
$890.08

$415.00       
$2,490.00

$506.85      
$3,041.10

$419.00      
$2,514.00

$475.00       
$2,850.00

$401.65         
$2,409.90

$384.57       
$2,307.42

$481.91     
$963.82

$397.89      
$2,387.34
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

4.  Food Mixer                                                
Globe Model No. SP30.  Vertical Mixer, 30 
qt., floor model, 3-speed, #12 hub., incl; s/s 
safety guard, bowl, 15 min. timer, dough 
hook, whip & beater, rigid cast iron body, 
safety interlocked bowl guard & bowl lift, 
high torque transmission, NSF, ETL, 1 HP, 6 
ft cord & plug.  With 1 year labor warranty.  
115/60/1, 15 amp.   OR Equal     3/ea            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

5.  Soft -Serve Machine                                 
SaniServ Model No. 404. Soft-Serv/Yogurt 
Freezer, counter model, air-cooled self-
contained refrigeration, 1 head, 20 qt. mox 
cap., welded steel frame, s/s exterior, 
electronic consistency control,  automatic 
audible.visual mix out system, 1 HP dasher, 
2 HP compressor, UL, NSF & cUL.  With 1 
year part, 5 year compressor warranty.   OR 
Equal               1/ea                                         
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$4,031.00      
$12,093.00

$4,858.80    
$14,576.40

$3,399.00    
$10,197.00

Univex        
SRM30+      
$3,635.00     
$10,905.00

$3,544.09       
$10,632.27

$3,422.53      
$10,267.59

$3,629.69   
$10,889.07

$3,270.10    
$9,810.30

$8,846.00 No Bid $7,999.00 $8,325.00 $7,623.09 $7,313.58 $8,185.43 $6,979.94
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

6.  Meat Grinder                                             
Univex Model No. MG8912. Meat Grinder, 
bench style with  #12 attached hub, 
approximately 12-lbs capacity per minute, 
poly "V" belt system, s/s feed pan, aluminum 
housing, 3/16" plate, knife & plunger, 1HP. 
115v/60/1ph, Metallic silver.        OR Equal     
1/ea                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

7.  Ingredient Bin                                           
Cambro Model No. IBS20-148. Ingredient 
/bin, mobile, 21 gallon capacity, 3" casters, 
molded polyethylene w/sliding cover, S-hook 
on front (scoop not Included), (4) 3" heavy 
duty casters (2front swivel,, 2 fixed), with bin 
securely attached to base plate, white.           
OR Equal          5/ea                                       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$1,738.00 $1,361.60 $1,049.00 $1,035.00 $1,092.24 $1,053.70 

Thunderbird 
Food 

Machinery   
TB-300E    
$611.99     

$1,043.04

$280.00       
$1,400.00

$312.60      
$1,563.00

$155.00      
$775.00

$154.45       
$722.25

$170.77         
$853.85

$162.18 
$810.40

$170.77     
$853.85     

$163.35      
$816.75
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

8.  Saugsage Stuffer, Manual                       
F. Dick Model No. 9051500. Sausage Filler, 
30 lb. capacity, stainless stell cylinder, gear 
box, support rods and base plate, includes 
3/8", 1/2", 3/4", and 1" filling tubes.     OR 
Equal           1/ea                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

9.  Food Processor, Electric                        
Robot Coupe Model No. R402V. 
Combination Food Processor, 4 qt. stainless 
steel bowl with handle, continuous feed kit 
with kidney shaped & cylindrcical shaped 
hoppers, "S" blade, 27577 5/16 (2mm) 
grating disc, 27566 5/32" (4mm) slicing disc, 
pulse switch, variable speed, 300-3600 
RPM, 120v/60/1-ph, 12 amps, 2 HP, NEMA 
5-15P, ETL, cETL, with 1-year parts & labor 
warranty.OR Equal      2/ea                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$4,146.00 $1,918.60 $1,775.00 $1,825.00 $1,645.28 $1,900.88 $1,807.78 $1,600.00

$2,794.00      
$5,588.00

$3,248.10    
$6,496.20

$2,359.00    
$4,718.00

$2,425.00     
$4,850.00

$2,410.95       
$4,821.90

$2,337.19      
$4,674.38

$2,424.63   
$4,849.26

$2,399.63    
$4,799.26
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

10.  Bun Pan Rack, Mobile                           
New Age Model No. 1330Z.   "Z" Type 
Nesting Pan Rack, mobile, full height, open 
sides, with slides for (30) 18"x26" pans, 
slides on approximately 2" centers, front 
loading, (4) 5" platform casters, NSF.  5 year 
construction warranty.                              OR 
Equal     12/ea                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

11. Tilting /skillet.Braising Pan, Gas           
Cleveland Range Inc. Model No. SGL30TR. 
Tilting Skillet, Gas, 30 gallon capacity, 
modular open base, standard with electric tilt 
mechanism, stainless steel construction, 
includes spring-assisted cover, gallon 
markings and electronic spark ignition, s/s 
level adjustable feet.  One year limited 
warranty, Gas type to be specified, 
120v/60/1-ph, 1.8 amps.     OR Equal     
1/ea                                                            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$826.00       
$9,912.00

$669.05      
$8,028.60

$412.00      
$4,944.00

$500.00       
$6.000.00

$415.05         
$4,980.60

$377.97       
$4,535.64

$445.24     
$5,342.88

$391.07      
$4,692.84

$11,108.00 No Bid $10,879.00 $11,300.00 $9,677.80 $10,635.53 $10,433.23
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

12.  Kettle, Gas                                              
Cleveland Range Inc. Model No. KGL-25.  
Kettle Gas, Stationary, 25 gallon cap., 2/3 
steam jacker, self contained, floor mounted 
control console supports, electronic ignation,  
s/s finish faucet mounting bracket, flanged 
feet, 2" tangent draw-off with strained, spring-
assisted cover, 50 pse rating, One year 
limited warranty, Gas type to be specified,   
120v/60/1-ph, 10/0 amps, electronic spark 
ignition, cord &  plug for controls.           OR 
Equal    1/ea                                                    
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

13.  Convection Oven, Gas                           
Vulcan Hart Model No. VC44GD. 
Convection Oven Gas, doubled-deck, 
standard depth, solid state controls, 
electronic spark igniters, 8" high legs, 
stainless steel front, top and sidesm s/s 
doors with windows, 44,000 BTU each 
section.   one year limited parts & labor 
warranty, Gas tyoe to be specified, 
115v/1ph, 1/2 HP, 9.0 amps, 6' cords & 
plugs standard, SST legs.     OR Equal     
2/ea                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$9,654.00 No Bid $9,849.00 $9,700.00 $8,324.76 $9,148.60 $8,974.57

$6,645.00      
$13,290.00

$7,945.14    
$15,890.28

$4,589.00    
$9,178.00

$5,510.00     
$11,020.00

$8,194.09       
$16,388.18

Royal         
RCOS-2       

$2,042.81      
$4085.62

$5,538.50   
$11.077.00

$5,565.00    
$11,130.00
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

14.  Refrigerated Counter, Work Top          
True Food Service Equipment, Inc Model 
No. TWT-60, Work Top Refrigerator, two 
section, 15.5 cu.ft., (4) shelves, s/s top with 
rear splash (20 door & sidesm white 
aluminum interior with 300 series s.s floor, 5" 
castors, rear mount, 1/5 HP, 115v/60/1, 
ENERGY STAR®, self-contained 
refrigeration, Five year warranty compressor 
(self-contained only), One year parts and 
labor, alternative hiingiing available, 5" 
castors.             OR Equal  1/ea                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

15.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 22SFSCW-135.  
Packed: 6 pieces CamSquare® Food 
/container, with handles, 22 qt, 11-1/4" x 12-
1/4" x 15-2/4", clear, blue graduation, 
polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, resists 
stains & odors, NSF listed.     OR Equal      
4/cs                                                                 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$2,820.00 No Bid $1,799.00 $2,290.00 $2,005.29 $1,950.10 $1,839.71

$120.00       
$480.00

24/ea        
$40.82       
$979.68

$117.48      
$469.92

$116.35       
$465.40

Carlisle          
10726-07        

$93.06          
$372.24

$123.36       
$493.44

$155.40     
$621.60

$125.33      
$501.32
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

16.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SF12-453 cover, for 12, 
18 & 22 qt containers, blue polyethylene.   
OR Equal     4/cs                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

17.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 4SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 4 qt, 
7-1/4 x 7-1/4 x 7-3/8, clear, green 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.      OR 
Equal     4/cs                                                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

18.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC2-452. Cover for 2 
& 4 qt containers, Kelly green polyethylene.    
OR Equal      4/cs                                            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            
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$27.00        
$108.00

24/ea        
$6.18        

$148.32

$14.34       
$57.36

$14.15        
$56.60

Carlisle          
10742-60        

$10.90          
$43.60

$14.88        
$50.52

$18.90      
$75.60

$15.24       
$60.96

$59.00        
$236.00

24/ea   
$11.58       
$277.92

$30.96       
$123.84

$30.55        
$122.20

Carlisle          
10721-07        

$24.80          
$99.20 

$32/-4        
$128.16

$40.86      
$163.44

$32.93       
$131.72

$20.00        
$80.00

24/ea      
$4.56        

$109.44

$7.98        
$31.94

$8.15         
$32.60

Carlisle          
10740-08        

$6.20           
$24.80

$8.16         
$32.64

$10.44      
$41.76

$8.44        
$33.76
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

19.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 6SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 6 qt, 
8-3/8 x 8-3/8 x 9-1/8, clear orange 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.     OR 
Equal   4/cs                                                     
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

20.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC6-451 Cover for 6 & 
8 qt containers, winter rose polyethylene.    
OR Equal       4/cs                                           
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________            

21.  Food Storage Container, Square          
Cambro Model No. 8SFSCW-135.  Packed: 
6 pieces CamSquare® Food Container, 8 qt, 
8-3/8 x 8-3/8 x 9-1/8, clear orange 
graduation, polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, 
resists stains & odors, NSF listed.    OR 
Equal  4/cs                                                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$76.00        
$304.00

24/ea        
$14.37       
$344.88 

$40.02       
$160.08

$39.55        
$158.20

Carlisle          
10722-07        

$19.91          
$119.64

$41.52        
$166.08

$52.80      
$211.20

$42.59       
$170.36

$25.00        
$100.00

24/ea        
$4.65        

$111.60

$9.84        
$39.36 

$15.35        
$61.40

Carlisle          
10741-05        

$7.45           
$29.80

$10.20        
$40.80

$13.02      
$52.08

$10.48       
$41.92

$90.00        
$360.00

24/ea        
$16.33       
$391.92

$47.04       
$188.16

$46.50       
$186.00

Carlisle          
10723-07        

$35.04          
$140.16

$48.78        
$195.12       

$62.10      
$248.40

$50.08       
$200.32

Page 26 of 32



TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

22.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Cambro Model No. SFC6-451.  Cover for 6 
& 8 qt containers, winter rose polyethylene.    
OR Equal    4/cs                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

23.  Food Storage Container, Box               
Cambro Model No. 182615CW-135. 
Packed: 3 pieces Camwear® Food 
Container, 18" x 26" x 15", 20 gallon 
capacity, clear, polycarbonate, dishwasher 
safe, smooth surface NSF listed.    OR 
Equal  3/cs                                                      
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

24.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Camwear®  Model No. 1826CCW-135. 
Food storage, flat 18" x 26", clear, 
polycarbonate.          OR Equal     3/cs           
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$25.00        
$100.00

24/ea        
$4.82        

$115.68

$9.84       
$39.36

$15.35        
$61.40

Caslisle         
10741.05        
$743.5       
$29.80

$10.20        
$40.80

$13.02      
$52.08

$10.48       
$41.92

$230.00       
$690.00

9/ea         
$80.51       
$724.59

$120.54      
$361.62

$119.10       
$357.30

Carlisle          
10624.07        
$118.14         
$354.42

$128.70       
$386.10 

$168.42     
$505.26

$128.26      
$384.78

$126.00       
$378.00

18/ea        
$24.13       
$434.34

$66.84       
$200.52

$66.00        
$198.00

Carlisle          
10627-07        

$42.87          
$128.61

$35.37        
$106.11

$93.30     
$279.90

$71.07       
$213.21
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

25.  Food Storage Container, Box               
Cambro Model No. 18269CW-135. Packed: 
4 pieces Camwear® Food Container, 18" x 
26" x 26 x 9", 13 gallon capacity, clear, 
polycarbonate, dishwasher safe, smooth 
surface NSF listed.     OR Equal      3 cs         
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

26.  Food Storage Container, Cover            
Camwear®  Model No. 1826CCW-135. 
Food storage, flat 18" x 26", clear, 
polycarbonate.      OR Equal    3/cs                
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________          

27.  Food Mill                                                 
Paderno Worl Cuisine Model No 42570-32.  
Food Mill #3, 12-1/4" H, 5 qt capacity, 3 lbs 
per minute, three cutting plates 1/16", 3/32", 
5/32", 5 qt capacity, stainless steel.  OR 
Equal          1/ea                                              
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$212.00       
$636.00

12/ea        
$57.29       
$687.48

$111.84      
$335.52

$110.55       
$331.65

Carlisle          
10622-07        

$27.48          
$82.44

$118.56       
$355.68

$156.28     
$468.84

$119.01      
$357.03

$126.00       
$378.00

18/ea        
$24.13       
$434.34

$66.84       
$200.52

$66.00        
$198.00

Carlisle         
10627-07        

$42.87 

$47.16        
$141.48

$93.30      
$279.90

$71.07       
$213.21

No Bid No Bid $119.00 $145.00 $108.68 $107.53 $118.13 $105.84
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

28.  Pocket Thermometer                             
Cooper-Atkins Model No. 1246-02-1.  
Packed 6 pieces.  Pocket Thermometer, test 
1" dial type with 5" stem  , temperature 
range 0 to 220° F, with protective sheath 
with calibration wrench and clip , NSF 
certified, (carded).              OR Equal      
42/ea                                                               
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

29.  Pizza Oven, Conveyor Electric             
Doyon Baking Euipment Model No. C16E.  
Jet Air, Baking/Pizza Conveyor Oven, 
Counter Top,, elecric, single 17-1/2" side 
stainless stell conveyor belt w.variable speed 
control 23" cooking zone, digital temp. 
control, stainless steel interior and exterior 
finish, 4" legs. 208v, 60 hz, 1h, 29.0 amps. 
6.1 kw, NEMA 6-50P.  OR Equal      1/ea       
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

30.  Food Dehydrating                                  
Custom model No. VEGIKILN. #75-0301-W, 
6 Tray OR Equal   1/ea                                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$10.00        
$420.00

$13.03       
$547.26

$4.25        
$178.50

$5.10         
$214.20

$5.13           
$215.46

Taylor         
6092N        
$3.11         

$130.62

Taylor 
Precision    
6092N      
$4.95       

$207.90

$4.71        
$197.82

$7,672.00 
Star         

UM1833A    
$4,495.50

$5,699.00 $5,900.00 $5,995.00 $5,720.80 $5,777.00

No Bid No Bid $99.00 $115.00 

Food Machine of 
America         
SSFD10         
$341.55

$97.21 $83.27
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

31.  Bun Pan                                                  
Thunder Group Model No. ALSP 1826. 
Sheet Pan full size,  18" x 26", 3003 
aluminum.    OR Equal        50/ea                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

32.  Steam Table Pan, Stainless                  
Johnson-Rose Model No. 58102. Packed 12 
pieces steam table pan, full size, 9 qt cap., 
12" x 20", 2-1/2" deep, crimped edge, 
tapered sides, anti-jam, 18-8 stainless steel, 
24 gauge, NSF.  OR Equal    2/cs                   
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

33. Induction Brazier                                     
Lincoln foodservice Products model No. 
3320. Centurion® Induction 
Casserole.Brazier Pan, 20 qt., 15-3/4" dia., 
18-10 stainless steel, with alumnum clad 
bottom, NSF.    OR Equal   3/ea                     
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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$40.00        
$2,000.00

Focus       
900695      
$19.56       
$978.00

$6.72        
$336.00

$9.45         
$472.50

Advance Tabco   
18-8A-26-2X     

$7.00           
$350.00

Vollrath        
9003          
$6.93         

$346.50       

Winco      
ALXP-1826  

$6.56       
$328.00

$6.09        
$304.50

$30.00        
$60.00

Hubert       
27336       
24/ea     
$24.01       
$576.24

$134.88      
$269.76

Crest         
4002         

$150.00       
$300.00

Stanton         
SP-2002        
$110.28         
$220.56

Update        
NJP-1002      
$132.24       
$264.48

Winco      
SPJH-102   
$122.28     
$244.56

$11.41       
$22.82

$395.00       
$1,185.00

$204.75      
$614.25

$279.00      
$837.00

$320.00       
$960.00

Vollrath         
3320           

$295.29         
$885.87

$284.53       
$853.59

Update     
SBR-20     
$73.55      
$220.65

$302.42      
$907.26
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

34.  Thermal Circulator                                 
JB prince Model No. P350.                             
Provides exceptional control of liquid heating 
& ciculation, assuring a constant 
temperature.  Three preset buttons make 
selection of frequently used cooking or 
thawing temps fast & fool-proof.  Attaches 
directly to stock potsm roastersm & hotel 
pans,  Liquid circulating capacity: 28 liters. 
120v, 50/60 Hz.,  12 amps.   OR Equal  2/ea 
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

35.  Juicer                                                      
JB Prince Model No. P170. Champion 
commerical juicer.     OR Equal   1/ea            
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

36.  Sharpening Stone                                  
Norton multi-Oil stone, Model #M902.             
OR Equal    1/ea                                             
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      
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No Bid No Bid $939.00     
$1,878.00

$1,035.00     
$2,070.00

$868.48         
$1,736.96

$1,044.46   
$1,088.92

$815.62      
$1,631.24

No Bid
Allied        
C4000       

$281.75
$239.00 $300.00 $245.00 $294.64 $230.08

No Bid
Norton       

61463685356 
$94.80

$159.00 $40.00 
Table Craft       

MH-311         
$101.49

Mundial     
ZH110      
$96.86

$169.60
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID# SDOC-010-B-057 LC
DATE/TIME: 2/09/10 @ 2:00PM            
KITCHEN EQUIPMENT FOR TECO
READ BY:
RECORDED BY:

37.  Stand Mixer                                             
JB Prince Model No. P205.  Kitchen Aid 
NSF Approved, five qt stainless steel bowl,, 
flat beating blade, dough hook, and wire 
whip included.  115 volts, 450 watts, 60 
hertz, Ul listed. 5 speeds plus stir speed, with 
thermal overloas re-set button.  one year 
warranty fom mnufacturer.  16-1/2" high, 10-
1.2" wide, 12-1/2" deep.          OR Equal        
7/ea                                                          
Mfg __________________________             
Model # _______________________      

38.  TOTAL
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No Bid

Kitchen Aid   
KM25G0XW
H   $446.16   
$3,123.12

$379.00      
$2,653.00

Kitchen Aid    
KM25GOXWH 

$345.00       
$2,415.00

Royal           
KAKM25GOXWH 

$355.00        
$2,485.00

Kitchen Aid     
KV25GOXWW 

$319.00       
$2,233.00

$410.89     
$2,876.23

$379.30      
$2,655.10

Partial Partial       
$82,854.17 $86,530.44 $95,032.70    

Dock Delivery $94,215.97 Partial         
$50,437.83 $91.834.11 $87,706.80

C=Cambro Min 
is $3,150.00   
V=Vulcan 

items must be 
3 or more 

pieces
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