

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
Bid Submittal Form Signed		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Drug Free Workplace Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Debarment Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Conflict Of Interest Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
References		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Hold Harmless Agreement		No	YES	YES	NO	YES	YES	YES	NO	
Confidentail Materials Form		No	NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	N/A	NO	
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit		No	N/A	N/A	NO	YES - AMERICAN WOMEN	N/A	N/A		
ITEM NO.	QUANTITY EA.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	
<b>GROUP I "All Or None"</b>										
1.1	5	Bookcase, 5-Shelf, Metal, Hon #S60ABC ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	\$192.19	NO BID	\$124.84	\$120.18	NO BID	
1.2	21	Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, W/Loop Arms, Grade III Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	\$127.68	NO BID	\$115.14	\$110.85	NO BID	
1.3	5	Desk, Double Pedestal, Hon #38155 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	\$503.77	NO BID	\$454.50	\$437.60	NO BID	
1.4	5	Drawer, Center, Metal, Hon #D8 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	\$64.51	NO BID	\$58.18	\$41.02	NO BID	
1.5		Group I Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	\$475.00	NO BID	\$112.00	INCLUDED	NO BID	
1.6	1	GROUP I GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	\$6,958.63	NO BID	\$5,717.54	\$5,321.85	NO BID	

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>			Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
		<b>GROUP II "All Or None"</b>									
<b>2.1</b>	103	Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, Plastic Shell, Navy Blue, Artco Bell #7107 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	ScholarCraft #SC 127 \$20.09	NO BID	NO BID	\$23.80	
<b>2.2</b>	37	Chairdesk, 18 1/2", X-Large, Laminate Top, W/Bookrack, Artco Bell A+ #7458 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	ScholarCraft #SC629-FBRR \$59.76	NO BID	NO BID	\$78.01	
<b>2.3</b>		Group II Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$206.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$307.65	
<b>2.4</b>		GROUP II GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,487.24	NO BID	NO BID	\$5,645.42	
		<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item"</b>									
<b>3.1</b>	23	Table, Activity, 30 x 72, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #123072 EA Or Equal	\$70.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>3.2</b>		Installation Charge For Item #3.1	\$5.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>3.3</b>	1	Table, Activity, 36 x 36, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #F53636 Or Equal	\$66.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>3.4</b>		Installation Charge For Item #3.3	\$6.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>								
3.5	7	Stools, Adjustable, 19"-27", W/O Backs, Non-Mar Self Leveling Glildes, Hardboard Masonite, National Public Seating Corp. #6218H Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.02	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.6		Installation Charge For Item #3.5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.18	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.7	15	Study Carrels, Heavy Duty, Adjustable from 22" to 30", Top Shelf, Grommet In Back Panel, Leveling Glildes, Balt #897 Series Or Equal	\$160.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$267.56	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.8		Installation Charge For Item #3.7	\$10.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$275.67	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't									
3.9	1	Desk, Edit, W/Monitor Bridge, 1" Plywood W/Plastic Laminate On Top And Bottom, Rounded Rubber Edging, 91-1/16"W x 47- 9/16"D, Desk 24"D And Monitor Bridge 20- 1/4"D, Desk 29"H and Monitor Birdge 35- 1/2"H, Trestle Legs Are Welded Steel Tube, Monitor Risers 5-3/8" High and 19-1/8" Apart, Rack Rail Included For Mounting Equipment Under The Monitor Bridge, Four (4) 3RU (5-1/4" High) Openings Are Accessible Above Desk Top, Color To Be Determined, Martin & Ziegler #CF92 Or Equal (Brochure/Picture)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.10		Installation Charge For Item #3.9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>								
3.11	1	Desk, TV Production, 3/4" Hardwood Plywood, 72"W x 30"D x 32"H, W/2" Casters That Are To Be Hidden Behind The Skirting Of The Desk, Should Resemble The Pictures/Rough Sketches Shown In Exhibits "C" And "D", Colors To Be Determined (NO BRAND SPECIFIED)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.12		Installation Charge For Item #3.11	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>Group IV "Item-By-Item"</b>									
4.1	1	Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum Of 8 Student Chairs, VIRCO #HCT789 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$96.15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.2		Installation Charge For Item #4.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$5.66	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.3	1	Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round Tables, VIRCO #HRTT1 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$193.84	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.4		Installation Charge For Item #4.3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$10.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
		<b>Group V "All Or None"</b>								
<b>5.1</b>	41	Shelving, Metall, 36 x 18 x 84, Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, Tenssco #Q05-3618 (OAP-84) Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$112.90
<b>5.2</b>		Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$615.00
		<b>Group VI "All Or None" LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>								
<b>6.1</b>	1	Sofa, Gently Shaped Artms, Three-Over_Three Design, W/Matching Accent Pillows, 87L x 38W x 37H <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Sofe #10152178 Or Equal	NO BID	#100780 \$399.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>6.2</b>		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	Swatches Included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>6.3</b>	1	Love Seat, 63 x 38 x 37, To Match Item #6.1 <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Herb Sofa #10252170 Or Equal	NO BID	#100779 \$379.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm FL 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>								
6.4		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	Swatches Included	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.5	1	Area Rug, 5 x 8, Multi-Color, 100% Olefin, Fade, Soil and Stain Resistant ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Generations #82781, Rooms To Go Philosophy #95001841 Or Equal	NO BID	#99407 \$299.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.6	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/Drawers, 48 x s28 x 19, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #22121026 Or Equal	NO BID	#104776 \$149.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.7		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.8	2	End Tables, W/Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23021025 Or Equal	NO BID	#104777 \$149.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.9		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.10	1	Sofa Table, W/Drawer, 52 x 16 x 30, To Match Cocktail and End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23821021 Or Equal	NO BID	#104778 \$199.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.11		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>			Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>									
		<b>OR</b>								
<b>6.12</b>	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/2 Wicker Baskets And 1 Drawer, 47 x 27 x 20, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Cocktail Table #99042 Or Equal	NO BID	#99042 \$299.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.13</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.14</b>	2	End Tables, W/1 Wicker Basket And Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage End Table, #99043 Or Equal	NO BID	#99043 \$299.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.15</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.16</b>	1	Sofa Table, W/2 Wicker Baskets And Drawers, 47 x 18 x 30, to Match Cocktail And End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Sofa Table #99041 Or Equal	NO BID	#99041 \$299.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.17</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>6.18</b>	2	Lamps, Geo cube, W/Shades, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #90167810 Or Equal	NO BID	#101190 \$79.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	



Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>								
6.19		Color Choices	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.20	1	Entertainment Center, Includes TV Stand, Bridge/RSF (Right Side Facing) Panel And Left Pier, Overall Size: 76 x 22 x 71, TV Opening 52 x 40, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #3558808P, Badcock #97077 97079 & 97080 Or Equal	NO BID	#97077, #97079 & #97080 \$899.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.21		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.22		Group VI Installation Charge	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.23		GROUP VI GRAND TOTAL	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>							
7.1	1	Dining Table, Leg, 18" Leaf, 66L x 44W x 30H, Extends to 84L W/18" Leaf, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42116613 Or Equal	NO BID	42 x 58 x 76 #100115 \$399.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.2		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>							
7.3	8	Dining Chairs, Wood Solids, Slat Back, Contoured Seats, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42301666 Or Equal	NO BID	#100713 \$129.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.4		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.5	1	China Cabinet (Hutch), Framed Glass Doors, Drawer Below Doors, To Match Dining Table, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , rooms To Go #42904690 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.7		Group VII Installation Charge	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.8		GROUP VII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm FL 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430	
		<b>Group VIII "All Or None"</b>								
		<b>LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>								
	<b>8.1</b>	1	Bed, Full Size, Slat Boarder Panels, Sturdy Framework, Subtle Curved Detailling, 80L x 60W x 50H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #3560266P Or Equal	NO BID	#89428 \$179.95 ***** #93305 \$69.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.2</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	specs	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>8.3</b>	1	Dresser, W/Mirror, 9 Drawers, Including Felt-Lined Top Row, Rectangular Mirror Sits Atop Dresser, Linear Design, Highlighted By Slats On Top And Leaded Glass With A Beveled Edge, Dresser 55L x 18W x 34H, Mirror 39W x 40H, (Color Picture Required), Rooms To Go Mission Dresser Mirror Set #3400266P Or Equal	NO BID	#101517 \$399.95 ***** #101516 \$100.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
<b>8.4</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	cherry	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm FL 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainesville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
		<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>							
8.5	1	Chest, 5- Generous Drawers, Llinear Design, 36L x 18W x 52H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #34202666 Or equal	NO BID	#89431 \$379.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.7	2	Nightstand, Ample Surface To Accommodate A Lamp, Clock And Other Essentials, 2-Drawers, 24L x 17W x 25H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #34402660 Or Equal	NO BID	#89430 \$259.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.8		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	cherry	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.9	1	Mattress, Full, 75" x 53"W, Firm, Woven Damask Panel Cover, Chemical Free Natural Fir Barrier, A Layer Of Comfort Foam, Pillow Top, Support Pad, Verticoil Innerspring And A Shock Absorbing Pad, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #50353401, Badcock Legends #103625 Or Equal	NO BID	#103625 \$219.98	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Allied Plastics 2001 Walnut St Jacksonville, FL 32206	Badcock Furniture & More 1750 E. Hwy. 192 St. Cloudm Fl 34771	Commercial Concepts & Furn 3622 Noland Ct. Independence, MO 64055	Contrax Furnishing, Inc. 690 NE 23rd Ave. Gainsville, FL 32609	Designer West 6208 S. Orange Ave., Suite 124 Orlando, FL 32809	Ernie Morris Enterprises 232 N Main St. Bushnell, FL 33513	Hertz Furniture 95 Mckee Dr. Mahwah, NJ 07430
		<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>								
8.10	1	Foundation, Full, 75" x 53"W, Reinforced Padded Corners, Rigid Steel Grid, Quilted Border W/Plastic Corner Guards, <b>(Color            Picture Required)</b> , Badcock Legends #103621 Or Equal	NO BID	#103621 \$189.95 ***** group price \$389.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.11		Group VIII Installation Charge	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.12		GROUP VIII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
Bid Submittal Form Signed		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Drug Free Workplace Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Debarment Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Conflict Of Interest Form		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
References		YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	YES	
Hold Harmless Agreement		NO	NO	YES	NO	NO	NO	YES	
Confidential Materials Form		NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	YES	
Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit		YES - AMERICAN WOMEN	NO	NO	NO	NO	NO	N/A	
ITEM NO.	QUANTITY EA.	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	UNIT	
<b>GROUP I "All Or None"</b>									
1.1	5	Bookcase, 5-Shelf, Metal, Hon #S60ABC ONLY	\$141.78	\$120.20	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$129.99	
1.2	21	Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, W/Loop Arms, Grade III Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY	\$130.76	\$110.86	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$129.99	
1.3	5	Desk, Double Pedestal, Hon #38155 ONLY	\$516.18	\$437.62	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$469.99	
1.4	5	Drawer, Center, Metal, Hon #D8 ONLY	\$66.07	\$41.04	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$124.99	
1.5		Group I Installation Charge	\$800.00	\$319.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$219.45	
1.6	1	GROUP I GRAND TOTAL	\$7,166.11	\$5,641.36	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$6,563.64	

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>								I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	<b>GROUP II "All Or None"</b>													
<b>2.1</b>	103	Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, Plastic Shell, Navy Blue, Artco Bell #7107 Or Equal	Hon #H1018.91.Y \$137.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Scholarcraft #127 \$20.99						
<b>2.2</b>	37	Chairdesk, 18 1/2", X-Large, Laminate Top, W/Bookrack, Artco Bell A+ #7458 Or Equal	Hon #CL4DMPB.D.DD.S \$182.15 ***** Hon #CLA45 BOOKRACK \$61.02	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Scholarcraft #629FBNB \$67.99						
<b>2.3</b>		Group II Installation Charge	\$1,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$302.40						
<b>2.4</b>		GROUP II GRAND TOTAL	\$24,775.37	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$4,980.00						
<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item"</b>														
<b>3.1</b>	23	Table, Activity, 30 x 72, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #123072 EA Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$166.01	Amtab #306D \$116.99						
<b>3.2</b>		Installation Charge For Item #3.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$381.82	\$120.75						
<b>3.3</b>	1	Table, Activity, 36 x 36, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #F53636 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$137.75	Amtab #ASQ36D \$112.99						
<b>3.4</b>		Installation Charge For Item #3.3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$13.77	\$5.25						

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>							
3.5	7	Stools, Adjustable, 19"-27", W/O Backs, Non-Mar Self Leveling Glildes, Hardboard Masonite, National Public Seating Corp. #6218H Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$144.48	\$41.99
3.6		Installation Charge For Item #3.5	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$101.13	\$22.05
3.7	15	Study Carrels, Heavy Duty, Adjustable from 22" to 30", Top Shelf, Grommet In Back Panel, Leveling Glildes, Balt #897 Series Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3.8		Installation Charge For Item #3.7	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
		<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>						
3.9	1	Desk, Edit, W/Monitor Bridge, 1" Plywood W/Plastic Laminate On Top And Bottom, Rounded Rubber Edging, 91-1/16"W x 47-9/16"D, Desk 24"D And Monitor Bridge 20-1/4"D, Desk 29"H and Monitor Birdge 35-1/2"H, Trestle Legs Are Welded Steel Tube, Monitor Risers 5-3/8" High and 19-1/8" Apart, Rack Rail Included For Mounting Equipment Under The Monitor Bridge, Four (4) 3RU (5-1/4" High) Openings Are Accessible Above Desk Top, Color To Be Determined, Martin & Ziegler #CF92 Or Equal (Brochure/Picture)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Silver Street/Media Technologies \$1,013.3
3.10		Installation Charge For Item #3.9	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$52.50

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>							
3.11	1	Desk, TV Production, 3/4" Hardwood Plywood, 72"W x 30"D x 32"H, W/2" Casters That Are To Be Hidden Behind The Skirting Of The Desk, Should Resemble The Pictures/Rough Sketches Shown In Exhibits "C" And "D", Colors To Be Determined (NO BRAND SPECIFIED)	\$1,000.00	NO BID	\$1,400.00	NO BID	\$325.00	Silver Street/Media Technologies \$1,952.78
3.12		Installation Charge For Item #3.11	INCLUDED	NO BID	Zero	NO BID	\$32.50	\$52.50
<b>Group IV "Item-By-Item"</b>								
4.1	1	Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum Of 8 Student Chairs, VIRCO #HCT789 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.2		Installation Charge For Item #4.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.3	1	Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round Tables, VIRCO #HRTT1 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
4.4		Installation Charge For Item #4.3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet		TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
		<b>Group V "All Or None"</b>							
5.1	41	Shelving, Metall, 36 x 18 x 84, Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, Tennesco #Q05-3618 (OAP-84) Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Tennesco #Q05-3618S STARTER KIT \$100.10 ***** Tennesco #Q05-3818AB ADDER \$93.50	\$156.02	\$83.44	
5.2		Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$2,500.00	\$585.00	\$475.00	
		<b>Group VI "All Or None" LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>							
6.1	1	Sofa, Gently Shaped Artms, Three-Over_Three Design, W/Matching Accent Pillows, 87L x 38W x 37H <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Sofe #10152178 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
6.2		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
6.3	1	Love Seat, 63 x 38 x 37, To Match Item #6.1 <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Herb Sofa #10252170 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM							
	6.4		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.5	1	Area Rug, 5 x 8, Multi-Color, 100% Olefin, Fade, Soil and Stain Resistant ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Generations #82781, Rooms To Go Philosophy #95001841 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.6	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/Drawers, 48 x s28 x 19, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #22121026 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.7		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.8	2	End Tables, W/Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23021025 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.9		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.10	1	Sofa Table, W/Drawer, 52 x 16 x 30, To Match Cocktail and End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23821021 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	6.11		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>							
		<u>OR</u>						
6.12	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/2 Wicker Baskets And 1 Drawer, 47 x 27 x 20, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Cocktail Table #99042 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.13		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.14	2	End Tables, W/1 Wicker Basket And Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage End Table, #99043 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.15		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.16	1	Sofa Table, W/2 Wicker Baskets And Drawers, 47 x 18 x 30, to Match Cocktail And End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Sofa Table #99041 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.17		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.18	2	Lamps, Geo cube, W/Shades, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #90167810 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>							
6.19		Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.20	1	Entertainment Center, Includes TV Stand, Bridge/RSF (Right Side Facing) Panel And Left Pier, Overall Size: 76 x 22 x 71, TV Opening 52 x 40, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #3558808P, Badcock #97077 97079 & 97080 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.21		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.22		Group VI Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.23		GROUP VI GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>						
7.1	1	Dining Table, Leg, 18" Leaf, 66L x 44W x 30H, Extends to 84L W/18" Leaf, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42116613 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.2		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>						
7.3	8	Dining Chairs, Wood Solids, Slat Back, Contoured Seats, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42301666 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.4		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.5	1	China Cabinet (Hutch), Framed Glass Doors, Drawer Below Doors, To Match Dining Table, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , rooms To Go #42904690 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.7		Group VII Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.8		GROUP VII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903	
	<b>Group VIII "All Or None" LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>								
	<b>8.1</b>	1	Bed, Full Size, Slat Boarder Panels, Sturdy Framework, Subtle Curved Detailling, 80L x 60W x 50H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #3560266P Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.2</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.3</b>	1	Dresser, W/Mirror, 9 Drawers, Including Felt-Lined Top Row, Rectangular Mirror Sits Atop Dresser, Linear Design, Highlighted By Slats On Top And Leaded Glass With A Beveled Edge, Dresser 55L x 18W x 34H, Mirror 39W x 40H, (Color Picture Required), Rooms To Go Mission Dresser Mirror Set #3400266P Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>8.4</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	



Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903
		<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>						
8.5	1	Chest, 5- Generous Drawers, Llinear Design, 36L x 18W x 52H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #34202666 Or equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.7	2	Nightstand, Ample Surface To Accommodate A Lamp, Clock And Other Essentials, 2-Drawers, 24L x 17W x 25H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #34402660 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.8		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.9	1	Mattress, Full, 75" x 53"W, Firm, Woven Damask Panel Cover, Chemical Free Natural Fir Barrier, A Layer Of Comfort Foam, Pillow Top, Support Pad, Verticoil Innerspring And A Shock Absorbing Pad, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #50353401, Badcock Legends #103625 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

<b>Tab Sheet</b>	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELIVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		I Furn Furniture Store 2081 N Webb Road Wichita, KS 67206	Marco Office Supply 220 Industrial Blvd. Naples, FL 34104	P Brandon, Inc. 4 Cameo Ct. Palm Coast, FL 32137	Patterson's Office Supply, Inc. 3722 Grissom Lane Kissimmee, FL 34741	Pride Enterprises 12425 28th St. N Saint Petersburg, FL 33716	School Specialty 100 Paragon Pkwy Mansfield, OH 44903	
	<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>								
	<b>8.10</b>	1	Foundation, Full, 75" x 53"W, Reinforced Padded Corners, Rigid Steel Grid, Quilted Border W/Plastic Corner Guards, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Badcock Legends #103621 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.11</b>		Group VIII Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>8.12</b>		GROUP VIII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

<b>Tab Sheet</b>	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	Bid Submittal Form Signed		YES	YES	Yes	YES
	Drug Free Workplace Form		YES	YES	Yes	YES
	Debarment Form		YES	YES	Yes	YES
	Conflict Of Interest Form		YES	YES	Yes	YES
	References		YES	YES	Yes	YES
	Hold Harmless Agreement		NO	YES	Yes	YES
	Confidential Materials Form		YES	NO	No	NO
	Certified Business Program Reciprocity Affidavit		N/A	YES - AMERICAN WOMAN	Yes - African American	N/A
	<b>ITEM NO.</b>	<b>QUANTITY EA.</b>	<b>DESCRIPTION</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>UNIT</b>	<b>UNIT</b>
<b>GROUP I "All Or None"</b>						
1.1	5	Bookcase, 5-Shelf, Metal, Hon #S60ABC ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1.2	21	Chair, Managerial, Mid-Back, W/Loop Arms, Grade III Fabric, Hon #4002 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1.3	5	Desk, Double Pedestal, Hon #38155 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1.4	5	Drawer, Center, Metal, Hon #D8 ONLY	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1.5		Group I Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1.6	1	GROUP I GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>GROUP II "All Or None"</b>					
2.1	103	Chair, Student, 18", Chrome Legs, Plastic Shell, Navy Blue, Artco Bell #7107 Or Equal	\$18.00	NO BID	NO BID	Virco #2018 \$17.75
2.2	37	Chairdesk, 18 1/2", X-Large, Laminate Top, W/Bookrack, Artco Bell A+ #7458 Or Equal	\$61.00	NO BID	NO BID	Virco #2400ELBR \$56.74
2.3		Group II Installation Charge	INCLUDED	NO BID	NO BID	INCLUDED
2.4		GROUP II GRAND TOTAL	\$4,111.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$3,927.63
<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item"</b>						
3.1	23	Table, Activity, 30 x 72, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #123072 EA Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Virco #483072 \$71.82
3.2		Installation Charge For Item #3.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	INCLUDED
3.3	1	Table, Activity, 36 x 36, Adjustable, Allied Plastics #F53636 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Virco #483636 \$55.00
3.4		Installation Charge For Item #3.3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	INCLUDED

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>					
3.5	7	Stools, Adjustable, 19"-27", W/O Backs, Non-Mar Self Leveling Glildes, Hardboard Masonite, National Public Seating Corp. #6218H Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.00	Virco #1241927 \$35.64
3.6		Installation Charge For Item #3.5	NO BID	NO BID	\$145.00	INCLUDED
3.7	15	Study Carrels, Heavy Duty, Adjustable from 22" to 30", Top Shelf, Grommet In Back Panel, Leveling Glildes, Balt #897 Series Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	\$313.00	Virco #872436SC \$182.00
3.8		Installation Charge For Item #3.7	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,510.00	INCLUDED

Tab Sheet	<p>TABULATION SHEET FOR:          BID #<b><u>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</u></b>          PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS          DATE/TIME: <b><u>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</u></b>  <b><u>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</u></b>          READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u>          RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u></p>		<p>Schoolhouse Products, Inc.          13517 Prestige Place, Suite          101          Tampa, FL 33635</p>	<p>Total Business Assoc          118 Central Park Pl          Sanford, FL 32771</p>	<p>Your Office, Inc.          6193 Rock Island Road          #306          Tamarac, FL 33319</p>	<p>Virco Inc.          Hwy 65 South          Conway, AR 72032          Quote #54139</p>
		GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't				
3.9	1	<p>Desk, Edit, W/Monitor Bridge, 1" Plywood W/Plastic Laminate On Top And Bottom, Rounded Rubber Edging, 91-1/16"W x 47-9/16"D, Desk 24"D And Monitor Bridge 20-1/4"D, Desk 29"H and Monitor Birdge 35-1/2"H, Trestle Legs Are Welded Steel Tube, Monitor Risers 5-3/8" High and 19-1/8" Apart, Rack Rail Included For Mounting Equipment Under The Monitor Bridge, Four (4) 3RU (5-1/4" High) Openings Are Accessible Above Desk Top, Color To Be Determined, Martin &amp; Ziegler #CF92 Or Equal            (Brochure/Picture)</p>	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,847.00	NO BID
3.10		Installation Charge For Item #3.9	NO BID	NO BID	\$140.00	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>GROUP III "Item-By-Item" Con't</b>					
3.11	1	Desk, TV Production, 3/4" Hardwood Plywood, 72"W x 30"D x 32"H, W/2" Casters That Are To Be Hidden Behind The Skirting Of The Desk, Should Resemble The Pictures/Rough Sketches Shown In Exhibits "C" And "D", Colors To Be Determined (NO BRAND SPECIFIED)	NO BID	NO BID	\$1,700.00	NO BID
3.12		Installation Charge For Item #3.11	NO BID	NO BID	\$160.00	NO BID
		<b>Group IV "Item-By-Item"</b>				
4.1	1	Chair Cart, Holds A Minimum Of 8 Student Chairs, VIRCO #HCT789 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$108.53
4.2		Installation Charge For Item #4.1	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	INCLUDED
4.3	1	Table Cart, For 60", 72" and Round Tables, VIRCO #HRTT1 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$400.11
4.4		Installation Charge For Item #4.3	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	INCLUDED

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>Group V "All Or None"</b>					
5.1	41	Shelving, Metall, 36 x 18 x 84, Includes All Clips, Post And Shelving, Tennsco #Q05-3618 (OAP-84) Or Equal	NO BID	\$94.00	Starters \$120.00 ***** Adders \$111.00	NO BID
5.2		Installation Charge	NO BID	20.00 EACH	\$1,975.00	NO BID
		<b>Group VI "All Or None" LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>				
6.1	1	Sofa, Gently Shaped Artms, Three-Over_Three Design, W/Matching Accent Pillows, 87L x 38W x 37H <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Sofe #10152178 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.2		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.3	1	Love Seat, 63 x 38 x 37, To Match Item #6.1 <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Cassie Herb Sofa #10252170 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID



Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>					
6.4		Fabric Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.5	1	Area Rug, 5 x 8, Multi-Color, 100% Olefin, Fade, Soil and Stain Resistant ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Generations #82781, Rooms To Go Philosophy #95001841 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.6	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/Drawers, 48 x 28 x 19, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #22121026 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.7		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.8	2	End Tables, W/Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23021025 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.9		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.10	1	Sofa Table, W/Drawer, 52 x 16 x 30, To Match Cocktail and End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #23821021 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.11		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>					
		<u>OR</u>				
6.12	1	Cocktail Table, Rectangular, W/2 Wicker Baskets And 1 Drawer, 47 x 27 x 20, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Cocktail Table #99042 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.13		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.14	2	End Tables, W/1 Wicker Basket And Drawer, 24 x 28 x 24, To Match Cocktail Table, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage End Table, #99043 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.15		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.16	1	Sofa Table, W/2 Wicker Baskets And Drawers, 47 x 18 x 30, to Match Cocktail And End Tables, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Badcock Wicker Storage Sofa Table #99041 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.17		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.18	2	Lamps, Geo cube, W/Shades, ( <b>Color Picture Required</b> ), Rooms To Go #90167810 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
	<b>Group VI "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB LIVING ROOM</b>					
6.19		Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.20	1	Entertainment Center, Includes TV Stand, Bridge/RSF (Right Side Facing) Panel And Left Pier, Overall Size: 76 x 22 x 71, TV Opening 52 x 40, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #3558808P, Badcock #97077 97079 & 97080 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.21		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.22		Group VI Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6.23		GROUP VI GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>				
7.1	1	Dining Table, Leg, 18" Leaf, 66L x 44W x 30H, Extends to 84L W/18" Leaf, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42116613 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.2		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
		<b>Group VII "All Or None" Con't          LIFE LAB DINING ROOM</b>				
7.3	8	Dining Chairs, Wood Solids, Slat Back, Contoured Seats, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #42301666 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.4		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.5	1	China Cabinet (Hutch), Framed Glass Doors, Drawer Below Doors, To Match Dining Table, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , rooms To Go #42904690 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.7		Group VII Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
7.8		GROUP VII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

<b>Tab Sheet</b>	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b><u>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</u></b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b><u>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</u></b> <b><u>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</u></b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139	
	<b>Group VIII "All Or None" LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>						
	<b>8.1</b>	1	Bed, Full Size, Slat Boarder Panels, Sturdy Framework, Subtle Curved Detailling, 80L x 60W x 50H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #3560266P Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.2</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.3</b>	1	Dresser, W/Mirror, 9 Drawers, Including Felt-Lined Top Row, Rectangular Mirror Sits Atop Dresser, Linear Design, Highlighted By Slats On Top And Leaded Glass With A Beveled Edge, Dresser 55L x 18W x 34H, Mirror 39W x 40H, (Color Picture Required), Rooms To Go Mission Dresser Mirror Set #3400266P Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>8.4</b>		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	

Tab Sheet	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</b> <b>FURNITURE AND SHELVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139
		<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't          LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>				
8.5	1	Chest, 5- Generous Drawers, Llinear Design, 36L x 18W x 52H, <b>(Color Picture          Required)</b> , Rooms To Go #34202666 Or equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.6		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.7	2	Nightstand, Ample Surface To Accommodate A Lamp, Clock And Other Essentials, 2-Drawers, 24L x 17W x 25H, <b>(Color Picture Required)</b> , Rooms To Go Mission #34402660 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.8		Wood Color Choices	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
8.9	1	Mattress, Full, 75" x 53"W, Firm, Woven Damask Panel Cover, Chemical Free Natural Fir Barrier, A Layer Of Comfort Foam, Pillow Top, Support Pad, Verticoil Innerspring And A Shock Absorbing Pad, (Color Picture Required), Rooms To Go #50353401, Badcock Legends #103625 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

<b>Tab Sheet</b>	TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID # <b><u>SDOC-10-B-067-KB</u></b> PAGES GO DOWN THEN ACROSS DATE/TIME: <b><u>2/23/10 @ 2:00 PM</u></b> <b><u>FURNITURE AND SHELIVING FOR OSCEOLA HIGH SCHOOL</u></b> READ BY: <u>Kathy Brown</u> RECORDED BY: <u>Lisa Kesecker</u>		Schoolhouse Products, Inc. 13517 Prestige Place, Suite 101 Tampa, FL 33635	Total Business Assoc 118 Central Park Pl Sanford, FL 32771	Your Office, Inc. 6193 Rock Island Road #306 Tamarac, FL 33319	Virco Inc. Hwy 65 South Conway, AR 72032 Quote #54139	
	<b>Group VIII "All Or None" Con't LIFE LAB BEDROOM</b>						
	<b>8.10</b>	1	Foundation, Full, 75" x 53"W, Reinforced Padded Corners, Rigid Steel Grid, Quilted Border W/Plastic Corner Guards, <b>(Color          Picture Required)</b> , Badcock Legends #103621 Or Equal	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
	<b>8.11</b>		Group VIII Installation Charge	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
<b>8.12</b>		GROUP VIII GRAND TOTAL	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	