

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL <u>6/1/10</u></u> | | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|--|--|-------------|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing |
| 1 | 40 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 2-part, 20# Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 10.32 | 10.77 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 2 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 2-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 13.21 | 13.70 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 3 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 2-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 20.65 | 21.50 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|---|---|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 4 | 40 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 11.65 | 12.12 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |
| 5 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 14.93 | 15.42 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |
| 6 | 40 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 3-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 23.32 | 24.20 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |

| T a b S h e e t | | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|---------------|---|--------------|---|---|
| Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing | |
| 7 | 10 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 12.46 | 12.96 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 8 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 15.95 | 16.50 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 9 | 40 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 4-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 24.92 | 25.90 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|---|---|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 10 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 12.79 | 13.40 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |
| 11 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 14, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 16.37 | 17.08 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |
| 12 | 20 Cartons | Reverse precollated, 11 x 17, 5-part, 20#, Carbonless, Black print, Glatfelter, NCR or Imation Brand ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ /1,000 | 25.59 | 26.82 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | IMATION - NEKOOSA |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10 | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 | |
|--|---|---|---|--------------|---|------------------|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | | Unit Pricing |
| 13 | 1 Carton | Reverse precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 2-part Canary/White, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 26.42 | | 17.22 | Not As Specified |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 14 | 1 Carton | Straight precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 3-part, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 27.70 | | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | | | |
| 15 | 1 Carton | Straight precollated, 8-1/2 x 11, 4-part, Carbonless, NCR Xero/Form or Glatfelter Xcelerator ONLY, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 28.79 | | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | | | |

| T a b S h e e t | | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|-----------|---|--------------|---|---|
| Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing | |
| 16 | 2 Gallons | Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Glatfelter Brand, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ _____/Gallon | 58.80 | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | Glatfelter | | |
| 17 | 2 Gallons | Imation Brand, Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ _____/Gallon | NO BID | 76.50 | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | | IMATION - NEKOOSA | |
| 18 | 2 Gallons | NCR Brand, Offset Carbonless Adhesive, Gallon, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ _____/Gallon | NO BID | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | | | |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10 | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|---|--|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 19 | 1 Carton | First Choice ColorPrint, 8-1/2 x 11, 28#, White, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 16.71 | 31.85 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | AS | AS |
| 20 | 1 Carton | First Choice ColorPrint, 11 x 17, 28#, White, ONLY No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 32.09 | 31.85 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | AS | AS |
| 21 | 1 Carton | Digital Color Copy, 12 x 18. 28#, Photo White, Smooth, Hammermill, Or Equal Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000 | 42.78 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | HAMMERMILL | |

| T a b S h e e t | | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10 | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|----------|---|---|---|
| Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing |
| 22 | 1 Carton | French Parchtone Cover, 8 1/2 x 11, 65#, List all colors available: No Substitutions Price \$_____/1000 Colors Available | 52.49 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | PARCHTONE | |
| 23 | 1 Carton | Wausau Offset Opaque Text, 11x17, 60#, List all colors available, No Substitutions Price \$_____/1000 Colors Available | 23.27 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | WAUSAU EXACT | |
| 24 | 1 Box | Wausau Exact Offset Opaque Envelopes, #10 Regular, 60# Smooth, List all colors available, No Substitutions Price \$_____/1000 Colors Available | 24.22 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | WAUSAU EXACT | |

| T a b S h e e t | | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL <u>6/1/10</u></u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|----------|--|--------------|---|---|
| Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing | |
| 25 | 2 Reams | Wausau Astrobrights Cover, 8 1/2x11, 65#, list all colors available, No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1000 Colors Available | 39.46 | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ASTROBRIGHTS | | |
| 26 | 2 Reams | Wausau Astrobrights Text, 8 1/2x11, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1,000 Colors Available | 19.93 | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ASTROBRIGHTS | | |
| 27 | 1 Carton | Wausau Astrobrights Text, 11x17, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1,000 Colors Available | 39.87 | NO BID | |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ASTROBRIGHTS | | |

| T a b S h e e t | | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|----------|--|---------------|---|---|
| Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing | Unit Pricing | |
| 28 | 1 Carton | Wausau Exact Brights Text, 11 x 17, 60#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1,000 Colors Available List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | 35.79 | NO BID | |
| | | | EXACT BRIGHTS | | |
| 29 | 2 Reams | Wausau Exact Brights Cover, 8 1/2 x 11, 65#, List all colors available No Substitutions Price\$ _____/1,000 Colors Available List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | 35.42 | NO BID | |
| | | | EXACT BRIGHTS | | |
| 30 | 1 Carton | Sutton Bond, 8 1/2 x 11, 24# , Ultra Bright White, Light Cockle, No Substitutions Price \$ _____/1,000 List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | 23.13 | NO BID | |
| | | | SUTTON BOND | | |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|---|--|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 31 | 1 Carton | Sutton Bond, #10 Envelope, 24#, Ultra Bright White, Light Cockle, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 47.22 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | SUTTON BOND | |
| 32 | 1 Carton | Vellum or Smooth Offset, 11x17, 70#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000 | 21.00 | 18.90 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | HUSKEY | HUSKEY OFFSET SMOOTH |
| 33 | 1 Carton | Bond, 11x17, 20#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000 | 14.75 | 14.50 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | QUICK COPY | REPORT BOND |
| 34 | 1 Carton | Bond, 8 1/2 x 14, 20#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ ____/1,000 | 9.20 | 9.00 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | QUICK COPY | REPORT BOND |

| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL <u>6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|--|--|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 35 | 1 Carton | Bond, 8 1/2x11, 20#, Colors. Hammerhill Fore DP, Domtar Multipurpose, or Fascopy. List all colors available (please send color swatches if available) No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 7.95 Not As Specified | 8.34 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | EXACT | DOMTAR MULTI-PURPOSE |
| 36 | 1 Carton | Cougar Opaque Cover, 8 1/2x11, 65#, White, Smooth No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 26.74 | 26.00 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | COUGAR | AS |
| 37 | 1 Carton | Cougar Opaque Cover, 11 x 17, 65#, White, Smooth, No Substitutions Price \$ ____/1,000 | 60.29 | 52.60 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | COUGAR | AS |

| | | | | |
|--|---|---|---|---|
| T a b l e s h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# <u>SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK</u> PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: <u>5/11/10 @ 2:00PM</u> <u>PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES</u> READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker <u>PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 38 | 1 Carton | Cougar Opaque Cover, 12 x 18, 65# White Smooth, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/1,000 | 59.54 | 60.75 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ACCENT | AS |
| 39 | 1 Carton | Vellum Bristol Cover, 8 1/2x11, 67#, White, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/1,000 | 16.18 | 16.45 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | EXACT | DOMTAR VELLUM BRISTOL |
| 40 | 1 Carton | Vellum Bristol Cover, 8 1/2x11, 67#, Colors, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/1,000 | 17.11 | 17.45 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | EXACT | DOMTAR VELLUM BRISTOL |
| 41 | 5 Cartons | Envelopes, #10, White Wove or Smooth, Plain, 24# 500/Box, 5 Boxes/Carton Brand/Mfg. _____ Price \$ _____/1,000 | 14.10 | 13.10 |
| | | List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | MAC-MPEC | NATIONAL OR QUALITY PARK |

| T a b S h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL <u>6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|--|---|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 42 | 5 Cartons | Envelopes, #10, White Wove or Smooth, Window, 24# 500/Box, 5 Boxes/Carton Price \$ _____/1,000 | 16.46 | 15.75 |
| | | List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | MAC-MPEC | NATIONAL OR QUALITY PARK |
| 43 | 2 Boxes | Envelopes, A-2 70#, White Vellum Price \$ _____/1,000 | 29.85 | 26.85 |
| | | List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | WAVERLY HALL | IMPACT #800352 |
| 44 | 2 Boxes | Envelopes, A-6 70#, White Vellum Price \$ _____/1,000 | 33.17 | 31.50 |
| | | List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | WAVERLY HALL | IMPACT #800356 |
| 45 | 5 Packs | Primeline pressure sensitive offset (per hundred), 8 1/2x11, 60#, White, Substitutions Allowed, Price \$ _____/100 | 89.40 / 1000 | 9.15 / 100 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | STARBOARD TACK | IMPACT #600045 |
| 46 | 2 Bundles | Chipboard, 8 1/2x11, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ _____/Bundle | 32.28 | 24.95 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ALT PKG | AS |

| T a b S h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL <u>6/1/10</u> | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|--|---|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 47 | 2 Bundles | Chipboard, 8 1/2x14, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Bundle | 31.16 | 24.95 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ALT PKG | AS |
| 48 | 2 Bundles | Chipboard, 11x17, Plain Gray, (Per bundle), Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Bundle | 31.16 | 24.95 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | ALT PKG | AS |
| 49 | 2 Gallons | Regular Padding Adhesive, White, Gallon, Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Gallon | 22.73 | 18.10 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | HARA | ROGERSOL WHITE |
| 50 | 2 Spools | Spool, Round Stitcher Wire, #25, 5lb., Substitutions Allowed Price \$ /Spool | 28.86 | NO BID |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | TACO | |
| | | Specify the Minimum Order Qty for this item | 1 CARTON / 10 SPOOLS | |

| T a b S h e e t | TABULATION SHEET FOR: BID# SDOC-10-B-0xx-LK PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN DATE/TIME: 5/11/10 @ 2:00PM PRINT SHOP PAPER AND SUPPLIES READ BY: Kathy Brown RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker PENDING BOARD APPROVAL 6/1/10 | | Mac Papers, Inc. 3300 Phillips HWY Jacksonville, FL 32207 Phone #407-370-5595 Fax #407-352-7330 MINIMUM ORDER \$200.00 (MUST ORDER FULL CARTONS) | Redd Paper Company 3851 Cewnter Loop Orlando, FL 32808 Phone #407-299-6656 Fax #407-299-8142 |
|--|--|---|---|---|
| | Item # | Quantity | Description | Unit Pricing |
| 51 | 1 Box | Staples, SCCR25, 1/4" Price \$ /Box List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | NO BID | NO BID |
| 52 | 1 Box | Staples, SCCR25, 3/8" Price \$ /Box List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | NO BID | NO BID |
| 53 | 1 Box | Staples, SCCR25, 1/2" Price \$ /Box List Brand Name, Model # of the item bid. | NO BID | NO BID |
| 54 | 2 Rolls | ECF Centerfold Shrink Film, 14"x 3500', 75 gauge, Clear, Cryovac D940 or Bolphane BX-75GA Brand, No Substitutions Price \$ /Roll | NO BID | 120.45 |
| | | List "As Specified" (and indicate which specified product) or provide the Brand Name, Model # of the item bid if substitutions are allowed. | | #BX-75GA |
| 55 | | Can Other Entities piggy-back from this bid? Yes No | YES | YES |
| 56 | | Estimated delivery time after receipt of Purchase Order days | 1-20 DAYS | 2-4 DAYS |
| 57 | | List Company Name | MAC PAPERS INC | REDD PAPER COMPANY |
| | | Address | 7601 KINGSPORTE PARKWAY | 3851 CENTER LOOP |
| | | City, State, Zip | ORLANDO, FL 32819 | ORLANDO, FL 32808 |
| | | Contact Person | MARK PETERSON | JOHNNY REDD |
| | | Phone Number | 407-370-5594 | 407-299-6656 |
| | | Fax Number | 407-352-7330 | 407-299-8142 |
| | | Email Address | MARK.PETERSON@MACPAPERS.COM | JREDD@REDDPAPER.COM |