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Project Area 1 NO BID NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     4 NO BID 4 2 3 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced 4 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
3. Network Architect-Expert 4 NO BID 4 4 2 NO BID 2 4 1 4 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 2 NO BID 2 1 2 NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5
6. Network Engineer-Expert 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NO BID 3 3 1 3 5
7. Network Analyst-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 2 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 2 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert 2 NO BID 2 3 3 NO BID 2 2 1 2 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 5
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 5 2 4 5

13. Network Administrator-
Advanced 3 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5

14. Network Administrator-Expert 3 NO BID 3 2 4 NO BID 1 4 2 3 5
15. Network Technician-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 3 4 5
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 4

17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 3

18. Network Technician-Expert 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID 1 3 3 3 3
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

Project Area 1
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     
2. Network Architect-Advanced
3. Network Architect-Expert
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate
5. Network Engineer-Advanced
6. Network Engineer-Expert
7. Network Analyst-Entry
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate
9. Network Analyst-Advanced
10. Network Analyst-Expert
11. Network Administrator-Entry
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator-
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert
15. Network Technician-Entry
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced

18. Network Technician-Expert
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     
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Range - 
Low Add 20% Add 20% Add 20% Add 20%

Range - 
High Difference Divide by 5

NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
NO BID 2 70.00 89.00 108.00 127.00 146.00 165.00 95.00 19
NO BID 3 80.00 99.00 118.00 137.00 156.00 175.00 95.00 19
NO BID 4 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 125.00 65.00 13
NO BID 4 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 150.00 80.00 16
NO BID 4 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17
NO BID 5 47.00 61.60 76.20 90.80 105.40 120.00 73.00 14.6
NO BID 5 60.00 74.00 88.00 102.00 116.00 130.00 70.00 14
NO BID 5 70.00 84.00 98.00 112.00 126.00 140.00 70.00 14
NO BID 5 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2

NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11

NO BID 5 70.00 79.00 88.00 97.00 106.00 115.00 45.00 9

NO BID 5 80.00 90.00 100.00 110.00 120.00 130.00 50.00 10
NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4

NO BID 5 39.73 54.78 69.84 84.89 99.95 115.00 75.27 15.054

NO BID 5 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 75.00 15

NO BID 5 43.82 61.06 78.29 95.53 112.76 130.00 86.18 17.236

NO BID 5 65.59 83.47 101.35 119.24 137.12 155.00 89.41 17.882

Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $
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PRICING SCORE SHEET
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"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID 3 4 1 4 5

21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID 1 4 1 4 5

23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced 3 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5

24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID 1 4 3 4 5
26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 NO BID 1 2 1 NO BID NO BID 2 3 1 4
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NO BID 3 3 1 3 5

28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5

32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 4

33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 4

Page 3 of 24



PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced
21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry
22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced
24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert
25. Web Designer-Intermediate
26. Web Designer-Advanced
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance
28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry
29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert
32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry
33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 80.00 99.00 118.00 137.00 156.00 175.00 95.00 19

NO BID 5 50.00 67.00 84.00 101.00 118.00 135.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 60.00 77.00 94.00 111.00 128.00 145.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 70.00 87.00 104.00 121.00 138.00 155.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 45.00 62.00 79.00 96.00 113.00 130.00 85.00 17
NO BID 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 115.00 60.00 12

NO BID 5 65.00 92.00 119.00 146.00 173.00 200.00 135.00 27

NO BID 5 37.00 66.60 96.20 125.80 155.40 185.00 148.00 29.6

NO BID 5 45.00 78.00 111.00 144.00 177.00 210.00 165.00 33

NO BID 5 56.00 90.80 125.60 160.40 195.20 230.00 174.00 34.8

NO BID 5 65.00 99.00 133.00 167.00 201.00 235.00 170.00 34

NO BID 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 115.00 90.00 18

NO BID 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 115.00 81.00 16.2
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PRICING SCORE SHEET
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 4

35. Security Analyst-Entry 5 NO BID 5 2 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 5 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID 3 5 1 5 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert 5 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 4 NO BID 4 3 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID 1 4 1 3 5

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry 5 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID 2 4 1 4 5

44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced 3 NO BID 3 4 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 5

45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert 3 NO BID 3 4 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 4
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 2 1 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 4

48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 5

49. Systems Administrator-Expert 3 NO BID 3 2 5 NO BID 1 4 4 3 5
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID 2 5 1 5 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate
37. Security Analyst-Advanced
38. Security Analyst-Expert
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate
41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry
43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced
45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert
46. Systems Administrator-Entry
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 43.00 57.40 71.80 86.20 100.60 115.00 72.00 14.4

NO BID 5 47.00 67.60 88.20 108.80 129.40 150.00 103.00 20.6
NO BID 5 60.00 82.00 104.00 126.00 148.00 170.00 110.00 22
NO BID 5 68.57 94.66 120.74 146.83 172.91 199.00 130.43 26.086
NO BID 5 80.00 106.00 132.00 158.00 184.00 210.00 130.00 26
NO BID 5 35.00 57.00 79.00 101.00 123.00 145.00 110.00 22

NO BID 5 47.00 67.60 88.20 108.80 129.40 150.00 103.00 20.6

NO BID 5 55.00 75.00 95.00 115.00 135.00 155.00 100.00 20

NO BID 4 50.00 73.00 96.00 119.00 142.00 165.00 115.00 23

NO BID 4 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18

NO BID 4 70.00 87.00 104.00 121.00 138.00 155.00 85.00 17

NO BID 4 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304

NO BID 5 49.52 57.62 65.71 73.81 81.90 90.00 40.48 8.096

NO BID 5 68.00 74.40 80.80 87.20 93.60 100.00 32.00 6.4

NO BID 5 80.00 90.00 100.00 110.00 120.00 130.00 50.00 10

NO BID 4 63.00 84.40 105.80 127.20 148.60 170.00 107.00 21.4
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Total Vendor Scores 

181 NO BID 185 127 209 NO BID 26 192 69 184 239
Divide by 50 for Score

3.62 NO BID 3.70 2.54 4.18 NO BID 1.86 3.84 1.38 3.68 4.78
Project Area 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     4 NO BID 4 2 3 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced 4 NO BID 4 3 3 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
3. Network Architect-Expert 3 NO BID 4 3 2 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 2 NO BID 2 1 2 NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced 2 NO BID 3 2 2 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5
6. Network Engineer-Expert 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5
7. Network Analyst-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 2 3 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert 1 NO BID 2 3 3 NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 5
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 5 2 4 5

13. Network Administrator-
Advanced 3 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 2 3 5

14. Network Administrator-Expert 2 NO BID NO BID 1 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 2 5
15. Network Technician-Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 3 4 5
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 3 3 4

17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 3
18. Network Technician-Expert 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 3
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Total Vendor Scores 

Divide by 50 for Score

Project Area 2
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     
2. Network Architect-Advanced
3. Network Architect-Expert
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate
5. Network Engineer-Advanced
6. Network Engineer-Expert
7. Network Analyst-Entry
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate
9. Network Analyst-Advanced
10. Network Analyst-Expert
11. Network Administrator-Entry
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator-
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert
15. Network Technician-Entry
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced
18. Network Technician-Expert
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 235
       

NO BID 4.70
       

NO BID  
NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
NO BID 3 70.00 88.00 106.00 124.00 142.00 160.00 90.00 18
NO BID 2 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17
NO BID 4 60.00 72.00 84.00 96.00 108.00 120.00 60.00 12
NO BID 4 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 145.00 75.00 15
NO BID 4 80.00 96.00 112.00 128.00 144.00 160.00 80.00 16
NO BID 5 47.00 60.60 74.20 87.80 101.40 115.00 68.00 13.6
NO BID 5 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 125.00 65.00 13
NO BID 5 70.00 83.00 96.00 109.00 122.00 135.00 65.00 13
NO BID 5 80.00 93.00 106.00 119.00 132.00 145.00 65.00 13
NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2

NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11

NO BID 5 70.00 79.00 88.00 97.00 106.00 115.00 45.00 9

NO BID 5 80.00 87.00 94.00 101.00 108.00 115.00 35.00 7
NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4

NO BID 5 39.73 54.78 69.84 84.89 99.95 115.00 75.27 15.054

NO BID 5 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 75.00 15
NO BID 5 43.82 58.06 72.29 86.53 100.76 115.00 71.18 14.236
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced 4 NO BID 4 4 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5

21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry 5 NO BID 4 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID NO BID 4 1 3 5

23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert 3 NO BID 3 4 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 1 3 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 4
26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 NO BID 1 2 1 NO BID NO BID 1 3 1 5
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance 3 NO BID 3 3 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 4 5 5

29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 4 5

31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5

32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry 4 NO BID 4 1 4 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 4

33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 4
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate
20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced
21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry
22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced
24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert
25. Web Designer-Intermediate
26. Web Designer-Advanced
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance
28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry
29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert
32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry
33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 65.59 82.47 99.35 116.24 133.12 150.00 84.41 16.882

NO BID 5 80.00 98.00 116.00 134.00 152.00 170.00 90.00 18

NO BID 5 50.00 65.00 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 75.00 15

NO BID 5 60.00 75.00 90.00 105.00 120.00 135.00 75.00 15

NO BID 5 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 145.00 75.00 15

NO BID 5 80.00 96.00 112.00 128.00 144.00 160.00 80.00 16

NO BID 5 45.00 54.00 63.00 72.00 81.00 90.00 45.00 9
NO BID 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 115.00 60.00 12

NO BID 5 65.00 90.00 115.00 140.00 165.00 190.00 125.00 25

NO BID 5 37.00 64.60 92.20 119.80 147.40 175.00 138.00 27.6

NO BID 5 45.00 76.00 107.00 138.00 169.00 200.00 155.00 31

NO BID 5 56.00 89.80 123.60 157.40 191.20 225.00 169.00 33.8

NO BID 5 65.00 98.00 131.00 164.00 197.00 230.00 165.00 33

NO BID 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 115.00 90.00 18

NO BID 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 115.00 81.00 16.2
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced 4 NO BID 4 1 5 NO BID NO BID 4 2 3 3

35. Security Analyst-Entry 5 NO BID 5 2 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert 4 NO BID 5 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 4 NO BID 4 3 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 3 NO BID 4 3 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry 5 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5

43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate 4 NO BID 4 4 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 5

44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert 3 NO BID 3 3 4 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 5

46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 NO BID 3 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 2 3 4
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate 3 NO BID 2 1 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 4

48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NO BID NO BID 3 3 2 5

49. Systems Administrator-Expert 1 NO BID 1 1 5 NO BID NO BID 1 4 1 5
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance 5 NO BID 5 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate
37. Security Analyst-Advanced
38. Security Analyst-Expert
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry
43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced
45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert
46. Systems Administrator-Entry
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 43.00 57.40 71.80 86.20 100.60 115.00 72.00 14.4

NO BID 5 47.00 65.60 84.20 102.80 121.40 140.00 93.00 18.6
NO BID 5 60.00 80.00 100.00 120.00 140.00 160.00 100.00 20
NO BID 5 68.57 92.86 117.14 141.43 165.71 190.00 121.43 24.286
NO BID 5 80.00 104.00 128.00 152.00 176.00 200.00 120.00 24
NO BID 5 35.00 55.00 75.00 95.00 115.00 135.00 100.00 20

NO BID 5 47.00 65.60 84.20 102.80 121.40 140.00 93.00 18.6

NO BID 5 55.00 73.00 91.00 109.00 127.00 145.00 90.00 18

NO BID 4 50.00 71.00 92.00 113.00 134.00 155.00 105.00 21

NO BID 4 60.00 76.00 92.00 108.00 124.00 140.00 80.00 16

NO BID 4 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 130.00 145.00 75.00 15

NO BID 3 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 140.00 155.00 75.00 15

NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304

NO BID 5 49.92 57.94 65.95 73.97 81.98 90.00 40.08 8.016

NO BID 5 68.00 74.40 80.80 87.20 93.60 100.00 32.00 6.4

NO BID 5 80.00 86.00 92.00 98.00 104.00 110.00 30.00 6

NO BID 4 63.00 82.40 101.80 121.20 140.60 160.00 97.00 19.4
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Add Vendor Scores
170 NO BID 174 115 203 NO BID NO BID 184 74 175 238

Divide by 50
3.40 NO BID 3.55 2.30 4.06 NO BID NO BID 3.68 1.48 3.50 4.76

Project Area 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     NO BID NO BID 4 2 3 1 NO BID 4 2 4 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced NO BID NO BID 4 3 2 1 NO BID 4 1 4 5
3. Network Architect-Expert NO BID NO BID 4 3 1 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 2 NO BID 2 1 1 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 2 2 1 NO BID 2 1 2 5
6. Network Engineer-Expert NO BID NO BID 2 3 2 1 NO BID 2 1 2 5
7. Network Analyst-Entry NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 3 NO BID 4 1 3 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 4 1 3 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 1 3 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert NO BID NO BID 2 3 3 1 NO BID 3 2 2 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry NO BID NO BID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 4 3 4 5
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 5 3 4 5

13. Network Administrator-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 4 1 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 5

14. Network Administrator-Expert NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 4 1 NO BID 4 3 4 5
15. Network Technician-Entry NO BID NO BID 4 1 5 2 NO BID 4 3 4 5
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 4

17. Network Technician-Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 3
18. Network Technician-Expert NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 2 NO BID 3 3 3 3
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 2 4 1 NO BID 4 1 4 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Add Vendor Scores

Divide by 50

Project Area 3
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     
2. Network Architect-Advanced
3. Network Architect-Expert
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate
5. Network Engineer-Advanced
6. Network Engineer-Expert
7. Network Analyst-Entry
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate
9. Network Analyst-Advanced
10. Network Analyst-Expert
11. Network Administrator-Entry
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator-
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert
15. Network Technician-Entry
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced
18. Network Technician-Expert
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 234

NO BID 4.68        

NO BID        
NO BID 3 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
NO BID 3 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 150.00 80.00 16
NO BID 3 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
NO BID 4 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11
NO BID 4 70.00 82.00 94.00 106.00 118.00 130.00 60.00 12
NO BID 4 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
NO BID 5 47.00 60.60 74.20 87.80 101.40 115.00 68.00 13.6
NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11
NO BID 5 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 114.00 125.00 55.00 11
NO BID 5 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 140.00 155.00 75.00 15
NO BID 5 39.00 54.20 69.40 84.60 99.80 115.00 76.00 15.2

NO BID 5 60.00 71.00 82.00 93.00 104.00 115.00 55.00 11

NO BID 5 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 114.00 125.00 55.00 11

NO BID 5 80.00 94.00 108.00 122.00 136.00 150.00 70.00 14
NO BID 5 38.00 53.40 68.80 84.20 99.60 115.00 77.00 15.4

NO BID 5 39.73 54.78 69.84 84.89 99.95 115.00 75.27 15.054

NO BID 5 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 115.00 75.00 15
NO BID 5 43.82 58.06 72.29 86.53 100.76 115.00 71.18 14.236

NO BID 5 65.59 81.47 97.35 113.24 129.12 145.00 79.41 15.882
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

B
ra

nd
t I

nf
or

m
at

io
n 

S
er

vi
ce

s 
   

   
13

77
 C

ro
ss

 C
re

ek
 C

irc
le

   
   

   
   

Ta
lla

ha
ss

ee
, F

L 
32

30
1

B
us

in
es

s 
In

fo
 T

ec
hn

ol
og

y 
S

ol
ut

io
ns

 d
ba

  A
B

T 
S

ol
ut

io
ns

   
  

85
29

 S
. P

ar
k 

C
irc

le
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
81

9

C
ol

em
an

 T
ec

hn
ol

og
ie

s 
   

   
   

   
  

20
 N

. O
ra

ng
e 

A
ve

nu
e 

   
   

   
   

   
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

80
1

C
om

pu
te

r T
ec

hn
ol

og
y 

S
ol

ut
io

ns
   

   
  3

00
 R

iv
er

ch
as

e 
P

ar
kw

ay
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

B
irm

in
gh

am
, A

L 
35

24
4

E
nt

er
pr

is
e 

Te
ch

no
lo

gy
 P

ar
tn

er
s 

37
 N

. O
ra

ng
e 

A
ve

nu
e 

   
   

   
   

   
O

rla
nd

o,
 F

L 
32

80
1

E
S

Q
 IT

 S
ol

ut
io

ns
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
10

13
 M

on
ta

na
 S

tre
et

   
   

   
   

   
   

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
80

3

G
ib

so
n 

C
on

su
lti

ng
 G

ro
up

   
   

   
  

90
1 

S
. M

op
ac

 E
xp

re
ss

w
ay

,  
   

   
B

ld
g 

1,
 S

ui
te

 4
15

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

A
us

tin
, T

X
 7

87
46

In
fo

rm
at

io
n 

S
ys

te
m

s 
of

 F
L 

   
   

 
12

03
 G

ov
er

no
rs

 S
qu

ar
e 

B
lv

d.
   

 
Ta

lla
ha

ss
ee

, F
L 

32
30

1

M
P

S
 G

ro
up

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
1 

In
de

pe
nd

en
t D

riv
e 

   
   

 
Ja

ck
so

nv
ille

, F
L 

32
20

2

P
re

si
di

o 
C

or
p.

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
 

65
53

 G
ib

so
n 

D
riv

e 
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
80

9

Q
ua

nt
um

 C
om

pu
te

r S
ol

ut
io

ns
   

 
14

59
 E

ld
ra

 D
riv

e 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
K

is
si

m
m

ee
, F

L 
34

74
4

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 4 3 4 1 NO BID 4 4 4 5

21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry NO BID NO BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 5 1 5 5

22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 3 3 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5

23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 4 4 4 1 NO BID 4 1 3 5

24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert NO BID NO BID 4 4 4 1 NO BID 4 2 3 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 1 NO BID 4 3 3 4
26. Web Designer-Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 3 3 1 NO BID 3 5 2 5
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance NO BID NO BID 3 3 3 2 NO BID 3 1 3 5

28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry NO BID NO BID 5 2 5 2 NO BID 5 1 5 5

29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 5 1 4 5

30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 5 4 5 3 NO BID 5 1 4 5

31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert NO BID NO BID 4 4 5 3 NO BID 4 1 4 5

32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry NO BID NO BID 4 1 4 2 NO BID 4 3 4 4

33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 1 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 4

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 4 2 5 1 NO BID 4 3 4 4
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced
21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry
22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced
24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert
25. Web Designer-Intermediate
26. Web Designer-Advanced
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance
28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry
29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert
32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry
33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate
34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 80.00 97.00 114.00 131.00 148.00 165.00 85.00 17

NO BID 5 50.00 63.00 76.00 89.00 102.00 115.00 65.00 13

NO BID 5 60.00 73.00 86.00 99.00 112.00 125.00 65.00 13

NO BID 5 70.00 86.00 102.00 118.00 134.00 150.00 80.00 16

NO BID 5 80.00 101.00 122.00 143.00 164.00 185.00 105.00 21

NO BID 5 45.00 56.00 67.00 78.00 89.00 100.00 55.00 11
NO BID 5 55.00 74.00 93.00 112.00 131.00 150.00 95.00 19

NO BID 5 65.00 88.00 111.00 134.00 157.00 180.00 115.00 23

NO BID 5 37.00 62.60 88.20 113.80 139.40 165.00 128.00 25.6

NO BID 5 45.00 74.00 103.00 132.00 161.00 190.00 145.00 29

NO BID 5 56.00 88.80 121.60 154.40 187.20 220.00 164.00 32.8

NO BID 5 65.00 97.00 129.00 161.00 193.00 225.00 160.00 32

NO BID 5 25.00 43.00 61.00 79.00 97.00 115.00 90.00 18

NO BID 5 34.00 50.20 66.40 82.60 98.80 115.00 81.00 16.2

NO BID 5 43.00 61.40 79.80 98.20 116.60 135.00 92.00 18.4
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

35. Security Analyst-Entry NO BID NO BID 5 1 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate NO BID NO BID 5 2 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced NO BID NO BID 5 3 5 3 NO BID 5 1 4 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert NO BID NO BID 5 4 5 2 NO BID 5 1 4 5
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry NO BID NO BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 4 1 3 5
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry NO BID NO BID 4 4 5 3 NO BID 5 1 5 5

43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 4 3 5 2 NO BID 4 1 4 5

44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 3 3 4 1 NO BID 3 1 3 5

45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert NO BID NO BID 3 3 4 2 NO BID 3 1 3 5

46. Systems Administrator-Entry NO BID NO BID 3 1 4 1 NO BID 3 2 3 4
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate NO BID NO BID 3 1 5 1 NO BID 3 3 3 4

48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced NO BID NO BID 2 1 5 1 NO BID 3 3 2 5

49. Systems Administrator-Expert NO BID NO BID 2 1 5 1 NO BID 3 5 2 5
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance NO BID NO BID 5 3 5 1 NO BID 5 1 5 5

Total Vendor Scores NO BID NO BID 177 112 205 81 NO BID 188 93 172 239
Divide by 50

NO BID NO BID 3.61 2.24 4.10 1.62 NO BID 3.76 1.86 3.44 4.78
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

35. Security Analyst-Entry
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate
37. Security Analyst-Advanced
38. Security Analyst-Expert
39. Groupware Specialist-Entry
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry
43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced
45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert
46. Systems Administrator-Entry
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance
Total Vendor Scores 
Divide by 50
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

NO BID 5 47.00 63.60 80.20 96.80 113.40 130.00 83.00 16.6
NO BID 5 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18
NO BID 5 68.57 90.86 113.14 135.43 157.71 180.00 111.43 22.286
NO BID 5 80.00 102.00 124.00 146.00 168.00 190.00 110.00 22
NO BID 5 35.00 53.00 71.00 89.00 107.00 125.00 90.00 18

NO BID 5 47.00 63.60 80.20 96.80 113.40 130.00 83.00 16.6

NO BID 5 55.00 71.00 87.00 103.00 119.00 135.00 80.00 16

NO BID 4 50.00 69.00 88.00 107.00 126.00 145.00 95.00 19

NO BID 4 60.00 74.00 88.00 102.00 116.00 130.00 70.00 14

NO BID 3 70.00 83.00 96.00 109.00 122.00 135.00 65.00 13

NO BID 3 80.00 93.00 106.00 119.00 132.00 145.00 65.00 13

NO BID 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304

NO BID 5 49.52 58.62 67.71 76.81 85.90 95.00 45.48 9.096

NO BID 5 68.00 75.40 82.80 90.20 97.60 105.00 37.00 7.4

NO BID 5 80.00 87.00 94.00 101.00 108.00 115.00 35.00 7

NO BID 5 63.00 80.40 97.80 115.20 132.60 150.00 87.00 17.4

NO BID 235

NO BID 4.70        
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Project Area 4  NO BID NO BID NO BID
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     2 NO BID NO BID 1 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
2. Network Architect-Advanced 3 NO BID NO BID 3 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
3. Network Architect-Expert 2 NO BID NO BID 4 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate 1 NO BID NO BID 1 2 3 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 5
5. Network Engineer-Advanced 1 NO BID NO BID 2 1 2 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
6. Network Engineer-Expert 1 NO BID NO BID 3 1 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
7. Network Analyst-Entry 3 NO BID NO BID 1 4 4 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate 2 NO BID NO BID 1 4 3 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
9. Network Analyst-Advanced 1 NO BID NO BID 1 1 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
10. Network Analyst-Expert 1 NO BID NO BID 3 2 1 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 5
11. Network Administrator-Entry 3 5 NO BID 1 5 3 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 4
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 1 5 3 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 5

13. Network Administrator-
Advanced 2 2 NO BID 1 4 1 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 4

14. Network Administrator-Expert 2 2 NO BID 2 3 1 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 4
15. Network Technician-Entry 3 5 NO BID 1 5 3 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 4
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 1 4 2 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 4

17. Network Technician-Advanced 3 3 NO BID 1 3 2 NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 3
18. Network Technician-Expert 2 2 NO BID 1 3 2 NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 2
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 2 3 2 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 4

20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced 3 3 NO BID 3 3 1 NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 4

21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry 4 4 NO BID 2 5 NO BID NO BID 4 1 NO BID 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

Project Area 4
1. Network Architect-Intermediate     
2. Network Architect-Advanced
3. Network Architect-Expert
4. Network Engineer-Intermediate
5. Network Engineer-Advanced
6. Network Engineer-Expert
7. Network Analyst-Entry
8. Network Analyst-Intermediate
9. Network Analyst-Advanced
10. Network Analyst-Expert
11. Network Administrator-Entry
12. Network Administrator-
Intermediate
13. Network Administrator-
Advanced
14. Network Administrator-Expert
15. Network Technician-Entry
16. Network Technician-
Intermediate
17. Network Technician-Advanced
18. Network Technician-Expert
19. Network Security Specialist-
Intermediate
20. Network Security Specialist-
Advanced
21. Web Applications Programmer-
Entry
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

       
5 1 55.00 65.00 75.00 85.00 95.00 105.00 50.00 10
5 1 65.00 77.00 89.00 101.00 113.00 125.00 60.00 12
5 1 80.00 91.00 102.00 113.00 124.00 135.00 55.00 11
5 3 50.00 61.40 72.80 84.20 95.60 107.00 57.00 11.4
5 3 60.00 71.20 82.40 93.60 104.80 116.00 56.00 11.2
5 3 75.00 85.20 95.40 105.60 115.80 126.00 51.00 10.2
5 5 47.00 57.60 68.20 78.80 89.40 100.00 53.00 10.6
5 5 53.50 63.00 72.50 82.00 91.50 101.00 47.50 9.5
5 5 62.50 70.60 78.70 86.80 94.90 103.00 40.50 8.1
5 4 70.00 82.40 94.80 107.20 119.60 132.00 62.00 12.4
5 5 35.00 48.00 61.00 74.00 87.00 100.00 65.00 13

5 5 52.50 62.00 71.50 81.00 90.50 100.00 47.50 9.5

5 4 60.00 68.00 76.00 84.00 92.00 100.00 40.00 8

5 4 65.00 76.00 87.00 98.00 109.00 120.00 55.00 11
5 5 35.00 48.00 61.00 74.00 87.00 100.00 65.00 13

5 5 39.73 51.78 63.84 75.89 87.95 100.00 60.27 12.054

5 5 40.00 52.00 64.00 76.00 88.00 100.00 60.00 12
5 5 43.82 55.06 66.29 77.53 88.76 100.00 56.18 11.236

5 5 53.00 67.40 81.80 96.20 110.60 125.00 72.00 14.4

5 4 63.00 77.40 91.80 106.20 120.60 135.00 72.00 14.4

5 5 47.00 56.60 66.20 75.80 85.40 95.00 48.00 9.6
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate 2 2 NO BID 2 3 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 5

23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced 1 2 NO BID 2 3 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 5

24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert 1 1 NO BID 3 3 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 5

25. Web Designer-Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 1 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 4 NO BID 4
26. Web Designer-Advanced 1 2 NO BID 2 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5 NO BID 4
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance 1 1 NO BID 2 2 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 4

28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry 5 NO BID NO BID 3 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5

29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate 4 NO BID NO BID 3 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 4

30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced 4 NO BID NO BID 4 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5

31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert 3 NO BID NO BID 4 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5

32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry 4 NO BID NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3 NO BID 4

33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate 4 NO BID NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 4

34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced 3 NO BID NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 2 NO BID 3

35. Security Analyst-Entry 4 NO BID NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate 4 NO BID NO BID 2 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
37. Security Analyst-Advanced 3 NO BID NO BID 3 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
38. Security Analyst-Expert 3 NO BID NO BID 3 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 5
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

22. Web Applications Programmer-
Intermediate
23. Web Applications Programmer-
Advanced
24. Web Applications Programmer-
Expert
25. Web Designer-Intermediate
26. Web Designer-Advanced
27. Web Security Specialist-No 
Variance
28. Telecommunication Engineer-
Entry
29. Telecommunication Engineer-
Intermediate
30. Telecommunication Engineer-
Advanced
31. Telecommunication Engineer-
Expert
32. Telecommunication Technician-
Entry
33. Telecommunication Technician-
Intermediate
34. Telecommunication Technician-
Advanced
35. Security Analyst-Entry
36. Security Analyst-Intermediate
37. Security Analyst-Advanced
38. Security Analyst-Expert
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

5 5 60.00 69.00 78.00 87.00 96.00 105.00 45.00 9

5 4 68.50 77.80 87.10 96.40 105.70 115.00 46.50 9.3

5 4 75.00 87.00 99.00 111.00 123.00 135.00 60.00 12

5 5 45.00 54.00 63.00 72.00 81.00 90.00 45.00 9
5 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 115.00 60.00 12

5 5 60.00 78.00 96.00 114.00 132.00 150.00 90.00 18

5 5 28.00 52.40 76.80 101.20 125.60 150.00 122.00 24.4

5 5 33.00 59.40 85.80 112.20 138.60 165.00 132.00 26.4

5 5 47.00 75.60 104.20 132.80 161.40 190.00 143.00 28.6

5 5 55.00 83.00 111.00 139.00 167.00 195.00 140.00 28

5 5 25.00 40.00 55.00 70.00 85.00 100.00 75.00 15

5 5 34.00 47.20 60.40 73.60 86.80 100.00 66.00 13.2

5 5 43.00 54.40 65.80 77.20 88.60 100.00 57.00 11.4

5 5 42.00 55.60 69.20 82.80 96.40 110.00 68.00 13.6
5 5 52.50 68.00 83.50 99.00 114.50 130.00 77.50 15.5
5 5 58.00 74.40 90.80 107.20 123.60 140.00 82.00 16.4
5 5 65.00 82.00 99.00 116.00 133.00 150.00 85.00 17
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

39. Groupware Specialist-Entry 2 NO BID NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 NO BID 4
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate 2 NO BID NO BID 2 4 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 4

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced 2 NO BID NO BID 2 4 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 4

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry 4 4 NO BID 3 5 NO BID NO BID 5 1 NO BID 5

43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate 3 3 NO BID 2 5 NO BID NO BID 3 1 NO BID 5

44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced 1 1 NO BID 2 4 NO BID NO BID 2 1 NO BID 5

45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert 1 1 NO BID 2 4 NO BID NO BID 1 1 NO BID 5

46. Systems Administrator-Entry 3 4 NO BID 1 4 NO BID NO BID 3 3 NO BID 4
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate 3 2 NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID 3 3 NO BID 4

48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced 1 1 NO BID 1 5 NO BID NO BID 2 4 NO BID 5

49. Systems Administrator-Expert 1 1 NO BID 1 4 NO BID NO BID 2 4 NO BID 4
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance 4 3 NO BID 2 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID 1 NO BID 4

Total All Vendor Scores 125 66 NO BID 94 184 35 NO BID 40 86 NO BID 223

Divide by 50 2.50 2.54 NO BID 1.88 3.68 2.06 NO BID 2.50 1.72 NO BID 4.46
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PRICING SCORE SHEET

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
RFP# SDOC-06-103-LK                     
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 728/06@10:00AM         
"IT" CONSULTING SERVICES
READ BY:   Laura Elam                  
RECORDED BY:  Lisa Kesecker     

39. Groupware Specialist-Entry
40. Groupware Specialist-
Intermediate

41. Groupware Specialist-Advanced

42. Systems Software Programmer-
Entry
43. Systems Software Programmer-
Intermediate
44. Systems Software Programmer-
Advanced
45. Systems Software Programmer-
Expert
46. Systems Administrator-Entry
47. Systems Administrator-
Intermediate
48. Systems Administrator-
Advanced
49. Systems Administrator-Expert
50. Systems Security Specialist-No 
Variance

Total All Vendor Scores

Divide by 50
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Scores are as follows:                                                          
If the Price is ≥ to the Lowest Price - But < then the 2nd column of prices = 5 points           

If the Price is ≥ to the 2nd column of prices - But < then the 3rd column of prices = 4 points     
If the Price is ≥ to the 3rd column of prices - But < then the 4th column of prices = 3 points      
If the Price is ≥ to the 4th column of prices - But < then the 5th column of prices = 2 points      

If the Price is ≥ to the 5th column of prices - But ≤ to the 6th column of prices = 1 point 

5 Points 
Lowest $

4 Points 3 Points 2 Points 1 Point 
Highest $

4 5 35.00 47.00 59.00 71.00 83.00 95.00 60.00 12

5 5 47.00 58.60 70.20 81.80 93.40 105.00 58.00 11.6

5 5 55.00 67.00 79.00 91.00 103.00 115.00 60.00 12

5 4 50.00 65.00 80.00 95.00 110.00 125.00 75.00 15

5 3 60.00 69.00 78.00 87.00 96.00 105.00 45.00 9

5 2 65.00 75.00 85.00 95.00 105.00 115.00 50.00 10

5 2 70.00 81.00 92.00 103.00 114.00 125.00 55.00 11

4 5 38.48 47.78 57.09 66.39 75.70 85.00 46.52 9.304

5 5 49.52 57.62 65.71 73.81 81.90 90.00 40.48 8.096

5 5 63.00 70.40 77.80 85.20 92.60 100.00 37.00 7.4

5 4 68.00 76.40 84.80 93.20 101.60 110.00 42.00 8.4

5 4 58.00 72.40 86.80 101.20 115.60 130.00 72.00 14.4

248 215

4.96 4.30
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