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Bid Signed - Non Collusion Form Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Drug Free Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Debarment Certification Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
References, in accordance with Section 
2.10, Definition of Responsive and 
Responsible

Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes No Yes

Manufacturer's Certificate of Warranty No No No No Yes No
Letter from Manufacturer stating that you 
are an authorized Distributor No Yes Yes No Yes No Yes

PRICE SHEET

LOT 1
1.  77" Rack with / Vented Rear Door Model 
# ERK-4420-LRD & ERK-VRD-44           
Estimated Qty. 4                                             
Unit Cost $__________                                  
Total Cost $__________

410.00 549.00 No Bid 382.64 443.25 480.00 429.25

2.  3.5" Shelf                                                   
Model # U2                                                     
Estimated Qty. 20                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________                                  

24.25 35.00 45.14 30.72 28.65 38.50 31.85

3.  1.75" Perforated Panel (1 rack unit) 
Model # VT1                                                   
Estimated Qty. 20                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

7.90 8.00 24.03 7.54 7.05 14.20 7.55

4.  3.5" Perforated Panel (2 rack units) 
Model # VT2                                                   
Estimated Qty. 20                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

9.55 10.00 25.56 8.80 8.50 19.12 9.10

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

Page 1 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

5.  3.5" Blank Panel                                  
Model # EB2                                                   
Estimated Qty. 20                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

6.90 7.00 17.58 6.11 5.95 11.50 6.30

6.  AC Strip                                            
Model # PD-615C                                           
Estimated Qty. 9                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

66.15 74.00 76.80 66.12 64.00 129.00 68.50

7.  Fan Panel Assembly w/guards       Model 
# ERK-4FT                                                     
Estimated Qty. 4                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

21.95 24.00 32.81 20.89 20.25 42.80 21.66

7a.  Fans for Fan Panel Assembly         
Model # FANS                                                
Estimated Qty. 12                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

30.00 35.00 40.99 29.49 28.55 49.95 29.54

7b.  Guards for Fan Panel Assembly         
Model # GUARDS                                          
Estimated Qty. 12                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

3.95 4.00 10.02 3.31 3.25 11.51 3.44

Total for Lot 1 for Quantity of One  $ ____ 580.65 746.00 555.62 609.45 796.58 607.19

8. Total for LOT 1  $__________           3702.55 4626.00 Incomplete 3666.20 3814.60 5656.12 3,870.62

LOT 2

Page 2 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

9.  Amplifier                                              
Model # BIDA-550-30                                     
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

275.00 No Bid 290.14 90.58 259.95 466.20 261.08

10. 16 Channel Combier                       
Model #  OC                                                   
Estimated Qty. 10                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

265.00 No Bid 285.87 305.84 256.82 419.80 257.93

11.  806 Agile Demodulator                      
Model # ZDM                                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

160.00 No Bid 171.54 182.64 153.38 333.20 154.04

12.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-2                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

13.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-3                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

14.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-4                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

Page 3 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

15.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-5                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

16.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-6                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

17.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-7                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

18.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-T7                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

19.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-8                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

20.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-9                                    
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

Page 4 of 10



A
ni

xt
er

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
75

50
 B

ro
ke

ra
ge

 D
r. 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
80

9

B
 &

 H
 P

H
O

TO
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

34
9 

W
 3

3r
d 

S
T 

FL
R

 G
R

   
   

   
   

   
 

N
ew

 Y
or

k,
 N

Y
 1

00
01

-2
70

2

B
E

S
 In

du
st

rie
s 

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

11
51

2 
La

ke
 M

ea
d 

A
ve

nu
e 

   
   

   
   

Ja
ck

so
nv

ille
, F

L 
32

25
6

C
S

C
-C

om
m

un
ic

at
io

n 
S

up
pl

y 
C

or
p.

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

 5
05

1 
L.

B
. 

M
cL

eo
d 

R
oa

d 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
  

O
rla

nd
o,

 F
L 

32
81

1 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
C

on
ta

ct
 P

er
so

n 
- O

m
ar

 C
un

a 
   

   
 

P
ho

ne
 #

 4
07

-2
92

-4
02

7 
   

   
   

   
   

  
Fa

x 
# 

40
7-

29
2-

41
90

M
ul

tic
om

 In
c.

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

10
76

 F
lo

rid
a 

C
en

tra
l P

ar
kw

ay
   

   
 

Lo
ng

w
oo

d,
 F

L 
32

75
0 

   
   

   
   

   
  

C
on

ta
ct

 P
rs

on
 - 

P
au

l G
ou

ld
in

g 
   

  
P

ho
ne

 #
 4

07
-3

31
-7

77
9 

   
   

   
   

   
  

Fa
x 

# 
40

7-
33

9-
02

04

S
ou

nd
 S

ta
ge

 S
ys

te
m

s 
   

   
   

   
   

   
35

8 
S

ac
ke

tt 
P

oi
nt

 R
oa

d 
   

   
   

   
   

 
N

or
th

 H
ea

ve
n,

 C
T 

06
47

3

To
ne

r C
ab

le
 E

qu
ip

m
en

t, 
In

c.
   

   
   

96
9 

H
or

sh
am

 R
oa

d 
   

   
   

   
   

   
   

  
H

or
sh

am
, P

A
 1

90
44

TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

21.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-10                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

22.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-11                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

23.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-12                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

24.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-13                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

25.  Modulator                                        
Model # MAVM-861-14                                  
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

400.00 No Bid 402.06 452.30 379.83 679.00 381.47

26.  Diplex Splitter                                   
Model # DSV #4375                                       
Estimated Qty.2                                              
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

29.65 No Bid 38.45 33.70 28.30 63.14 28.43

Page 5 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

27.  Coaxial Splitter                             Model 
# SXRS-2                                                       
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

1.25 No Bid 9.14 1.24 1.03 42.11 1.04

28.  Coaxial Splitter                                
Model # SXRS-4                                            
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.25 No Bid 10.20 2.25 1.88 92.56 1.89

29.  Coaxial Splitter                              
Model # SXRS-8                                            
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

3.15 No Bid 10.45 3.22 2.70 159.00 2.72

30. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-8)                              
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

31. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-11)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

32. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-14)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

33. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-17)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

34. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-20)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

35. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-23)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

36. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-26)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

37. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-29)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

38. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-32)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

Page 7 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

39. Directional Coupler                         
Model # SRT-4A (1944-35)                            
Estimated Qty. 5                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

2.55 No Bid 10.10 2.80 2.35 7.00 2.36

40.  To Channel 7 Heterodyne Processor  
Model # AP-60-550B with Option 17              
Estimated Qty. 2                                             
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

875.00 No Bid 878.00 993.41 834.22 1182.60 837.82

Total for Lot 2 for Quantity of One  $ ____ 7236.80 7423.63 Item 9 - Incorrect 6879.40 12334.61 6,909.13

41.  Total for LOT 2 $________ 17495.10 No Bid 18422.52 18748.62 16663.71 29636.22 15,209.86

LOT 3
42.  Female "F" to Male RCA Adaptors    
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 50                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

1.30   **  65.00 No Bid 2.99 0.75  **  37.50 0.23  **  11.50 1.89  **  94.50 No Bid

43.  Female "F" to Male BNC Adaptors   
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 50                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

1.85  **  92.50 No Bid 2.00 0.95  **  47.50 0.35  **  17.50 2.99  ** 149.50 No Bid

44.  Female RCA to Male "F" Adaptors 
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 50                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

0.00 No Bid 2.00 0.48  **  24.00 0.22  **  11.00 2.49  **  124.50 No Bid

Page 8 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

45.  Female RCA to Male BNC Adaptors 
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 50                                           
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

0.00 No Bid 2.00 0.92  **  46.00 0.32  **  16.00 2.15  **  107.50 No Bid

46.  RG59 Screw On Connectors       
Mfg/Part # Allen Tel # GBNC60                     
Estimated Qty. 200                                         
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

0.00 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 0.60  **  120.00 No Bid

46a.  RG59  Screw On Connectors  
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 200                                         
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

1.30  **  260.00 No Bid No Bid 0.88  **  176.00 0.66  **  132.00 0.60  **  120.00 No Bid

47.  RG59 Coaxial Cable                   
Mfg/Part # Belden #543945                           
Estimated Qty. 2000'                                      
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

0.14  **  280.00 No Bid No Bid 131.05  **  262.10 175.00  **  350.00 2780.00 No Bid

47a.  RG59 Coaxial Cable                   
Mfg/Part #                                                       
Estimated Qty. 2000'                                      
Unit Cost $_________                                    
Total Cost $_________       

0.00 No Bid 427.12 N/A No Bid 400.00 No Bid

48.  Snap-N-Seal RG6 "F" Connectors          
Mfg/Part # Thomas & Betts #SNS6               
Estimated Qty. 200                                         
Unit Cost $__________                                  
Total Cost $__________ 

0.42  **  84.00 No Bid No Bid 0.43  **  86.00 0.30  **  60.00 1.12  **  224.00 No Bid

Page 9 of 10
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TABULATION SHEET FOR:
BID # SDOC-08-B-081 LK
PAGES GO ACROSS THEN DOWN
DATE/TIME: 3/19/2008 @ 2:00 P.M .
CATV DISTRIBUTION  SYSTEM 
COMPONENTS
READ BY: Laura Elam              
RECORDED BY: Lisa Kesecker  

48a.  Snap-N-Seal RG6 "F" Connectors        
MFG/Part #                                                     
Estimated Qty. 200                                         
Unit Cost $__________                                  
Total Cost $__________

0.00 No Bid No Bid N/A No Bid 1.12  **  224.00 No Bid

49. Total for LOT 3 $__________ 781.50 No Bid Incomplete 679.10 598.00 4344.00 No Bid
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